
C, Claudia – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 13:38:18
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Claudia C
Sent 29/05/2019 1:38:18 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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___________________________
This email was sent by Claudia C via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact you
regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we have
set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************, however
Claudia provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-TO
field.

Please reply to Claudia C at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html

Page 3 of 1136



C, E – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 21:06:26
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From E C
Sent 29/05/2019 9:06:26 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
E C
Reservoir, Victoria, 3073, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by E C via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact you
regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we have
set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************, however
E provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to E C at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cabala, Richard – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 21:20:54
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Richard Cabala
Sent 23/05/2019 9:20:54 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Richard Cabala

___________________________
This email was sent by Richard Cabala via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Richard provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Richard Cabala at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cabban, Sharon – Monday, 27 May 2019 – 13:29:02
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Sharon Cabban
Sent 27/05/2019 1:29:02 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf

Page 11 of 1136



Yours sincerely,
Sharon Cabban
Currumbin Waters, Queensland, 4223, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Sharon Cabban via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Sharon provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Sharon Cabban at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cabello, Victor – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 20:01:19
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Victor Cabello
Sent 29/05/2019 8:01:19 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Victor Cabello
Glenfield, New South Wales, 2167, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Victor Cabello via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Victor provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Victor Cabello at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Caddell, Jemma – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 19:19:00
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Jemma Caddell
Sent 24/05/2019 7:19:00 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Jemma Caddell
Narre Warren South, Victoria, 3805, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Jemma Caddell via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Jemma provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Jemma Caddell at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Caddy, Gabrielle – Monday, 27 May 2019 – 10:16:48
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Gabrielle Caddy
Sent 27/05/2019 10:16:48 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Gabrielle Caddy
Molonglo, Australian Capital Territory, 2611, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Gabrielle Caddy via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Gabrielle provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Gabrielle Caddy at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cadwallen, Angela – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 10:57:21
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Angela Cadwallen
Sent 29/05/2019 10:57:21 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Angela Cadwallen
Cambridge Gardens, New South Wales, 2747, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Angela Cadwallen via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Angela provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Angela Cadwallen at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Caelli, Kate – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 06:52:10
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Kate Caelli
Sent 30/05/2019 6:52:10 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Kate Caelli
Woodend, Victoria, 3442, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Kate Caelli via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Kate provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Kate Caelli at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cafe, Carolyn – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 07:10:10
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Carolyn Cafe
Sent 29/05/2019 7:10:10 AM

I’m opposed to the development of a gas fracking project in the Northern Territory. This
industry would leave a toxic nightmare in its wake

Carolyn Cafe
*************
NSW 2579
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Caffel, Robyn – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 19:10:38
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Robyn Caffel
Sent 23/05/2019 7:10:38 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Robyn Caffel

___________________________
This email was sent by Robyn Caffel via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Robyn provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Robyn Caffel at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cahill, Felicity – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 20:18:38
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Felicity Cahill
Sent 23/05/2019 8:18:38 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Felicity Cahill
Drake, New South Wales, 2469, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Felicity Cahill via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Felicity provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Felicity Cahill at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cahill, Felicity – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 11:39:31
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Felicity Cahill
Sent 24/05/2019 11:39:31 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.
These chemicals are toxic to the people using them, as well as to the environment.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts. It is an absolute disaster
waiting (certain) to happen.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable. Full planning of getting rid of the massive
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amounts of toxic waste must be planned before passing these plans, or best scenario, the
whole thing denied.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS

This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Felicity Cahill
New South Wales, 2469, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Felicity Cahill via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Felicity provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Felicity Cahill at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cain, Julia – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 09:35:40
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Julia Cain
Sent 25/05/2019 9:35:40 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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___________________________
This email was sent by Julia Cain via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact you
regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we have
set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************, however
Julia provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Julia Cain at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cairnduff, Sallie – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 10:43:59
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Sallie Cairnduff
Sent 25/05/2019 10:43:59 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

Prior to moving to Sydney, I lived in the Northern Territory for a number of years, where I
worked for NT Health and the Cooperative Research Centre for Aboriginal Health (as it was
then known). I now am very committed to Aboriginal self determination, as I believe this is
the best way for Aboriginal people to improve their health and wellbeing. For too long, we
have not properly consulted Aboriginal people, or listened to their responses, or actually acted
on their requests. You are in a unique opportunity to actually do something positive for
Aboriginal and non Aboriginal people's relationship in Australia - actually listen and act. On
top of that, you'll be protecting the future for my son, my nephews and my niece, and all of
our children. It's up to you, to do the moral thing, not just the easy thing.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the Australian community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated
with Origin Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I
strongly object to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.
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3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.

4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants
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[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf

Yours sincerely,
Sallie Cairnduff
Marrickville, New South Wales, 2204, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Sallie Cairnduff via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Sallie provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Sallie Cairnduff at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cairns, Alice – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 21:06:56
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Alice Cairns
Sent 23/05/2019 9:06:56 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Alice Cairns
Kingswood, New South Wales, 2747, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Alice Cairns via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Alice provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Alice Cairns at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Calder, Lisa – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 19:33:26
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Lisa Calder
Sent 25/05/2019 7:33:26 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Lisa Calder

___________________________
This email was sent by Lisa Calder via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Lisa provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Lisa Calder at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Caldicott, Flynn – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 15:40:33
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Flynn Caldicott
Sent 25/05/2019 3:40:33 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Flynn Caldicott
Hove, South Australia, 5048, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Flynn Caldicott via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Flynn provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Flynn Caldicott at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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CALDWELL, BELINDA – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 11:07:05
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From BELINDA CALDWELL
Sent 29/05/2019 11:07:05 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
BELINDA CALDWELL
Malabar, New South Wales, 2036, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by BELINDA CALDWELL via Do Gooder, a website that allows people
to contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however BELINDA provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to BELINDA CALDWELL at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Caldwell, Helen – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 15:35:41
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Helen Caldwell
Sent 29/05/2019 3:35:41 PM

Write your submission here - use our talking points to guide your submission.

helen Caldwell
*************
NSW 2533

Page 54 of 1136



Caldwell, Jutta – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 13:04:39
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Jutta Caldwell
Sent 24/05/2019 1:04:39 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf

Page 56 of 1136



Yours sincerely,
Jutta Caldwell
Coffs Harbour, New South Wales, 2450, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Jutta Caldwell via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Jutta provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Jutta Caldwell at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Caldwell, Sheila – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 22:11:57
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Sheila Caldwell
Sent 28/05/2019 10:11:57 PM

Write your submission here - use our talking points to the left to guide your submission.

Sheila Caldwell
*************
NSW 2071
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Caley, John – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 19:30:41
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From John Caley
Sent 28/05/2019 7:30:41 PM

Fracking for shale gas requires pumping chemicals into the shale to fracture the rock. This is
an irreversible process that can damage aquifers just through the fractures formed in the rock,
as well as leaving chemicals in the wells long after the gas is extracted. Fracking often leads
to methane escaping from the ground across the field. Methane is 100 times worse than
carbon dioxide as a greenhouse gas and the emissions could make natural gas extracted by
fracking a much worse fuel than coal. I strongly urge you to ensure that all the impacts of this
proposal are considered carefully including the climate impacts.

John Caley
*************
NSW 2042
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Caling, Damian – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 09:39:44
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Damian Caling
Sent 25/05/2019 9:39:44 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Damian Caling
Maudsland, Queensland, 4210, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Damian Caling via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Damian provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Damian Caling at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Caling, Damian – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 07:02:51
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Damian Caling
Sent 29/05/2019 7:02:51 AM

Write your submission here - use our talking points to the left to guide your submission.

Damian Caling
*************
QLD 4210

Page 63 of 1136



Callaghan, Ruth – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 19:37:46
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Ruth Callaghan
Sent 29/05/2019 7:37:46 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Ruth Callaghan
Yanchep, Western Australia, 6035, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Ruth Callaghan via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Ruth provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Ruth Callaghan at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Callahan, Irene – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 10:35:27
Subject possumpoos@hotmail.com
From Irene Callahan
Sent 29/05/2019 10:35:27 AM

Write your submission here - use our talking points to guide your submission.

Irene Callahan
*************
NSW 2093
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Callan, Claire – Sunday, 26 May 2019 – 10:19:00
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Claire Callan
Sent 26/05/2019 10:19:00 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Claire Callan
Spring Hill, Queensland, 4000, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Claire Callan via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Claire provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Claire Callan at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Callanan, Mike – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 10:18:49
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Mike Callanan
Sent 25/05/2019 10:18:49 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Mike Callanan
Saint Lucia, Queensland, 4067, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Mike Callanan via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Mike provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Mike Callanan at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Callender, Peter – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 21:58:28
Subject Re: Registering my concern with Origin's EMP
From Peter Callender
Sent 29/05/2019 9:58:28 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Peter Callender
Brunswick West, Victoria, 3055, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Peter Callender via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Peter provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Peter Callender at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Callichy, Dede – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 17:29:13
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Dede Callichy
Sent 23/05/2019 5:29:13 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Dede Callichy

___________________________
This email was sent by Dede Callichy via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Dede provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Dede Callichy at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Callichy, Dede – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 22:49:24
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Dede Callichy
Sent 24/05/2019 10:49:24 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS

Page 79 of 1136



This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Dede Callichy

___________________________
This email was sent by Dede Callichy via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Dede provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Dede Callichy at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Callister, Seline – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 14:10:05
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Seline Callister
Sent 24/05/2019 2:10:05 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Seline Callister

___________________________
This email was sent by Seline Callister via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Seline provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Seline Callister at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Calov, Virginia – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 18:54:13
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Virginia Calov
Sent 28/05/2019 6:54:13 PM

Write your submission here - use our talking points to the left to guide your submission.

Virginia Calov
*************
NSW 2792
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Calver, Nicholas – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 20:03:36
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Nicholas Calver
Sent 23/05/2019 8:03:36 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Nicholas Calver
Chapman, Australian Capital Territory, 2611, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Nicholas Calver via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Nicholas provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Nicholas Calver at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Calwell, Linda – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 18:31:01
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Linda Calwell
Sent 23/05/2019 6:31:01 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Linda Calwell
Aldinga, South Australia, 5173, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Linda Calwell via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Linda provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Linda Calwell at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Calzi, Claudio – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 10:52:35
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Claudio Li Calzi
Sent 29/05/2019 10:52:35 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Claudio Li Calzi
Mount Eliza, Victoria, 3930, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Claudio Li Calzi via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Claudio provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Claudio Li Calzi at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Camara, Celia – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 13:12:04
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Celia Camara
Sent 29/05/2019 1:12:04 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.

Page 94 of 1136



4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf

Page 95 of 1136



Yours sincerely,
Celia Camara

___________________________
This email was sent by Celia Camara via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Celia provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Celia Camara at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Camera, Stephanie – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 22:02:28
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Stephanie Camera
Sent 23/05/2019 10:02:28 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Stephanie Camera
Newington, Victoria, 3350, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Stephanie Camera via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Stephanie provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Stephanie Camera at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Camera, Stephanie – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 12:08:55
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Stephanie Camera
Sent 24/05/2019 12:08:55 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Stephanie Camera
Lucas, Victoria, 3350, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Stephanie Camera via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Stephanie provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Stephanie Camera at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html

Page 101 of 1136



Cameron, Claire – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 11:07:21
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Claire Cameron
Sent 29/05/2019 11:07:21 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Claire Cameron
Kelvin Grove, Queensland, 4059, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Claire Cameron via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Claire provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Claire Cameron at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cameron, Leone – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 15:04:23
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Leone Cameron
Sent 29/05/2019 3:04:23 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Leone Cameron
Currimundi, Queensland, 4551, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Leone Cameron via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Leone provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Leone Cameron at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html

Page 107 of 1136



Cameron, Marcille – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 14:32:25
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Marcille Cameron
Sent 24/05/2019 2:32:25 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Marcille Cameron
Summer Hill, New South Wales, 2130, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Marcille Cameron via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Marcille provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Marcille Cameron at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cameron, Neil – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 10:49:59
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Neil Cameron
Sent 29/05/2019 10:49:59 AM

Chief Minister. Please do not allow Origin Energy to proceed with fracking in search of
natural gas in the Territory. we do not mood any more emissions of carbon dioxide which
would come from the burning gas which was found. If you are looking for sources of energy
then the territory has plenty sunlight.
Fracking apparently uses dangerous chemicals which would be stored open containers or
ponds which would be a threat to your water supply and to human health,especially to your
indigenous population who are all probably not well versed in the issue.
I write from southern Victoria where we are subject to the climate vagaries of there being too
much carbon dioxide in the atmosphere.Right now I would not mind some of your sunlight!
yours sincerely Neil Cameron

Neil Cameron
*************
VIC 3333
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Camilleri, Joe – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 11:27:27
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Joe Camilleri
Sent 24/05/2019 11:27:27 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this, as with all fracking is the EPA has bowed down to miners and is
unwilling to release their lacklustre regulations on fracking. Even more concerning is that
fracking regulations were designed for an archaic, arguably safer method of fracking.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Joe Camilleri
Tamala Park, Western Australia, 6030, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Joe Camilleri via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Joe provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Joe Camilleri at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Campano, Jorge – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 19:07:49
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Jorge Campano
Sent 28/05/2019 7:07:49 PM

it will be a climate disaster.

Jorge Campano
*************
NSW 2037
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Campbell, Alex – Sunday, 26 May 2019 – 19:07:52
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Alex Campbell
Sent 26/05/2019 7:07:52 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Alex Campbell
Indooroopilly, Queensland, 4068, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Alex Campbell via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Alex provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Alex Campbell at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html

Page 116 of 1136



Campbell, Emily – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 11:35:45
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Emily Campbell
Sent 30/05/2019 11:35:45 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Emily Campbell
California Gully, Victoria, 3556, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Emily Campbell via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Emily provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Emily Campbell at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Campbell, Joanne – Monday, 27 May 2019 – 06:10:08
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Joanne Campbell
Sent 27/05/2019 6:10:08 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Joanne Campbell
Booyong, New South Wales, 2480, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Joanne Campbell via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Joanne provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Joanne Campbell at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html

Page 121 of 1136



Campbell, Joanne – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 15:00:11
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Joanne Campbell
Sent 29/05/2019 3:00:11 PM

Fracking is toxic to the environment and affects the health of all life forms that are supported
and help to support the specific environment that is under threat of fracking. It is akin to
filling your body with arsenic and expecting to survive unscathed.
Why don’t Origin direct these huge amounts of money and resources into renewable energy
which will still provide great employment opportunities but with lesser damage being created
in our environment? Living in one of the sunniest countries in the world and to be so behind
the global trend to uptake large scale solar farming is sheer economic and environmental
madness.

Fracking is illegal in many countries in the world because of the scientific research and
findings that prove the contamination of water and land can be so devastating to the health of
our country and the species including flora, fauna & humans that rely on the health of our
water and land to be prioritised and protected.

I am absolutely appalled that once again the quest for earning big dollars is overriding what
common sense shows and tells us: that this would be poor economic decision making indeed.
The flow on damages alone (of which some may be irreversible) are too risky to seriously
contemplate: further species extinction, contamination spreading through the air, water and
soil.....the economic cost of dealing with the regeneration of land and impact on health
services into the long term future will be catastrophic ( think along the lines of asbestosis,
thalidomide , agent orange etc)

Please make progressive choices to support renewable energy, use energy reduction strategies
and SAY NO TO FRACKING.

Kind regards

Joanne Campbell

joanne campbell
*************
NSW 2480
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Campbell, Lyn – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 17:07:18
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Lyn Campbell
Sent 24/05/2019 5:07:18 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

___________________________
This email was sent by Lyn Campbell via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Lyn provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Lyn Campbell at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Campbell, Malcolm – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 10:55:26
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Malcolm Campbell
Sent 30/05/2019 10:55:26 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Malcolm Campbell

___________________________
This email was sent by Malcolm Campbell via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Malcolm provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Malcolm Campbell at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Campbell, Nikki – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 16:23:24
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Nikki Campbell
Sent 29/05/2019 4:23:24 PM

Write your submission here - use our talking points to guide your submission.

Nikki Campbell
*************
QLD 4066
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Campbell, Sandra – Monday, 27 May 2019 – 18:55:26
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Sandra Campbell
Sent 27/05/2019 6:55:26 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Sandra Campbell
Winfield, Queensland, 4670, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Sandra Campbell via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Sandra provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Sandra Campbell at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Campey, Col – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 18:24:02
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Col Campey
Sent 25/05/2019 6:24:02 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Col Campey
Mount Samson, Queensland, 4520, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Col Campey via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Col provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Col Campey at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Campion, Amy – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 14:31:05
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Amy Campion
Sent 29/05/2019 2:31:05 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Amy Campion

___________________________
This email was sent by Amy Campion via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Amy provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Amy Campion at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Campton, Penny – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 12:09:46
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Penny Campton
Sent 28/05/2019 12:09:46 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,
I am writing on behalf of my son, a young Larrakia man. He currently lives with me in
Adelaide, but the NT is his home. It is where his spirit will return. It is sacred land.
There should be no place for fracking in the NT. Already we have seen our rivers and land
contaminated by dodgy mining developments and inappropriate use of chemicals even when
contamination possibility was known about before hand, all of which we protested about and
warned government about, but you chose to listen to big business instead, leaving us with
1. major PFAS contamination of the Katherine River and aquifer.
2. major contamination at Mt Todd Gold Mine
3. major contamination of the McArthur River and environs
4. major contamination of Rapid Creek in Darwin
5. Major contamination at Rum Jungle
and many more.
Please listen to us for once. Not the money.

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.
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Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS

This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Penny Campton
Melrose Park DC, South Australia, 5039, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Penny Campton via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Penny provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Penny Campton at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Canaway, Rhi – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 11:55:22
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Rhi Canaway
Sent 29/05/2019 11:55:22 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
rhi canaway

___________________________
This email was sent by rhi canaway via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however rhi provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to rhi canaway at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cancino, Giovanna – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 18:37:00
Subject giovanna.ccancino@gmail.com
From Giovanna Cancino
Sent 29/05/2019 6:37:00 PM

DO NOT FRACK NORTHERN TERRITORY

Giovanna Cancino
*************
SA 5085
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Candy, Rick – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 19:16:44
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Rick Candy
Sent 23/05/2019 7:16:44 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Rick Candy

___________________________
This email was sent by Rick Candy via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Rick provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Rick Candy at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cannings, Michael – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 13:36:33
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Michael Cannings
Sent 29/05/2019 1:36:33 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Michael Cannings
Margaret River, Western Australia, 6285, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Michael Cannings via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Michael provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Michael Cannings at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cannon, Ian – Monday, 27 May 2019 – 01:24:01
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Ian Cannon
Sent 27/05/2019 1:24:01 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Ian Cannon
Nedlands, Western Australia, 6009, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Ian Cannon via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Ian provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Ian Cannon at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Canny, S – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 20:14:50
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From S Canny
Sent 28/05/2019 8:14:50 PM

Please think of the future and not this quick cash grab nonsense!
Respect our country and countrymen. Represent the people and not the corporations

s canny
*************
VIC 3122
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Cantor, Chris – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 14:26:54
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Chris Cantor
Sent 24/05/2019 2:26:54 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Chris Cantor
Castaways Beach, Queensland, 4567, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Chris Cantor via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Chris provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Chris Cantor at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cantor, Chris – Sunday, 26 May 2019 – 18:47:20
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Chris Cantor
Sent 26/05/2019 6:47:20 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Chris Cantor
Noosa Heads, Queensland, 4567, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Chris Cantor via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Chris provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Chris Cantor at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cappel, Kai – Sunday, 26 May 2019 – 21:25:43
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Kai Cappel
Sent 26/05/2019 9:25:43 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Kai Cappel
Carnegie, Victoria, 3163, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Kai Cappel via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Kai provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Kai Cappel at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Car, Patricia – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 21:48:33
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan
From Patricia Car
Sent 23/05/2019 9:48:33 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Patricia Car
Bassendean, Western Australia, 6054, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Patricia Car via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Patricia provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Patricia Car at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cara, Anam – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 20:56:58
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Anam Cara
Sent 28/05/2019 8:56:58 PM

My name is Anam Cara and I am a resident of Qld.
I object to Origin fracking in the Northern Territory.
I have seen the disastrous impact on the land, water and communities when the land is
fracked. I have seen the sickness in children and families when their land is fracked. I have
seen people's livelihood destroyed by fracking. And I have witnessed the senseless suffering,
disempowerment and despair that has left its mark because of fracking.
I say NO! to Fracking in the Northern Territory. NO! to allowing Origin to destroy a beautiful
Territory.

anam cara
*************
QLD 4272
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Carbines, Breony – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 20:54:58
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Breony Carbines
Sent 29/05/2019 8:54:58 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

I am a mother of two primary school aged children who are eager to visit the Northern
Territory and experience it's beauty and cultures. More importantly I am highly motivated to
safeguard my children and the children of the world's future by demanding fossil fuel
extraction developments are suspended immediately. Socially responsible corporations and
regulatory bodies need to redirect attention to viable alternatives immediately. Fracking is a
dangerous and dated process and Origin Energy should be more aspirational and forward
thinking in ways to generate enegy, employment, investment and profits.

As a member of the Australian community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated
with Origin Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I
strongly object to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
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Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.

4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286
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[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf

Yours sincerely,
Breony Carbines
Denial Bay, South Australia, 5690, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Breony Carbines via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Breony provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Breony Carbines at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Carbines, Jacqueline – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 09:42:28
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Jacqueline Carbines
Sent 25/05/2019 9:42:28 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
jacqueline Carbines

___________________________
This email was sent by jacqueline Carbines via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however jacqueline provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to jacqueline Carbines at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cariola, Ross – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 04:57:35
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Ross Cariola
Sent 29/05/2019 4:57:35 AM

This project is a threat to our safe climate future.
There are serious concerns as to whether Traditional Owners have been able to provide free,
prior and informed consent to the fracking process.

Ross Cariola
*************
NSW 2156
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Carkeet, Holly – Monday, 27 May 2019 – 08:17:11
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Holly Carkeet
Sent 27/05/2019 8:17:11 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Holly Carkeet
Ashgrove, Queensland, 4060, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Holly Carkeet via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Holly provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Holly Carkeet at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Carlill, Debra – Monday, 27 May 2019 – 11:44:26
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Debra Carlill
Sent 27/05/2019 11:44:26 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Debra Carlill
Freshwater, Queensland, 4870, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Debra Carlill via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Debra provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Debra Carlill at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Carlisle, Kathleen – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 20:01:55
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Kathleen Carlisle
Sent 28/05/2019 8:01:55 PM

Despite an independent inquiry into fracking in the Northern Territory and finding that our
indigenous communities overwhelmingly oppose fracking on their land, Origin is pushing
ahead with their dirty fracking plans. I strongly object to this project and I vehemently oppose
it going ahead.
There are so many reasons why this project should not be allowed to proceed. This project is
indisputably a threat to our safe climate future and is completely unnecessary considering that
Australia has an abundance of renewable, clean solar and wind which is non-polluting. Apart
from the dangerous emissions emitted into the atmosphere, the fracking processes use very
dangerous chemicals that represent a threat to human health, the natural environment and
water sources. Once the inevitable contamination that will result from fracking spreads all
round, it can't be ameliorated, it will be permanent with no going back to the pristine
environment that once was.
The health and environment risks are too great to be allowed to happen.
Please don't give approval for exploration well, because it would destroy our countryside and
water and be a total climate disaster .
Sincerely
Kathleen Carlisle

Kathleen Carlisle
*************
VIC 3441
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Carlson, Lyse – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 14:56:17
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Lyse Carlson
Sent 29/05/2019 2:56:17 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

We NEED to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of impacted communities as well
as our shared future from climate change.

Economic wealth cannot take precedence over the ecology of our lands.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
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Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.

4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml
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[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf

Yours sincerely,
Lyse Carlson

___________________________
This email was sent by Lyse Carlson via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Lyse provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Lyse Carlson at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Carlton, Amanda – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 08:44:52
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Amanda Carlton
Sent 30/05/2019 8:44:52 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Amanda Carlton
Bells Beach, Victoria, 3228, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Amanda Carlton via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Amanda provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Amanda Carlton at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html

Page 181 of 1136



Carmichael, Christine – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 13:08:00
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Christine Carmichael
Sent 24/05/2019 1:08:00 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below:

HAS THERE BEEN ADEQUATE CONSULTATION WITH TRADITIONAL OWNERS IN
THE AREA?

HAS ORIGIN SERIOUSLY CONSIDERED THE ALTERNATIVES OF RENEWABLE
ENERGY THAT DO NOT RAISE THE LEVELS OF GREENHOUSE GASES, POLLUTE
THE AIR AND DAMAGE THE ENVIRONMENT?

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

Origin plans to use fracking chemicals that are harmful to the health of animals, humans and
the environment. The list of substances Origin want to use have known health impacts. An
independent review of the substances shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory
irritation, tissue damage, burns, and cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long
lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS
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Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS

This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Christine Carmichael

___________________________
This email was sent by Christine Carmichael via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Christine provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Christine Carmichael at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Carnell, Kate – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 16:05:09
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Kate Carnell
Sent 30/05/2019 4:05:09 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Good afternoon,

It is time to listen to the people living in the area who are the ones that would be most affected
by the hydraulic fracturing. The Indigenous communities and many other Australians object
to this process taking place and we urge you to consider more sustainable energy sources,
which are an inevitability anyway, as fossil fuels are exhausted.

Please take the opportunity to make the right decision for the local communities as well as the
planet at large. You cannot ethically nor logically consider hydraulic fracturing to be the best
solution.

Be on the right side of history and stop abusing the Earth for profit.

Yours sincerely,
Kate Carnell
Carlingford, New South Wales, 2118, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Kate Carnell via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Kate provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Kate Carnell at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Carnell, Steph – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 20:09:23
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Steph Carnell
Sent 30/05/2019 8:09:23 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Steph Carnell
Mile End, South Australia, 5031, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Steph Carnell via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Steph provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Steph Carnell at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Caron, Lorenna – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 16:02:46
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Lorenna Caron
Sent 30/05/2019 4:02:46 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Lorenna Caron
Goulburn, New South Wales, 2580, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Lorenna Caron via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Lorenna provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Lorenna Caron at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Carr, Kathleen – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 18:24:01
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Kathleen Carr
Sent 29/05/2019 6:24:01 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Kathleen Carr
Coburg, Victoria, 3058, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Kathleen Carr via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Kathleen provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Kathleen Carr at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Carr, Renee – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 11:03:11
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Renee Carr
Sent 29/05/2019 11:03:11 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Renee Carr
Brunswick East, Victoria, 3057, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Renee Carr via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Renee provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Renee Carr at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Carrasco, George – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 09:08:24
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From George Carrasco
Sent 24/05/2019 9:08:24 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Breaking up the rock structure with high pressure toxic sludge has been seen to cause
irreperable damage to water quality and can also result in filtration of the water table,
permanently altering ecosystems and having serious and dangerous effects, such the "rivers
on fire" issues and flammable tap water and consequent health issues. The short sighted
profits earned by the very few at the expense of a greater community and ecosystem's
physical and future economic health do not benefit anyone in the long term nor are they
sustainable.

2. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

3. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

4. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
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Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.

5. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286
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[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf

Yours sincerely,
George Carrasco

___________________________
This email was sent by George Carrasco via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however George provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to George Carrasco at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Carrazza, Donata – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 17:19:52
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Donata Carrazza
Sent 24/05/2019 5:19:52 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Donata Carrazza
Mildura, Victoria, 3500, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Donata Carrazza via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Donata provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Donata Carrazza at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html

Page 202 of 1136



Carretta, Jen – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 15:21:51
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Jen Carretta
Sent 29/05/2019 3:21:51 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Jen Carretta
South Stradbroke, Queensland, 4216, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Jen Carretta via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Jen provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Jen Carretta at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Carrick, Paul – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 15:34:46
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Paul Carrick
Sent 24/05/2019 3:34:46 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
paul carrick
Deptford, Victoria, 3875, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by paul carrick via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however paul provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to paul carrick at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Carroll, Anara – Sunday, 26 May 2019 – 10:16:53
Subject Objection to Origin’s proposed fracking in the NT.
From Anara Carroll
Sent 26/05/2019 10:16:53 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my deep concern about and objection to the Environmental
Management Plan submitted by Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern
Territory.

My primary concerns are regarding the toxic load which is going to be dumped into the
environment with very little regard for, or protection against, ongoing contamination of water,
plus danger to human and animal and bird species.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
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Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS

This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Anara Carroll
Mullumbimby, New South Wales, 2482, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Anara Carroll via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Anara provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Anara Carroll at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Carroll, Cherry – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 12:15:42
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Cherry Carroll
Sent 29/05/2019 12:15:42 PM

BTo whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources
(DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Cherry Carroll
Kingaroy, Queensland, 4610, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Cherry Carroll via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Cherry provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Cherry Carroll at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Carroll, Chris – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 18:32:11
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Chris Carroll
Sent 25/05/2019 6:32:11 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Chris Carroll
Bells Beach, Victoria, 3228, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Chris Carroll via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Chris provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Chris Carroll at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Carroll, Linda – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 13:09:20
Subject Opposition to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Linda Carroll
Sent 24/05/2019 1:09:20 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

As an international citizen who understands that what poisons the air and water anywhere
poisons it everywhere, I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental
Management Plan submitted by Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern
Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.
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BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS

This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Linda Carroll
Spokane, Washington, 99205, United States

___________________________
This email was sent by Linda Carroll via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Linda provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Linda Carroll at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Carroll, Sara – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 21:19:23
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Sara Carroll
Sent 24/05/2019 9:19:23 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Sara Carroll
Newtown, New South Wales, 2042, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Sara Carroll via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Sara provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Sara Carroll at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Carruthers, Melissa – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 11:29:12
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Melissa Carruthers
Sent 29/05/2019 11:29:12 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Melissa Carruthers
Northcote, Victoria, 3070, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Melissa Carruthers via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Melissa provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Melissa Carruthers at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Carruthers, Nathan – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 12:13:26
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Nathan Carruthers
Sent 28/05/2019 12:13:26 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Nathan Carruthers
Peregian Springs, Queensland, 4573, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Nathan Carruthers via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Nathan provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Nathan Carruthers at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Carruthers, Wendy – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 17:23:57
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Wendy Carruthers
Sent 28/05/2019 5:23:57 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

___________________________
This email was sent by Wendy Carruthers via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Wendy provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Wendy Carruthers at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Carter, Glorianne – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 18:16:09
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Glorianne Carter
Sent 24/05/2019 6:16:09 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Glorianne Carter
Ludmilla, Northern Territory, 0820, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Glorianne Carter via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Glorianne provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Glorianne Carter at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Carter, Katrina – Monday, 27 May 2019 – 19:58:36
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Katrina Carter
Sent 27/05/2019 7:58:36 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Katrina Carter
Ballarat, Victoria, 3350, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Katrina Carter via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Katrina provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Katrina Carter at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Carter, Nick – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 14:54:28
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Nick Carter
Sent 24/05/2019 2:54:28 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

I'm a young person and I'm terrified about a future dominated by global heating. As an Energy
Company, I believe Origin can and must lead the transition to clean energy....and that doesn't
mean more fossil fuels. Origin, please be part of the solution Australians want. Gas may be
profitable and make for a non-coal fuel, but it will not make our climate impacts any easier to
deal with - rather, unlocking the vast reserves of carbon in the NT will make climate damage
only more and more costly for your company and for my generation. Please do the right thing
- and help Aboriginal communities to work in clean energy jobs that protect country.

I am also a customer of Origin energy at my sharehouse in Brisbane. If you continue to go
ahead with these fracking plans, I'll have no choice but to switch to a competitor, and will
encourage all my friends to do the same.

So without further adieu....

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a young person, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin Energy’s
plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object to the
approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
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drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.

4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf
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[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf

Yours sincerely,
Nick Carter

___________________________
This email was sent by Nick Carter via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Nick provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Nick Carter at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Carter, Paul – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 18:44:07
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Paul Carter
Sent 30/05/2019 6:44:07 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Paul Carter
Thornbury, Victoria, 3071, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Paul Carter via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Paul provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Paul Carter at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Carter, Zoe – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 18:20:30
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Zoe Carter
Sent 29/05/2019 6:20:30 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Zoe Carter
Northcote, Victoria, 3070, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Zoe Carter via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact you
regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we have
set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************, however
Zoe provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Zoe Carter at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Carthew, Peter – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 12:07:25
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Peter Carthew
Sent 29/05/2019 12:07:25 PM

I object to this project.This project is a threat to our safe climate future, and should not go
ahead.
Origin's exploration well has the potential to lead to hundreds of Origin's shale gas wells in
full production phase, and to the further development of Northern Territory's unconventional
gas industry, which NT government sources have said could mean over 6000 gas wells.1
The gas industries' peak body, the Australian Petroleum Production and Exploration
Association, has said there are over 200 trillion cubic feet of gas in the Northern Territory,
which is the equivalent to 50 power stations operating for thirty years.2
We simply cannot afford such a climate disaster. The fracking processes use dangerous
chemicals that represent a threat to human health, the natural environment and water sources.
Origin have provided a list of chemicals that will be stored and used on the site of their
exploration well. Many of these chemicals do not have available health data.3
These chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in the fracking processes.
The health and environmental risks of the dangerous chemicals used in the fracking processes
are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks.
Origin is proposing using open tanks to store liquids that flow back after the fracking process,
which will be millions of litres. This is in spite of the fact that the Northern Territory fracking
inquiry recommended that all polluted water from the fracking process be stored in closed
tanks to minimise risks to human life and the natural environment.4
There are serious concerns as to whether Traditional Owners have been able to provide free,
prior and informed consent to the fracking process.
The Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory stated that,
'Aboriginal people from regional communities who made submissions to the Panel almost
universally expressed deep concern about, and strong opposition to, the development of any
onshore shale gas industry on their country.'4
This included communities in the Beetaloo basin where this exploration well will be located.
A report from the Jumbunna Institute at UTS, 5 has questioned whether communities have
been provided adequate information about the fracking processes, leading to the conclusion
that 'based on a review of publicly available information, the report finds that most – if not all
– exploration permits issued in the Northern Territory for unconventional gas were issued in
the absence of free, prior and informed consent'. In this context it is not appropriate to proceed
with the current exploration permit without further consultation. References:
[1] 'Onshore shale gas in Australia and the Northern Territory', The Scientific Inquiry into
Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory, March 2018.
[2] 'NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants', The Australia Institute.
[3] For more information on chemical information see 'Object to Origin's frack plans', Lock
the Gate.
[4] Recommendation 7.12, The Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern
Territory, March 2018.
[4] 'Aboriginal people and their culture', p 266, The Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic
Fracturing in the Northern Territory, March 2018.
[5] Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and Informed Consent in the NT, Jumbunna Institute
UTS.
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Peter Carthew
*************
VIC 3136
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Cartwright, Sarah – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 13:53:21
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Sarah Cartwright
Sent 30/05/2019 1:53:21 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Sarah Cartwright

___________________________
This email was sent by Sarah Cartwright via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Sarah provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Sarah Cartwright at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Caruso, Emily – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 19:33:49
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Emily Caruso
Sent 29/05/2019 7:33:49 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Emily Caruso

___________________________
This email was sent by Emily Caruso via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Emily provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Emily Caruso at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Carvosso, Rani – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 21:39:32
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Rani Carvosso
Sent 30/05/2019 9:39:32 PM

To the Northern Territory Government

I am a member of Knitting Nannas Against Gas, living in NSW.
I object to fracking anywhere in Australia, and now join traditional owners in asking you not
to approve fracking in NT.

Fracking uses chemicals which have not been health tested, to break down shale. There is
always a risk of contamination to ground and artesian water. No drilling process is 100% safe.

Millions of litres of water are used in the drilling process and after use must be stored safely.
Containment dams at NSW sites have broken with subsequent leakage of treated water into
waterways and across neighbouring property.

There are many reports of ill-health in families living near fracking sites, nosebleeds in young
children being common. Traditional owners living near fracking sites will be at risk of
airborne and waterborne contamination.

There is much literature on the problems of the mining. Please read it and do not approve any
unconventional shale gas mining.

Rani Carvosso
*************
NSW 2251
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Case, Dominic – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 13:03:59
Subject Origin must not even consider the Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Dominic Case
Sent 24/05/2019 1:03:59 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are in addition to the points raised by Lock The Gate, which
are outlined later. They are simple:-

FRACKING AND BURNING GAS PRODUCES AN UNACCEPTABLE ATTACK ON
THE WORLD'S CLIMATE

I have noted the comments on Greenhouse Gas emissions in the inquiry in to fracking
conducted last year. They outline quite clearly the risks posed by increasing the amount of
CO2 and CH4 in the atmosphere, and recommend a regime of monitoring emissions and
complying with a range of standards.

That report refers to compliance with Australia's undewrtakings in the Paris agreement of
2015, reducing our emissions by 26-28% from the 2005 level by 2030. It has since been
recognised that this amount of reduction is inadequate if we are to limit global heating by
1.5C.

Using gas as an alternative to coal-fired energy generation would possibly reduce emissions,
though the whole-of-life emissions including fugitive emissions make this an uncertain - even
questionable - gain.

However, the point is that the world simply cannot afford to open ANY new sources of
greenhouse gas. Slowing down emissions from existing sources at the necessary rate is
already a profound challenge to our entire way of life: failing to do so presents a far greater
challenge. Adding to those sources will lead to almost certain failure to limit global heating to
within the limits considered safe, to avoid the likelihood of runaway climate disruption.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.
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Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS

This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Dominic Case

___________________________
This email was sent by Dominic Case via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Dominic provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Dominic Case at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Casey, Andrew – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 23:15:46
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Andrew Casey
Sent 23/05/2019 11:15:46 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Andrew Casey
Kew, Victoria, 3101, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Andrew Casey via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Andrew provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Andrew Casey at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Casey, Diana – Sunday, 26 May 2019 – 07:46:30
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Diana Casey
Sent 26/05/2019 7:46:30 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Diana Casey
Elwood, Victoria, 3184, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Diana Casey via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Diana provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Diana Casey at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cashen, Roe – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 12:08:48
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Roe Cashen
Sent 24/05/2019 12:08:48 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Roe Cashen

___________________________
This email was sent by Roe Cashen via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Roe provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Roe Cashen at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cass, Christopher – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 15:32:29
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Christopher Cass
Sent 29/05/2019 3:32:29 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Christopher Cass

___________________________
This email was sent by Christopher Cass via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Christopher provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Christopher Cass at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html

Page 260 of 1136



Cass, Pauline – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 11:53:15
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Pauline Cass
Sent 24/05/2019 11:53:15 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Pauline Cass
Girraween, Northern Territory, 0836, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Pauline Cass via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Pauline provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Pauline Cass at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cass, Pauline - Thursday, 30 May 2019
Subject BEETALOO BASIN DRILLING, STIMULATION AND WELL TESTING PROGRAM:

KYALLA 117 N2 Environment Management Plan EP117 Protect NT Inc.
From Cass, Pauline
Sent Thursday, 30 May 2019

See Next page
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BEETALOO BASIN DRILLING, STIMULATION AND WELL TESTING PROGRAM: KYALLA 117 N2 

Environment Management Plan EP117 

Protect NT Inc. Submission 

 

Dear Department of Environment and Natural Resources Minister, Eva Lawler, 

Protect NT Incorporated is a group of over 400 Territorians determined to protect our land, water, 

climate and lifestyles for future generations of Territorians. Onshore shale oil and gas hydraulic 

fracturing and its associated activities threatens everything we value about living in the Northern 

Territory. 

We are vehemently opposed to this EMP enabling Origin to drill, construct, hydraulically fracture, 

test, maintain and decommission a horizontal petroleum exploration well at Exploration Permit 117 

N2, in the Beetaloo Sub-Basin. 

There is no social licence in the Northern Territory for onshore shale oil and gas fracking. Territorians 

have repeatedly and clearly proven this fact through petitions, radio and newspaper polls, letters to 

the editor, posts on social media, at the NT Fracking Inquiry’s community consultations, and through 

their support of groups such as Protect NT Inc, Don’t Frack the Territory, Don’t Frack Katherine, 

Climate Action Darwin, Central Australian Frack Free Alliance, Frack Free Darwin, Lock the Gate, 

Protect Country, Seed Mob, the Environment Centre, Arid Lands Environment Centre, and all of the 

many groups who regularly work to protect the NT from fracking. This almost unanimous level of 

distrust, hostility and abhorrence held by Territorians towards hydraulic fracturing will not abate, no 

matter what incentives the oil and gas industry might offer. Our water, land and climate are too 

precious to risk and Territorians will never be persuaded to think otherwise. 

We insist that this EMP be rejected on the grounds that the Code of Practice for Petroleum Activities 

has not yet been implemented. The COP for Petroleum Activities should dictate what is acceptable 

practice and may be contrary to this EMP. We also insist that this EMP be rejected on the grounds 

that the Water Act has not yet been amended by the Water Amendment Bill and still requires 

further changes to implement the recommendations made by the Pepper Inquiry. Until all the 

legislative and regulatory changes are made, no informed decision can be made regarding this EMP 

and its adherence to legal requirements. 

We strenuously object to this EMP ignoring Pepper’s Recommendation 7.12, which states that 

wastes must be stored in sealed tanks. Open evaporative pits not only threaten our wildlife but have 

also been linked to acid rain and air pollution. It is not just water that evaporates and becomes air-

bourne from these highly toxic waste pits, but also the toxic chemicals. Plus, open wastewater pits 

create an unacceptable contamination pathway during the wet season’s flooding downpours, risking 

the entire watershed area including Lake Woods if they overfill and flood into the environment. The 

risks of spills and contamination is greatly increased by Origins plans to transfer wastewater from 

open pits to sealed tanks 72 hours prior to rain storms, especially as our rain events can often be 

unpredictable. Justice Pepper and her panel insisted that liquid wastes be stored in sealed tanks for 

a very valid reason. This recommendation must be adhered to. 

We also hold grave concerns regarding the chemicals Origin plan to use and store on site. The 

chemical information that was supplied included registered trade names for chemical blends. The 

material safety data sheets for these chemicals are data deficient, with many stating that there is 
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“no data available”. The little MSDS information that was available included descriptors of 

“Dangerous For The Environment”; “May cause respiratory irritation”; “May be harmful if 

swallowed”; “May be harmful if inhaled”; “Toxic to aquatic organisms”; “May cause long-term 

adverse effects in the aquatic environment”, and more. The lack of available information makes it 

impossible to make an informed decision regarding these chemical blends and shows that the risk 

assessments in the EMP are nothing but invalid guess work.  

This EMP also leaves many questions unanswered. For example, where exactly will the waste go? 

Evaporating or burying it onsite is not an acceptable option. Where exactly will the proppant sand 

come from? Has Origin consulted neighbouring and downstream landholders or business operators 

(such as tourism) in the area?  What about workers’ health when working in 40+ degree heat? Will 

materials and equipment used by Origin cope with excessive heat or flooding? How will the site be 

monitored and maintained during inaccessible flooding events? If our current drought conditions 

continue, will Origin’s water use be suspended, or will locals need to compete with Origin for water? 

What ever the answers to these questions may be, one fact remains, Territorians unequivocally 

refuse to accept fracking in the Northern Territory and will continue to do so until this scourge is 

finally and permanently banned in the NT. 

Yours Sincerely, 

Pauline Cass 

For Protect NT Inc. 

30/05/2019 
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Cassidy, James – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 18:50:29
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From James Cassidy
Sent 28/05/2019 6:50:29 PM

Write your submission here - use our talking points to the left to guide your submission.
The Northern Territory consists of a high proportion of DESERT. It is totally unsuited for
these destructive ideas that our electricity suppliers seem to be attracted to. ( Too Which They
seem to have an unacceptable Attraction ) The number of uninvited contacts & messages that
they are furiously pedalling is totally unacceptable.
Their unrestrained drive for a profit by any means is too outlandish to be regarded as
satisfactory trading. The undesirable clamour for profits by any means began when the
formerly State owned generators that contributed to State revenue were sold by a self
interested elected political party quite some time ago.

regards,

j.Cassidy

James Cassidy
*************
NSW 2765
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Casson, Nigel – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 14:14:08
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Nigel Casson
Sent 29/05/2019 2:14:08 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and well being of
impacted communities, as well as our shared future, from climate change.

As a member of the community I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for the people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted Australian regions if
emissions are not rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT
experience these effects first and worst: extreme heat waves, water shortages and more
extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal people to move off their country. Approving
this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for
business" to the expansion of the gas industry, potentially leading to emissions 20 times
Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This action would pose a serious climate change
threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable health risks and is incompatible
with the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be major storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and the health of community members and children at risk, including
communities upsream and downstream.

3. Origin Energy has failed to appropriately consult with all traditional owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of free, prior and Informed consent from traditional owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest that there are genuine reasons for concern in
relation to all of Origin Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this
Environmental Management Plan with all traditional owners, Aboriginal communities, and
appropriate cultural authorities for the areas impacted, both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health, and it would be exacerbated by the storage of contaminated flow-back waste water in
open storage tanks. Origin Energy's plans include the use of known toxic chemicals down
wells and their storage on-site over the dry and wet seasons.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. Knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern Territory will have
dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need to rapidly
decarbonise the global economy and energy system, the DENR should take a sensibly
precautionary approach to the climate impacts of any proposed exploration well.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
traditional owners, Aboriginal communities, and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
opportunity to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health-tested before being used in any fracking
processes. They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and
Chemical Abstracts Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and
identify oil and gas wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damage that fracking could cause to water, to country, and to song-lines, as well as the long
term effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf

Yours sincerely,
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Nigel Casson

___________________________
This email was sent by Nigel Casson via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Nigel provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Nigel Casson at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Castello, Linda – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 18:49:53
Subject No dangerous fracking for the N.T
From Linda Dal Castello
Sent 28/05/2019 6:49:53 PM

I object to fracking in the N.T a dangerous and environmental disaster of a plan.
This project is a threat to our safe climate future.
Origin's exploration well has the potential to lead to hundreds of Origin's shale gas wells in
full production phase, and to the further development of Northern Territory's unconventional
gas industry, which NT government sources have said could mean over 6000 gas wells.1 The
gas industries' peak body, the Australian Petroleum Production and Exploration Association,
has said there are over 200 trillion cubic feet of gas in the Northern Territory, which is the
equivalent to 50 power stations operating for thirty years.2 We simply cannot afford such a
climate disaster.
The fracking processes uses dangerous chemicals that represent a threat to human health, the
natural environment and water sources.
Origin have provided a list of chemicals that will be stored and used on the site of their
exploration well Many of these chemicals do not have available health data.3 These chemicals
must be adequately health tested before being used in the fracking processes.
The health and environmental risks of the dangerous chemicals used in the fracking processes
are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks.
Origin is proposing using open tanks to store liquids that flow back after the fracking process,
which will be millions of litres. This is in spite of the fact that the Northern Territory fracking
inquiry recommended that all polluted water from the fracking process be stored in closed
tanks to minimise risks to human life and the natural environment.4
There are serious concerns as to whether Traditional Owners have been able to provide free,
prior and informed consent to the fracking process.
The Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory stated that,
'Aboriginal people from regional communities who made submissions to the Panel almost
universally expressed deep concern about, and strong opposition to, the development of any
onshore shale gas industry on their country.'4 This included communities in the Beetaloo
basin where this exploration well will be located. A report from the Jumbunna Institute at
UTS, 5 has questioned whether communities have been provided adequate information about
the fracking processes, leading to the conclusion that 'based on a review of publicly available
information, the report finds that most – if not all – exploration permits issued in the Northern
Territory for unconventional gas were issued in the absence of free, prior and informed
consent'. In this context it is not appropriate to proceed with the current exploration permit
without further consultation.
I want Origin to lead the way in clean and renewable energy and stop investing in fracking
which is not the way most Australians want to go.
We need also to respect the wishes of the Aboriginal communities which will be effected.
Stop the dirty fracking plans now.
Thank you for caring about the environment and climate change.

Linda Dal Castello
*************
VIC 3925
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Castle, Janet – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 13:06:32
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Janet Castle
Sent 24/05/2019 1:06:32 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory. I have been a long time
Origin shareholder but have divested of Origin shares because of my opposition to fracking.
Although I live in Sydney I have family in the NT for whom I hold particular concerns. Iam
also a frequent visitor to the NT.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
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Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS

This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Janet Castle
Asquith, New South Wales, 2077, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Janet Castle via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Janet provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Janet Castle at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Catano, Carlos – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 13:10:27
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Carlos Catano
Sent 24/05/2019 1:10:27 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Carlos Catano
Cremorne, New South Wales, 2090, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Carlos Catano via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Carlos provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Carlos Catano at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Catesby, Janet – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 06:02:13
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Janet Catesby
Sent 24/05/2019 6:02:13 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Janet Catesby

___________________________
This email was sent by Janet Catesby via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Janet provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Janet Catesby at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cato, Kevin – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 17:28:40
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Kevin Cato
Sent 24/05/2019 5:28:40 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Kevin Cato
Collingwood North, Victoria, 3066, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Kevin Cato via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Kevin provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Kevin Cato at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cattani, Helen – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 15:49:59
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Helen Cattani
Sent 24/05/2019 3:49:59 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Helen Cattani
Melville, Western Australia, 6156, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Helen Cattani via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Helen provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Helen Cattani at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Catterson, James – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 17:29:48
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From James Catterson
Sent 23/05/2019 5:29:48 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
James Catterson
Alfredton, Victoria, 3350, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by James Catterson via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however James provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to James Catterson at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Catton, Holi – Monday, 27 May 2019 – 08:11:02
Subject BIG Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Holi Catton
Sent 27/05/2019 8:11:02 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of toxins including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the red tail cockatoo and the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open
and accessible to birdlife at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

___________________________
This email was sent by Holi Catton via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Holi provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Holi Catton at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cavallaro, Jenny – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 06:32:59
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Jenny Cavallaro
Sent 29/05/2019 6:32:59 AM

I am writing to express my opposition as a member of the voting public to the proposition put
forward for fracking in the NT. The environmental risks are too significant to allow for the
project to continue . Further the indigenous custodians of the land have indicated their
opposition to the project. Their sacred relationship with the land should be respected and the
heritage of the area respected and preserved for future generations.

Jenny Cavallaro
*************
SA 5114
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Cavallaro, Jenny – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 13:21:07
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Jenny Cavallaro
Sent 29/05/2019 1:21:07 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Jenny Cavallaro
Uleybury, South Australia, 5114, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Jenny Cavallaro via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Jenny provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Jenny Cavallaro at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cavicchioli, Rick – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 11:38:56
Subject Origin Energy should NOT frack the Kyalla site in the NT
From Rick Cavicchioli
Sent 24/05/2019 11:38:56 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am an Australian who has lived in outback Australia, in a major mining town, on a coastal
farm, in rural and city regions of Australia, and in cities overseas. I am an academic at an
institution in Sydney who studies environmental microorganisms and understands the link
between global biogeochemical processes and anthropogenic climate change.

Fossil fuels take millions of years to be generated through processes that biologically fix
atmospheric carbon and transform that biological matter into fossil fuels. The carbon cycle on
the planet is far out of balance because when fossil fuels are consumed (burned) for energy
generation it takes a comparatively tiny fraction of that time to release the carbon back into
the atmosphere. As a long-term greenhouse gas, carbon dioxide emissions are causing climate
change. Likewise, methane has a shorter atmospheric residence time but a much higher
greenhouse gas effect than carbon dioxide. It is simply not tenable to use fossil fuels (coal,
gas, oil) any longer for energy generation - it must stop. On top of the purpose of fracking for
obtain a fossil fuel, fracking causes a broad range of other environmental problems.

I am therefore writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan
submitted by Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
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planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS

This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Rick Cavicchioli

___________________________
This email was sent by Rick Cavicchioli via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Rick provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Rick Cavicchioli at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html

Page 293 of 1136



Cavicchioli, Rick – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 08:13:48
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Rick Cavicchioli
Sent 29/05/2019 8:13:48 AM

I am an Australian who has lived in outback Australia, in a major mining town, on a coastal
farm, in rural and city regions of Australia, and in cities overseas. I am an academic at an
institution in Sydney who studies environmental microorganisms and understands the link
between global biogeochemical processes and anthropogenic climate change.

Fossil fuels take millions of years to be generated through processes that biologically fix
atmospheric carbon and transform that biological matter into fossil fuels. The carbon cycle on
the planet is far out of balance because when fossil fuels are consumed (burned) for energy
generation it takes a comparatively tiny fraction of that time to release the carbon back into
the atmosphere. As a long-term greenhouse gas, carbon dioxide emissions are causing climate
change. Likewise, methane has a shorter atmospheric residence time but a much higher
greenhouse gas effect than carbon dioxide. It is simply not tenable to use fossil fuels (coal,
gas, oil) any longer for energy generation - it must stop.

On top of the purpose of fracking for obtaining a fossil fuel, fracking causes a broad range of
other environmental problems. Open air dams expose the environment year-round to toxic
fracking waste. Downstream areas such as Lake Woods, a place of international significance
for biodiversity, and threatened bird species including the Gouldian Finch will be put at risk.
Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly oppose fracking.

In addition to exploratory fracking by Origin, they are planning to develop hundreds of sites
to develop a production gasfield. I am therefore writing to express my objection to the
Environmental Management Plan submitted by Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the
Northern Territory, and for fracking throughout the Northern Territory.

Rick Cavicchioli
*************
NSW 2232
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Cazzulino, David – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 12:01:28
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From David Cazzulino
Sent 24/05/2019 12:01:28 PM

Write your submission here - use our talking points to the left to guide your submission.

David Cazzulino
*************
QLD 4868
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Cech, Lumir – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 11:30:55
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Lumir Cech
Sent 24/05/2019 11:30:55 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and well being of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for these reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendations.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of free and Informed consent from Traditional Owners

4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Yours sincerely,
Lumir Cech

___________________________
This email was sent by Lumir Cech via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Lumir provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Lumir Cech at *************.
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To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Celestine, Simonne – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 08:43:33
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Simonne Celestine
Sent 25/05/2019 8:43:33 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Simonne Celestine
Black Mountain, Queensland, 4563, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Simonne Celestine via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Simonne provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Simonne Celestine at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chabin, Didier – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 20:28:41
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Didier Chabin
Sent 30/05/2019 8:28:41 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Didier Chabin

___________________________
This email was sent by Didier Chabin via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Didier provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Didier Chabin at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html

Page 303 of 1136



Chadderton, John – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 10:57:27
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From John Chadderton
Sent 29/05/2019 10:57:27 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
John Chadderton
Footscray, Victoria, 3011, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by John Chadderton via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however John provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to John Chadderton at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chadwick, Anthony – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 14:38:34
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Anthony Chadwick
Sent 29/05/2019 2:38:34 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Anthony Chadwick
Saint James, Western Australia, 6102, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Anthony Chadwick via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Anthony provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Anthony Chadwick at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chalkley, Tom – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 10:55:11
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Tom Chalkley
Sent 29/05/2019 10:55:11 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Tom Chalkley
Carlton, Victoria, 3053, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Tom Chalkley via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Tom provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Tom Chalkley at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chalmers, Zoe – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 15:27:24
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Zoe Chalmers
Sent 28/05/2019 3:27:24 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Zoe Chalmers
North Wollongong, New South Wales, 2500, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Zoe Chalmers via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Zoe provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Zoe Chalmers at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chaloupka, Eve – Sunday, 26 May 2019 – 14:49:12
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Eve Chaloupka
Sent 26/05/2019 2:49:12 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I'm a proud Territorian - born and raised, currently residing and working in Sydney in the
Aboriginal and Torres Strait Islander cultural sector. My immediate family live in Darwin and
Kakadu National Park and I am connected through kinship to people in the Kakadu/ Western
Arnhem Land region of the Northern Territory.

I fully support Seed's concerns and am sending this submission to ask the Department of
Environment and Natural Resources to outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the
land, water, health and wellbeing of impacted communities as well as our shared future from
climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
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Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.

4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286
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[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf

Yours sincerely,
Eve Chaloupka

___________________________
This email was sent by Eve Chaloupka via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Eve provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Eve Chaloupka at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chamberlain, Clare – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 12:02:05
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Clare Chamberlain
Sent 29/05/2019 12:02:05 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Clare Chamberlain
Bayswater, Western Australia, 6053, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Clare Chamberlain via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Clare provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Clare Chamberlain at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chambers, Christine – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 18:15:24
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Christine Chambers
Sent 23/05/2019 6:15:24 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Christine Chambers

___________________________
This email was sent by Christine Chambers via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Christine provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Christine Chambers at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Champion, Alexia – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 07:57:57
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Alexia Champion
Sent 24/05/2019 7:57:57 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Alexia Champion

___________________________
This email was sent by Alexia Champion via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Alexia provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Alexia Champion at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html

Page 325 of 1136



Chanas, Michael – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 06:28:58
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Michael Chanas
Sent 29/05/2019 6:28:58 AM

Dear Minister,
My name is Michael Chanas and I am writing in objections to the Environmental
Management Plan for an exploration well.
I do not believe it should go ahead because:
-This project is a threat to our safe climate future.
-The fracking processes uses dangerous chemicals that represent a threat to human health, the
natural environment and water sources.
-The health and environmental risks of the dangerous chemicals used in the fracking
processes are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks.
-There are serious concerns as to whether Traditional Owners have been able to provide free,
prior and informed consent to the fracking process.

Thank you for the time that you have taken to read my objection

Sincerely

Michael

Michael Chanas
*************
NSW 2485
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Chandaria, Bhaval – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 10:56:49
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Bhaval Chandaria
Sent 29/05/2019 10:56:49 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change. We have less than 12
years to stay below 1.5 degrees and avoid climate change catastrophe, and hydraulic
fracturing will mean we won't be able to meet those targets.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
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Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.

4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml
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[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf

___________________________
This email was sent by Bhaval Chandaria via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Bhaval provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Bhaval Chandaria at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chandler, Peter – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 14:34:46
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Peter Chandler
Sent 29/05/2019 2:34:46 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Why can't Australia learn from other countries that have been adversely affected by allowing
fracking.Sickness poisoned water and damaged eco systems.And the list goes on.
It's all about money ( blood money) and no respect for the people it will affect.
Yours sincerely,
Peter Chandler
Donnybrook, Western Australia, 6239, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Peter Chandler via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Peter provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Peter Chandler at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chandra, Bhavna – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 11:38:04
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Bhavna Chandra
Sent 29/05/2019 11:38:04 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
bhavna Chandra
Coburg, Victoria, 3058, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by bhavna Chandra via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however bhavna provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to bhavna Chandra at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chapman, Asha – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 15:22:34
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Asha Chapman
Sent 29/05/2019 3:22:34 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Asha Chapman
Earlston, Victoria, 3669, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Asha Chapman via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Asha provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Asha Chapman at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chapman, Clare – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 12:20:06
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Clare Chapman
Sent 25/05/2019 12:20:06 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Clare Chapman
New South Wales, 2460, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Clare Chapman via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Clare provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Clare Chapman at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chapman, Donna – Sunday, 26 May 2019 – 11:37:45
Subject Please DO NOT FRACK in the NT
From Donna Chapman
Sent 26/05/2019 11:37:45 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Donna Chapman

___________________________
This email was sent by Donna Chapman via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Donna provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Donna Chapman at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chapman, Jedda – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 21:20:57
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Jedda Chapman
Sent 29/05/2019 9:20:57 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Jedda Chapman
Mill Park, Victoria, 3082, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Jedda Chapman via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Jedda provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Jedda Chapman at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chapman, Kathryn – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 12:28:05
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Kathryn Chapman
Sent 24/05/2019 12:28:05 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am extremely concerned about the proposal to investigate fracking in the Northern territory.

I am particularly worried about the plan to store toxic fracking waste material in open air
tanks which are vulnerable to the weather, and accessible to animals and birds. Toxic runoff
will also be a threat to the downstream Lake Woods.

The Northern Territory is unique in terms of both heritage and tourism. The idea of destroying
its important and environmentally valuable landscapes with potentially thousands of fracking
wells is short-sighted and economically irresponsible. Once gone these places cannot be
restored..

The fugitive emissions from such fracking activities also cannot be dismissed. At a time when
the world needs to act quickly to limit global warming opening up a whole new area for
fracking is irresponsible in an international sense.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Kathryn Chapman
Glenbrook, New South Wales, 2773, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Kathryn Chapman via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Kathryn provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Kathryn Chapman at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chapman, Lou – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 12:52:01
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Lou Chapman
Sent 29/05/2019 12:52:01 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.
Best wishes Lou

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Lou Chapman

___________________________
This email was sent by Lou Chapman via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Lou provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Lou Chapman at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chapman, Lowana - Wednesday, 29 May 2019 - 9:33 PM
Subject Shale gas Exploration in N.T.
From Chapman, Lowana
Sent Wednesday, 29 May 2019 - 9:33 PM

See Next page
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-----Original Message-----
From: Lowana Chapman
Sent: Wednesday, 29 May 2019 9:33 PM
To: eia NTEPA <eia.NTEPA@nt.gov.au>
Subject: Shale gas Exploration in N.T.

Hi,

I hope I have emailed the correct address..if not, would you please forward on to the department relating to my 
comment.

What worries me is if Origin and/or other companies are allowed to explore for gas in N.T they will channel 
poisoned water into pure waterways and ponds and that will endanger not only local communities, but birds and 
animals too. Once it is done it cannot be undone..please don't give them permission to go ahead with this, just 
think of the future of our country.

Sincerely,

Lowana Chapman.

--
I am using the free version of SPAMfighter.
SPAMfighter has removed 1770 of my spam emails to date.
Get the free SPAMfighter here: http://www.spamfighter.com/len

Do you have a slow PC? Try a Free scan
http://www.spamfighter.com/SLOW-PCfighter?cid=sigen
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Chapman, Rose – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 09:34:22
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Rose Chapman
Sent 25/05/2019 9:34:22 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Rose Chapman
New South Wales, 2460, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Rose Chapman via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Rose provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Rose Chapman at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chapman, Steve – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 08:54:34
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Steve Chapman
Sent 25/05/2019 8:54:34 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
steve chapman
Chevallum, Queensland, 4555, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by steve chapman via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however steve provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to steve chapman at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chapman, Steve – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 11:13:58
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Steve Chapman
Sent 29/05/2019 11:13:58 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
steve chapman

___________________________
This email was sent by steve chapman via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however steve provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to steve chapman at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chappell, Frank – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 19:37:57
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Frank Chappell
Sent 23/05/2019 7:37:57 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf

Page 360 of 1136



Yours sincerely,
Frank Chappell
Parkville, Victoria, 3052, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Frank Chappell via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Frank provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Frank Chappell at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chappell, Nicole – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 21:51:43
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Nicole Chappell
Sent 29/05/2019 9:51:43 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

I have lived in the territory for about 6 years, and during this time have enjoyed participating
in the health care environment in both Central and Top End, visiting the local communities
and admiring the natural landscape that has a very unique beauty.
My main concern is that there are countless demonstrations of environmental contamination
with fracking and inadequate waste disposal.The chemicals that will be used are injurious to
health for humans, wildlife and the country. Additionally, waste water ponds will be open to
wildlife and are likely to flood during the wet season. The risk that this then poses to the
surrounding environment is unacceptable. The Great Artesian Basin in which the majority of
Central Australia is dependent on is too great to jeopardise.
Please, consider what it will mean for the people living here.
Consider what we will tell the generations to come when the land is destroyed, people are
dying and there is nothing left.
I imagine that the financial prospects are difficult to turn down but PLEASE!!!! Fight the
good fight and listen to the communities' opposition to this dangerous, foolhardy scheme!

Thank you for considering my concerns.

___________________________
This email was sent by Nicole Chappell via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Nicole provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Nicole Chappell at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chapple, Ian – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 11:57:17
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Ian Chapple
Sent 24/05/2019 11:57:17 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Ian Chapple
Dunkirk, Victoria, 3630, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Ian Chapple via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Ian provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Ian Chapple at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chapple, Robin – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 09:51:13
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Robin Chapple
Sent 29/05/2019 9:51:13 AM

It is important that the traditional owners and Aboriginal communities are listened to in their
opposition to Origin Energy's Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling and
Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2 exploring for natural gas in the Beetaloo
Basin. Origin Energy wants to store toxic water in open ponds, despite the Northern Territory
government's own fracking inquiry recommending the use of closed tanks for all fracking
operations. This puts at risk the local environment. If any gas or oil are discovered and used,
the impact on climate change will lead to more intense cyclones in the region and elsewhere.
Please put a stop to this at once.

Robin Chapple
*************
ACT 2602
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Charles, Sally – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 18:40:18
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Sally Charles
Sent 23/05/2019 6:40:18 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Sally Charles
Bondi Beach, New South Wales, 2026, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Sally Charles via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Sally provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Sally Charles at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Charlton, Ivana – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 06:39:55
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Ivana Charlton
Sent 29/05/2019 6:39:55 AM

Write your submission here - use our talking points to the left to guide your submission.

Ivana Charlton
*************
VIC 3444
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Chataway, Indiana – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 18:25:13
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Indiana Chataway
Sent 29/05/2019 6:25:13 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Indiana Chataway

___________________________
This email was sent by Indiana Chataway via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Indiana provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Indiana Chataway at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html

Page 372 of 1136



Chatburn, Marlene – Sunday, 26 May 2019 – 04:53:41
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Marlene Chatburn
Sent 26/05/2019 4:53:41 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Marlene chatburn

___________________________
This email was sent by Marlene chatburn via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Marlene provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Marlene chatburn at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cheer, Sarah – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 09:18:24
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Sarah Cheer
Sent 30/05/2019 9:18:24 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Sarah Cheer
Coogee, New South Wales, 2034, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Sarah Cheer via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Sarah provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Sarah Cheer at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cheke, Lucinda – Monday, 27 May 2019 – 21:29:01
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Lucinda Cheke
Sent 27/05/2019 9:29:01 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Lucinda Cheke
North Wollongong, New South Wales, 2500, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Lucinda Cheke via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Lucinda provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Lucinda Cheke at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chelliah, Lalitha – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 11:25:43
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Lalitha Chelliah
Sent 29/05/2019 11:25:43 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Lalitha Chelliah
Northcote, Victoria, 3070, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Lalitha Chelliah via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Lalitha provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Lalitha Chelliah at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chen, Indianna – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 20:27:47
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Indianna Marteene Chen
Sent 23/05/2019 8:27:47 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Indianna Marteene Chen
Bundoora, Victoria, 3083, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Indianna Marteene Chen via Do Gooder, a website that allows people
to contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Indianna provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Indianna Marteene Chen at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chen, Iyie – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 18:18:56
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Iyie Chen
Sent 29/05/2019 6:18:56 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
David Chen
Park Ridge, Queensland, 4125, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Iyie Chen via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact you
regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we have
set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************, however
Iyie provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Iyie Chen at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chen, Louis – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 16:34:22
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Louis Chen
Sent 29/05/2019 4:34:22 PM

Write your submission here - use our talking points to guide your submission.

Louis Chen
*************
NSW 2150
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Chenery, Mary-Faeth – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 07:02:35
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Mary-Faeth Chenery
Sent 29/05/2019 7:02:35 AM

I am writing to express my deep concern and opposition to Origin's proposal to explore for
shale oil and gas in the Northern Territory. The country needs to move away from such fuels
due to the critical issues of climate change. As well, the traditional owners of the land should
be respected and their land and water resources seriously need protection. There is no way
that oil exploration of this type will be done without damage to the environment and water
resources. This is an unacceptable risk. As well, the fracking process uses chemicals with
unacceptable risks to human and environmental health. I ask that you do not approve Origin's
application.

Mary-Faeth Chenery
*************
VIC 3460
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Chessa, Marina – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 11:42:16
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Marina Chessa
Sent 29/05/2019 11:42:16 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Marina Chessa
Darlington, Western Australia, 6070, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Marina Chessa via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Marina provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Marina Chessa at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chester, Leonie – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 05:55:53
Subject CRe: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Leonie Chester
Sent 24/05/2019 5:55:53 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Leonie Chester
Newmerella, Victoria, 3886, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Leonie Chester via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Leonie provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Leonie Chester at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chester, Nadia – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 19:34:42
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Nadia Chester
Sent 28/05/2019 7:34:42 PM

This project is a threat to our safe climate future.
Origin's exploration well has the potential to lead to hundreds of Origin's shale gas wells in
full production phase, and to the further development of Northern Territory's unconventional
gas industry, which NT government sources have said could mean over 6000 gas wells.1 The
gas industries' peak body, the Australian Petroleum Production and Exploration Association,
has said there are over 200 trillion cubic feet of gas in the Northern Territory, which is the
equivalent to 50 power stations operating for thirty years.2 We simply cannot afford such a
climate disaster.
The fracking processes uses dangerous chemicals that represent a threat to human health, the
natural environment and water sources.
Origin have provided a list of chemicals that will be stored and used on the site of their
exploration well Many of these chemicals do not have available health data.3 These chemicals
must be adequately health tested before being used in the fracking processes.
The health and environmental risks of the dangerous chemicals used in the fracking processes
are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks.
Origin is proposing using open tanks to store liquids that flow back after the fracking process,
which will be millions of litres. This is in spite of the fact that the Northern Territory fracking
inquiry recommended that all polluted water from the fracking process be stored in closed
tanks to minimise risks to human life and the natural environment.4
There are serious concerns as to whether Traditional Owners have been able to provide free,
prior and informed consent to the fracking process.
The Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory stated that,
'Aboriginal people from regional communities who made submissions to the Panel almost
universally expressed deep concern about, and strong opposition to, the development of any
onshore shale gas industry on their country.'4 This included communities in the Beetaloo
basin where this exploration well will be located. A report from the Jumbunna Institute at
UTS, 5 has questioned whether communities have been provided adequate information about
the fracking processes, leading to the conclusion that 'based on a review of publicly available
information, the report finds that most – if not all – exploration permits issued in the Northern
Territory for unconventional gas were issued in the absence of free, prior and informed
consent'. In this context it is not appropriate to proceed with the current exploration permit
without further consultation.
References:
[1] 'Onshore shale gas in Australia and the Northern Territory', The Scientific Inquiry into
Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory, March 2018.
[2] 'NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants', The Australia Institute.
[3] For more information on chemical information see 'Object to Origin's frack plans', Lock
the Gate.
[4] Recommendation 7.12, The Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern
Territory, March 2018.
[4] 'Aboriginal people and their culture', p 266, The Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic
Fracturing in the Northern Territory, March 2018.
[5] Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and Informed Consent in the NT, Jumbunna Institute
UTS
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Nadia Chester
*************
QLD 4159
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Cheyne, Kelly – Monday, 27 May 2019 – 07:23:15
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Kelly Cheyne
Sent 27/05/2019 7:23:15 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Kelly Cheyne
New Farm, Queensland, 4005, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Kelly Cheyne via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Kelly provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Kelly Cheyne at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chiara, Peregrin – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 14:14:16
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Peregrin Chiara
Sent 29/05/2019 2:14:16 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to reject
Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of impacted
communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.

Page 403 of 1136



4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Peregrin Chiara
Kurraba Point, New South Wales, 2089, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Peregrin Chiara via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Peregrin provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Peregrin Chiara at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chick, Lucia – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 17:34:37
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Lucia Chick
Sent 24/05/2019 5:34:37 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Lucia Chick
Peregian Springs, Queensland, 4573, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Lucia Chick via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Lucia provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Lucia Chick at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chiew, Sophie – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 11:45:40
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Sophie Chiew
Sent 29/05/2019 11:45:40 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Sophie Chiew
Kew, Victoria, 3101, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Sophie Chiew via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Sophie provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Sophie Chiew at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chiffey, Russell – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 17:04:17
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Russell Chiffey
Sent 25/05/2019 5:04:17 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Russell Chiffey
Sherwood, New South Wales, 2450, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Russell Chiffey via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Russell provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Russell Chiffey at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chiffey, Russell – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 21:03:42
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Russell Chiffey
Sent 28/05/2019 9:03:42 PM

I object to this project proceeding.
Origin's exploration well has the potential to lead to hundreds of Origin's shale gas wells in
full production phase, and to the further development of Northern Territory's unconventional
gas industry, which NT government sources have said could mean over 6000 gas wells.
The gas industries' peak body, the Australian Petroleum Production and Exploration
Association, has said there are over 200 trillion cubic feet of gas in the Northern Territory,
which is the equivalent to 50 power stations operating for thirty years.2 We simply cannot
afford such a climate disaster.
The fracking processes uses dangerous chemicals that represent a threat to human health, the
natural environment and water sources.
There are serious concerns as to whether Traditional Owners have been able to provide free,
prior and informed consent to the fracking process.

Russell Chiffey
*************
NSW 2450
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Child, Gloria – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 22:00:21
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Gloria Child
Sent 23/05/2019 10:00:21 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Gloria Child
Elmhurst, Victoria, 3469, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Gloria Child via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Gloria provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Gloria Child at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Ching, Yvonne – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 14:41:18
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Yvonne Ching
Sent 29/05/2019 2:41:18 PM

To Origin Energy,
Fracking must not begin in the Northern Territory or anywhere else. I support the objections
raised by the Traditional Owners of the land on cultural and health reasons. Fracking violates
the care for country that Traditional Owners practise. The dangerous chemicals and
disturbance of underground waters endagers the health of people, plants, flora and fauna. It
makes no sense to destroy and degrade the the land on which we all depend.
Origin should put their investment and expertise in creating renewable energy resources and
take the lead to move Australia away from fossil fueled energy.

Yvonne Ching
*************
VIC 3429
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Chinner, Simon – Monday, 27 May 2019 – 21:17:23
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Simon Chinner
Sent 27/05/2019 9:17:23 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns. I'm about to inherit Origin shares and as a soon to be
shareholder I will look to make my objections known as a shareholder!!

Yours sincerely,
Simon Chinner
Strathalbyn, South Australia, 5255, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Simon Chinner via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Simon provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Simon Chinner at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chiplin, Toni – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 17:45:43
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Toni Chiplin
Sent 23/05/2019 5:45:43 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Toni Chiplin
Balgowlah, New South Wales, 2093, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Toni Chiplin via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Toni provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Toni Chiplin at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chirlian, Nicola – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 13:31:07
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT Onshore Gas Division
From Nicola Chirlian
Sent 25/05/2019 1:31:07 PM

Dear sir/Madam,

As an Origin shareholder, I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental
Management Plan submitted by Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern
Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

1. The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

2. It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the
toxic flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluids includes heavy metals, fracking chemicals and naturally
occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

3. It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

4. Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

5. This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies
to stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all
flaring on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
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Nicola Chirlian
WILLOW TREE
New South Wales, 2339, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Nicola Chirlian via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Nicola provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Nicola Chirlian at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chivell, Noelle – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 19:40:07
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Noelle Chivell
Sent 23/05/2019 7:40:07 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Noelle Chivell
Old Noarlunga, South Australia, 5168, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Noelle Chivell via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Noelle provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Noelle Chivell at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chomsky, Evan – Monday, 27 May 2019 – 15:09:14
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Evan Chomsky
Sent 27/05/2019 3:09:14 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

Hi - you need baseline readings for fugitive emissions before fracking takes place so you can
assess emissions and liability.

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
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Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS

This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Evan Chomsky
Bramley, Western Australia, 6285, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Evan Chomsky via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Evan provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Evan Chomsky at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chow, Liza – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 08:58:14
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Liza Chow
Sent 24/05/2019 8:58:14 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.

Page 430 of 1136



4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Liza Chow

___________________________
This email was sent by Liza Chow via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact you
regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we have
set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************, however
Liza provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Liza Chow at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chown, Dawn – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 12:52:27
Subject Dear Members of The Northern Territory Government, Kyalla Drilling and Hydraulic

Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Dawn Chown
Sent 29/05/2019 12:52:27 PM

rite your submission here - use our talking points to guide your submission.

Dawn Chown
*************
WA 6210
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Christensen, Shaun – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 11:37:45
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Shaun Christensen
Sent 24/05/2019 11:37:45 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS

Page 434 of 1136



This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Shaun Christensen
Eastern Creek, New South Wales, 2766, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Shaun Christensen via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Shaun provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Shaun Christensen at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Christie, Jean – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 09:03:04
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Jean Christie
Sent 24/05/2019 9:03:04 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Please show respect for the rights of the traditional owners and the welfare of all Australians.

Yours sincerely,
Jean Christie
Hawthorn, Victoria, 3122, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Jean Christie via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Jean provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Jean Christie at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Christie, Jean – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 07:53:20
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Jean Christie
Sent 29/05/2019 7:53:20 AM

Dear Northern Territory Government,

Please do not allow Origin to frack in the Northern Territory. This would result in the
poisoning of water supplies to the local people. It would also result in greatly increased
carbon emissions, which would result in further heatwaves and bushfires, leading to eventual
environmental destruction.

For the above reasons I ask you to disallow approval of Origin's Environmental Management
Plan.

Jean Christie
*************
VIC 3122
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Christley, Joyce – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 16:21:52
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Joyce Christley
Sent 30/05/2019 4:21:52 PM

Future generations will blame us for destroying the land and the Great Barrier Reef and
causing pollution in the waterways. Once destroyed there is no way to bring them back. Jobs
are important but we must find better ways to provide them.

Joyce Christley
*************
NSW 2040
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CHRISTOPHER, Andrew – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 20:57:18
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Andrew CHRISTOPHER
Sent 28/05/2019 8:57:18 PM

I am writing this to outline my objection to Origin's Environmental Management Plan for an
exploration well in the NT and am strongly against this fracking project proceeding.
There are enough pressures on our environment without adding yet another. How safe are the
chemicals used in the fracking process, which will be stored and used on the site? Why will
open tanks be used to store liquids that will be used in the fracking process after the NT
fracking inquiry recommended that the tanks be closed?
Finally, how much information were the traditional owners of the land given and how
seriously were their concerns taken?

Andrew CHRISTOPHER
*************
SA 5024
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Christophersen, Mia – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 09:19:30
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Mia Christophersen
Sent 30/05/2019 9:19:30 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

I am a Darwin local and have connections across the Top End of the NT. Growing up in the
bush, I realise how important it is to protect the vulnerable wildlife of the area. Along with
other species threats, mining is capable of destroying habitats and food sources for a variety
of species. They have already had enough to deal with without fracking and exposure to toxic
waste.

The NTG promised a moratorium over fracking when elected and now based on insufficient
evidence and a promise to mitigate environmental impact - without even knowing the risks -
have overturned the moratorium decision. The promise of economic development (money)
cannot keep our critters safe and I object to companies fracking on the promise of economic
development without fully understanding the impact this will have on our precious
environment.

I urge you to consider other opportunities to sustain our environment and look after the
Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE
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It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS

This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Mia Christophersen
Nightcliff, Northern Territory, 0810, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Mia Christophersen via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Mia provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Mia Christophersen at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chrystal, Evelyn – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 15:01:03
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Evelyn Chrystal
Sent 30/05/2019 3:01:03 PM

This project is a threat to our country and I concider we havae enough problems with our
water safety issues along with climate changing etc. I am just asking you to prevent taking of
further risks at least till we sort out where we are going with all of this.

Evelyn Chrystal
*************
NSW 2550
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Chubb, Kimberley – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 12:25:30
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Kimberley Chubb
Sent 24/05/2019 12:25:30 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
kimberley chubb
Buaraba South, Queensland, 4311, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by kimberley chubb via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however kimberley provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to kimberley chubb at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chugani, Sareeka – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 20:38:04
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Sareeka Chugani
Sent 29/05/2019 8:38:04 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.

Page 447 of 1136



4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Sareeka Chugani
Hawthorn, Victoria, 3122, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Sareeka Chugani via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Sareeka provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Sareeka Chugani at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Church, Janet – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 08:31:16
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Janet Church
Sent 24/05/2019 8:31:16 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Janet Church
Cudlee Creek, South Australia, 5232, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Janet Church via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Janet provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Janet Church at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Church, Karalyn – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 11:34:42
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Karalyn Church
Sent 29/05/2019 11:34:42 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
karalyn church

___________________________
This email was sent by karalyn church via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however karalyn provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to karalyn church at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chute, Ron – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 17:39:45
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Ron Chute
Sent 23/05/2019 5:39:45 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Ron Chute
Parap, Northern Territory, 0820, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Ron Chute via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact you
regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we have
set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************, however
Ron provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Ron Chute at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Chute, Ron – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 14:37:05
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Ron Chute
Sent 24/05/2019 2:37:05 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Ron Chute
Darwin DC, Northern Territory, 0820, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Ron Chute via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact you
regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we have
set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************, however
Ron provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Ron Chute at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html

Page 460 of 1136



Cilento, Anne – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 14:07:05
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Anne Cilento
Sent 24/05/2019 2:07:05 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Anne Cilento

___________________________
This email was sent by Anne Cilento via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Anne provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Anne Cilento at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cilla, Cristina – Monday, 27 May 2019 – 12:49:32
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Cristina Cilla
Sent 27/05/2019 12:49:32 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Cristina Cilla
East Fremantle, Western Australia, 6158, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Cristina Cilla via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Cristina provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Cristina Cilla at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cillessen, Anita – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 16:07:50
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Anita Cillessen
Sent 24/05/2019 4:07:50 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Anita Cillessen
Nailsworth, South Australia, 5083, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Anita Cillessen via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Anita provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Anita Cillessen at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Claff, Jack – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 09:08:27
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Jack Claff
Sent 25/05/2019 9:08:27 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Jack Claff

___________________________
This email was sent by Jack Claff via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact you
regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we have
set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************, however
Jack provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Jack Claff at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Claff, Liora – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 11:52:06
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Liora Claff
Sent 29/05/2019 11:52:06 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

For the NT government to overrule the wishes of the traditional owners is yet another slap in
the face for Indigenous people who are trying to protect something sacred and special. Where
westerners see only opportunity for wealth, Indigenous people and those of us who love
nature respect that we are part of an ecosystem that pushed too far will not be able to support
life - and then it won't make any difference how much money you have.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
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The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.

4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml
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[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf

Yours sincerely,
Liora Claff
Lismore Heights, New South Wales, 2480, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Liora Claff via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact you
regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we have
set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************, however
Liora provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-TO
field.

Please reply to Liora Claff at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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CLAIR-BAKER, Peter – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 23:35:35
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Peter ST CLAIR-BAKER
Sent 24/05/2019 11:35:35 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Peter ST CLAIR-BAKER
Margaret River, Western Australia, 6285, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Peter ST CLAIR-BAKER via Do Gooder, a website that allows
people to contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web
protocol FC 3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Peter provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Peter ST CLAIR-BAKER at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Clair-Baker, Peter – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 21:07:48
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Peter St Clair-Baker
Sent 29/05/2019 9:07:48 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Peter St Clair-Baker
Margaret River, Western Australia, 6285, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Peter St Clair-Baker via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Peter provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Peter St Clair-Baker at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Clancy, Errol – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 13:17:34
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Errol Clancy
Sent 24/05/2019 1:17:34 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Errol Clancy
Howard, Queensland, 4659, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Errol Clancy via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Errol provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Errol Clancy at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Clare, Kerry – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 05:47:54
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Kerry Clare
Sent 29/05/2019 5:47:54 AM

Fracking the NT, establishment of gas wells, and possibly oil wells has the high potential of
being an environmental disaster which will be a sad legacy of our government - a very poor
outcome after the original owners have looked after the land for so long. I strongly object to
fracking and support only the investigation of renewable energy sources for the safe future of
the world and humanity.

Kerry Clare
*************
NSW 2035
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Clark, Anna – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 09:12:23
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Anna Clark
Sent 29/05/2019 9:12:23 AM

Dear Northern Territory Government,
I am writing to you to lodge my strongest opposition to Origin Energy's proposal to any form
of gas exploration in the Territory. I stand with the Traditional Owners and Aboriginal
communities in opposition to Origin Energy's intent and plan.
Australia is facing serious climate issues, with extreme weather events including cyclones and
flooding in the NT. This is not the time to spend precious resources on exposing more fossil
fuels and there are not the conditions to reliably and safely story contaminated waste water in
open ponds in this environment.

Please, I beg of the government to make the right choices and to not pursue helping this
company and to pursue alternative energy sources. Origin Energy will employ a relatively
small number of people and create a legacy of damage and waste that will last for generations.
Say NO to Origin.
With thanks,
Anna Clark

24 Cambridge st
Collingwood, VIC, 3066

Anna Clark
*************
VIC 3066
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Clark, James – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 09:57:17
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From James Clark
Sent 29/05/2019 9:57:17 AM

I am writing to express my objection to the Origin Energy's fracking exploration in the NT.

My objection is based on a number of concerns:
1. The emissions from fracking, both methane and carbon dioxide. At a time when we must
be scaling back our fossil fuel industry, this project is an unacceptable risk to a safe climate.
The IPCC has given us a stark warning about the risks above 1.5°C of warming, and given us
less than 11 years to dramatically reduce global greenhouse gas emissions. This means that no
new fossil fuel projects can go ahead.
2. The chemicals involved in fracking are a risk to water, and the health and safety of
communities. The health and environmental risks of the dangerous chemicals used in the
fracking processes are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks.
3. There are serious concerns as to whether Traditional Owners have been able to provide
free, prior and informed consent to the fracking process. The Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic
Fracturing in the Northern Territory stated that, 'Aboriginal people from regional communities
who made submissions to the Panel almost universally expressed deep concern about, and
strong opposition to, the development of any onshore shale gas industry on their country.

Please stop this exploration. A safe climate is not something that is worth risking.

James Clark
*************
VIC 3630
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CLARK, JULIE – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 09:01:45
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From JULIE CLARK
Sent 24/05/2019 9:01:45 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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___________________________
This email was sent by JULIE CLARK via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however JULIE provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to JULIE CLARK at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Clark, Linda – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 14:39:04
Subject Don't Frack the NT
From Linda Clark Clark
Sent 29/05/2019 2:39:04 PM

Origin's exploration well has the potential to lead to hundreds of Origin's shale gas wells in
full production phase, and to the further development of Northern Territory's unconventional
gas industry, which NT government sources have said could mean over 6000 gas wells.1 The
gas industries' peak body, the Australian Petroleum Production and Exploration Association,
has said there are over 200 trillion cubic feet of gas in the Northern Territory, which is the
equivalent to 50 power stations operating for thirty years.2 We simply cannot afford such a
climate disaster.Write your submission here - use our talking points to guide your submission.
Origin have provided a list of chemicals that will be stored and used on the site of their
exploration well. Many of these chemicals do not have available health data.3 These
chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in the fracking processes. The
health and environmental risks of the dangerous chemicals used in the fracking processes are
exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks.
Origin is proposing using open tanks to store liquids that flow back after the fracking process,
which will be millions of litres. This is in spite of the fact that the Northern Territory fracking
inquiry recommended that all polluted water from the fracking process be stored in closed
tanks to minimise risks to human life and the natural environment.4 There are serious
concerns as to whether Traditional Owners have been able to provide free, prior and informed
consent to the fracking process.
The Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory stated that,
'Aboriginal people from regional communities who made submissions to the Panel almost
universally expressed deep concern about, and strong opposition to, the development of any
onshore shale gas industry on their country.'4 This included communities in the Beetaloo
basin where this exploration well will be located. A report from the Jumbunna Institute at
UTS, 5 has questioned whether communities have been provided adequate information about
the fracking processes, leading to the conclusion that 'based on a review of publicly available
information, the report finds that most – if not all – exploration permits issued in the Northern
Territory for unconventional gas were issued in the absence of free, prior and informed
consent'. In this context it is not appropriate to proceed with the current exploration permit
without further consultation

linda clark clark
*************
VIC 3192
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Clark, Lynne – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 14:13:11
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Lynne Clark
Sent 25/05/2019 2:13:11 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Lynne Clark
Burpengary East, Queensland, 4505, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Lynne Clark via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Lynne provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Lynne Clark at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Clark, Raymond – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 11:44:46
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Raymond Clark
Sent 29/05/2019 11:44:46 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Raymond Clark

___________________________
This email was sent by Raymond Clark via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Raymond provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Raymond Clark at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Clark, Sue – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 19:37:38
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Sue Clark
Sent 24/05/2019 7:37:38 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Sue Clark
Ringwood, Victoria, 3134, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Sue Clark via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact you
regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we have
set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************, however
Sue provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Sue Clark at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Clark, Takani – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 15:06:58
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Takani Clark
Sent 24/05/2019 3:06:58 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue. As a citizen of this
magnificent country I believe that the natural resources of Australia belong to all of us, not
just those who own corporations & have access to millions of dollars.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the Tasmanian community (which is also proposed to be opened up for
fracking/gas exploration), I stand in solidarity with the Northern community. I am deeply
concerned about the risks associated with Origin Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic
fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object to the approval of this EMP for the
following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
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Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.

4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml
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[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf

___________________________
This email was sent by Takani Clark via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Takani provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Takani Clark at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Clarke, Allan – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 23:55:00
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Allan Clarke
Sent 28/05/2019 11:55:00 PM

I object to this project and don't believe it should go ahead.
I can not understand that given the understanding of the ramifications this filthy process of
extraction of gas that you intend to push ahead with your current proposal to the detriment of
local communities and environment.

Allan Clarke

Allan Clarke
*************
VIC 3136
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Clarke, Anne – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 10:08:29
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Anne Clarke
Sent 29/05/2019 10:08:29 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Anne Clarke
Berrima, New South Wales, 2577, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Anne Clarke via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Anne provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Anne Clarke at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Clarke, Catalina – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 18:21:10
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Catalina Clarke
Sent 23/05/2019 6:21:10 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf

Page 504 of 1136



Yours sincerely,
Catalina Clarke
Footscray, Victoria, 3011, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Catalina Clarke via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Catalina provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Catalina Clarke at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Clarke, Chris – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 08:38:32
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Chris Clarke
Sent 25/05/2019 8:38:32 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory. As an Origin customer, I am
extremely concerned about this proposal. Should it go ahead, I will definitely switch
providers to one with a policy that is environmentally friendly.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.
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BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS

This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
chris clarke
Nowra DC, New South Wales, 2541, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by chris clarke via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however chris provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to chris clarke at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Clarke, Dick – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 19:08:03
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Dick Clarke
Sent 23/05/2019 7:08:03 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Dick Clarke
Elanora Heights, New South Wales, 2101, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Dick Clarke via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Dick provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Dick Clarke at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Clarke, Helen – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 17:31:36
Subject Objection to Origin's commencement of fracking without social or environmental

licence.
From Helen Clarke
Sent 29/05/2019 5:31:36 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.
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BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS

This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Helen Clarke
Brinkin, Northern Territory, 0810, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Helen Clarke via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Helen provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Helen Clarke at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Clarke, Hunter – Monday, 27 May 2019 – 21:11:31
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Hunter Clarke
Sent 27/05/2019 9:11:31 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

___________________________
This email was sent by Hunter Clarke via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Hunter provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Hunter Clarke at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Clarke, James – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 20:43:46
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From James Clarke
Sent 29/05/2019 8:43:46 PM

Write your submission here - use our talking points to the left to guide your submission.

James Clarke
*************
NSW 2000
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Clarke, Kath – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 10:07:52
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Kath Clarke
Sent 29/05/2019 10:07:52 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Kath Clarke
Bowral, New South Wales, 2576, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Kath Clarke via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Kath provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Kath Clarke at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Clarke, Sally – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 11:56:33
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Sally Clarke
Sent 29/05/2019 11:56:33 AM

To whom it may concern

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate emergency events.

. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities.

For many reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead .
YOU HAVE THE SCIENTIFIC SUBMISSIONS FOR THIS OBJECTION.

The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities

I wait with serious concern..

Yours sincerely,
Sally clarke

___________________________
This email was sent by Sally clarke via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Sally provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Sally clarke at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Clarke, Sam – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 22:16:58
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Sam Clarke
Sent 23/05/2019 10:16:58 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Sam Clarke
Beaumaris, Victoria, 3193, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Sam Clarke via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Sam provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Sam Clarke at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Clarkson, Carol – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 21:16:29
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Carol Clarkson
Sent 23/05/2019 9:16:29 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Carol Clarkson

___________________________
This email was sent by Carol Clarkson via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Carol provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Carol Clarkson at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Clayfield, Noeline – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 20:39:15
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Noeline Clayfield
Sent 23/05/2019 8:39:15 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As an Australian , I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin Energy’s
plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object to the
approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Fracking has proved to be an environmental disaster in many parts of USA and
Queensland. Many countries now ban fracking in Europe and Northern Ireland. There is great
resistance to any fracking herein the Uk.

Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
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Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.

4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times. This requirement has been
abused in many countries and it is too late when the chemicals are spilled or discharged
illegally. Who monitors this?

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286
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[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf

Yours sincerely,
Noeline Clayfield

___________________________
This email was sent by Noeline Clayfield via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Noeline provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Noeline Clayfield at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Clayton, Jean – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 15:59:30
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Jean Clayton
Sent 29/05/2019 3:59:30 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP, in order to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing
of impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the rural community who uses bottled gas but who is converting to off grid
solar, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin Energy’s plans for drilling
and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object to the approval of this
EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP risks irreversible impacts for people of the Northern Territory but
also beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of climate change,
and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not rapidly reduced
[1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst: extreme heat
waves and water shortages and more unpredictable drought extremes could force Aboriginal
people and remote pastoralists to move off their country. Approving this opening to nine
exploration wells. would signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" in the expansion of
the gas industry, potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual
emissions [2]. This would pose a serious threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. One of the items in the EMP accepting storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses
unacceptable risks and is incompatible with the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in
the Northern Territory (Inquiry) recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be
used to hold all wastewater.” [3] yet seasons and weather patterns are changing across the NT
in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992 and the
hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of season, and
having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put drinking
water, wildlife and health of remote community members and especially children at risk,
including communities far downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health that are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down wels and store on-site in both the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only pose risk during high pressure fracking
processes but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including further
exploration, should not be allowed to go ahead until further protections can be assured.

Below is a list of recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a highly precautionary approach to the cumulative climate and
social impacts of this exploration since the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the
Northern Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate and
communities well-being at this time when international research clearly demonstrates the need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times and should be subject to close
government monitoring periodically reported, several times per annum. Any risk events
should be publicly reported immediately and responsibility for rapid remediation assigned
within a very short timeframe.

3.Additional time for effective consultation processes should be allowed for Traditional
Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural and environmental authorities for
the areas directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be
given a fair chance to ask questions and respond with questions and responses available to the
public via media access to ensure scrutiny and validity.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes
with companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts Service numbers of
chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas wells in which
specific chemicals are used.

I write this submission with concern for my familiy’s sustainable future in Australia, and in
support of the sustainability of Aboriginal communities across the Northern Territory,
primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential damages that
fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines and community cohesion and
environmental sustainability, being mindful of the wider, long term effects of pollution and
contribution to climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286
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[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf

Yours sincerely,
Jean Clayton
Scott Creek, South Australia, 5153,Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Jean Clayton via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Jean provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Jean Clayton at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Clayton, Lee – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 01:25:13
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Lee Clayton
Sent 24/05/2019 1:25:13 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Lee Clayton
Karuah, New South Wales, 2324, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Lee Clayton via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Lee provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Lee Clayton at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Clayton, Lee – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 17:48:42
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Lee Clayton
Sent 29/05/2019 5:48:42 PM

please don’t frack N T.
Fracking causes poisonings and ill health because of gas and open tanks. Also indigenous
people have been unable to give informed, prior and free consent to the fracking process

Lee Clayton
*************
NSW 2324
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Cleeland, Linda – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 07:32:36
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Linda Cleeland
Sent 24/05/2019 7:32:36 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Linda Cleeland
Bundamba, Queensland, 4304, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Linda Cleeland via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Linda provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Linda Cleeland at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cleland, Richard – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 12:17:54
Subject Origin's Fracking Plans in the NT
From Richard Cleland
Sent 24/05/2019 12:17:54 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am a retiree living in rural SA. I have grave concerns about our environment and the future
of our grandchildren. I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management
Plan submitted by Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.
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BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS

This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Richard Cleland
South Australia, 5417, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Richard Cleland via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Richard provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Richard Cleland at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Clelland, Joy – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 18:30:57
Subject Fracking in the Northern Territory
From Joy Clelland
Sent 29/05/2019 6:30:57 PM

I am writing to register my objection to fracking in the Northern Territory especially the
application for approval for Origin. This development would cause distress to traditional
owners of the land who are also opposed to it. I believe that the development of oil shale
fields and fracking would grossly increase greenhouse gases and affect our climate's future. I
also fear for the contamination of local and underground water resources by the dangerous
chemicals used in the extraction process .
It is urgent that the legitimate concerns of all parties be acknowledged and acted on to stop
this further degradation of our environment.
Yours sincerely
Joy Clelland
Scarborough 4020.

Joy Clelland
*************
QLD 4020
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Clemens, Helen – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 11:10:05
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Helen Clemens
Sent 29/05/2019 11:10:05 AM

To whom it may concern at the NT Department of Environment and Natural Resources
(DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will contribute significantly to irreversible climate change impacts
for people of the Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already
experiencing the impacts of climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely
impacted if emissions are not rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the
NT feel this first and worst: extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding
could force many Aboriginal people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of
nine exploration wells, would signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the
expansion of the gas industry, potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total
current annual emissions [2].

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of principles which I would like to see the NT government adopt:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water associated with any fracking or mining activity should be held in enclosed
tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested and officially approved before being used in
any fracking processes. They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities
and Chemical Abstracts Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially,
and identify oil and gas wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change. I also write in despair about the impact of western capitalism on
Aboriginal people, which continues to destroy the country and the planet, and cause them
unique disadvantage and suffering.

I'd be interested to know if Origin is exploring and investing in solar hydrogen fuels.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286
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[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf

Yours sincerely,
Helen Clemens

___________________________
This email was sent by Helen Clemens via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Helen provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Helen Clemens at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Clements, Martin – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 08:32:21
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Martin Clements
Sent 25/05/2019 8:32:21 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Martin Clements
Essendon West, Victoria, 3040, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Martin Clements via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Martin provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Martin Clements at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Clenton, Jarrod – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 15:09:20
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Jarrod Clenton
Sent 29/05/2019 3:09:20 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Jarrod Clenton

___________________________
This email was sent by Jarrod Clenton via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Jarrod provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Jarrod Clenton at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Clethero, Carol – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 11:40:50
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Carol Clethero
Sent 24/05/2019 11:40:50 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

___________________________
This email was sent by Carol Clethero via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Carol provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Carol Clethero at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Clethero, Carol – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 09:54:13
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Carol Clethero
Sent 29/05/2019 9:54:13 AM

This project is a threat to Australia on so many levels. Have we really learnt NOTHING since
Rachel Carson wrote "Silent Spring" in 1962? The writing has been on the wall for a very
long time about man-made chemicals released into the environment and surely it's about time
we paid heed to the overwhelming evidence of destruction – particularly from blatant
examples in the U.S.A. When some of the chemicals Origin intend to use even have unknown
health effects then surely this should ring alarm bells. The chemicals in question, at the very
least, need to be investigated and proper (non-industry funded) science research undertaken to
determine their effects.

I am also very concerned about the lack of adequate consultation with the public and I’m
appalled that the Aboriginal people are not being listened to. Considering that the Aboriginal
people have lived on this land for tens of thousands of years without destroying it and the last
200 years has seen utter destruction of the environment, then surely the Aboriginal people
need to be seriously listened to and their advice taken. From what I understand, the
Aboriginal people from the area are deeply opposed to Origin’s project and fracking on their
land.

Carol Clethero
*************
VIC 3440
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Clews, Valerie – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 11:32:53
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Valerie Clews
Sent 29/05/2019 11:32:53 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Valerie Clews
Umina Beach, New South Wales, 2257, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Valerie Clews via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Valerie provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Valerie Clews at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Clifford, Rachael – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 13:27:06
Subject I object to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling and

Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Rachael Clifford
Sent 29/05/2019 1:27:06 PM

I absolutely object to this project and don't believe it should go ahead because this project is a
threat to our safe climate future!
Origin's exploration well has the potential to lead to hundreds of Origin's shale gas wells in
full production phase, and to the further development of Northern Territory's unconventional
gas industry, which NT government sources have said could mean over 6000 gas wells.
1. The gas industries' peak body, the Australian Petroleum Production and Exploration
Association, has said there are over 200 trillion cubic feet of gas in the Northern Territory,
which is the equivalent to 50 power stations operating for thirty years.
2. We simply cannot afford such a climate disaster. The fracking processes uses dangerous
chemicals that represent a threat to human health, the natural environment and water sources.
Origin have provided a list of chemicals that will be stored and used on the site of their
exploration well. Many of these chemicals do not have available health data.
3. These chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in the fracking
processes. The health and environmental risks of the dangerous chemicals used in the fracking
processes are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. Origin is proposing using open
tanks to store liquids that flow back after the fracking process, which will be millions of litres.
This is in spite of the fact that the Northern Territory fracking inquiry recommended that all
polluted water from the fracking process be stored in closed tanks to minimise risks to human
life and the natural environment.
4. There are serious concerns as to whether Traditional Owners have been able to provide
free, prior and informed consent to the fracking process. The Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic
Fracturing in the Northern Territory stated that, 'Aboriginal people from regional communities
who made submissions to the Panel almost universally expressed deep concern about, and
strong opposition to, the development of any onshore shale gas industry on their country (4)
This included communities in the Beetaloo basin where this exploration well will be located.
A report from the Jumbunna Institute at UTS, (5) has questioned whether communities have
been provided adequate information about the fracking processes, leading to the conclusion
that 'based on a review of publicly available information, the report finds that most – if not all
– exploration permits issued in the Northern Territory for unconventional gas were issued in
the absence of free, prior and informed consent'. In this context it is not appropriate to proceed
with the current exploration permit without further consultation. References:
[1] 'Onshore shale gas in Australia and the Northern Territory', The Scientific Inquiry into
Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory, March 2018.
[2] 'NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants', The Australia Institute.
[3] For more information on chemical information see 'Object to Origin's frack plans', Lock
the Gate.
[4] Recommendation 7.12, The Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern
Territory, March 2018.
[4] 'Aboriginal people and their culture', p 266, The Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic
Fracturing in the Northern Territory, March 2018.
[5] Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and Informed Consent in the NT, Jumbunna Institute
UTS.

Rachael Clifford
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*************
NSW 2450
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Clifton, Delma – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 08:20:36
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Delma Clifton
Sent 29/05/2019 8:20:36 AM

I'm writing to ask the Northern Territory Government to please respect the wishes of the
Traditional Owners and not allow fracking by Origin Energy. This activity threatens the water
quality of the area as evidenced by the situation in Queensland on the Western Darling Downs
where Linc Energy has been found guilty of causing serious environmental harm.

delma clifton
*************
QLD 4740
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Clifton, Melissa – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 10:53:09
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Melissa Clifton
Sent 29/05/2019 10:53:09 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf

Page 560 of 1136



Yours sincerely,
Melissa Clifton
Port Augusta West, South Australia, 5700, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Melissa Clifton via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Melissa provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Melissa Clifton at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Clifton, Rob – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 17:59:08
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Rob Clifton
Sent 23/05/2019 5:59:08 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Rob Clifton
Gelorup, Western Australia, 6230, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Rob Clifton via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Rob provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Rob Clifton at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Clifton, Wendy – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 19:42:42
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Wendy Clifton
Sent 29/05/2019 7:42:42 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Wendy Clifton
White Gums, Northern Territory, 0870, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Wendy Clifton via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Wendy provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Wendy Clifton at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Clissold, Andrew – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 06:27:24
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Andrew Clissold
Sent 30/05/2019 6:27:24 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Andrew Clissold
Downer, Australian Capital Territory, 2602, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Andrew Clissold via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Andrew provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Andrew Clissold at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Close, Helen – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 23:15:21
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Helen Close
Sent 29/05/2019 11:15:21 PM

I vehemently disapprove of the NT government allowing Origin, or any other company, to
start fracking for gas or oil. I do so due to the following reasons:
Chemicals used in the fracking process threaten our water supplies, our health and the natural
environment. Farms in the US on which fracking has taken place have experienced first hand,
the disastrous effects on their livestock and their land. Farmers have had to leave the land due
to poisoning from fracking chemicals. Exploration may provide jobs in the short term. The
consequences in the long term are disastrous given the lack of adequate testing. Monsanto is a
classic example of selling products (Aspartame at the time) which was known to have serious
negative health consequences due to pressure on and heavy lobbying of US politicians. Do
you as a government want to be responsible for a health and natural environment catastrophe
for future generations?
Are you happy to further disenfranchise Aboriginal communities with inadequate information
and consultation on repercussions on their land? Let's face it, it may be our government - It is
their land.
Recently I visited the Red Centre for the 3rd time in 20 years. One cannot help but be struck
by the ability of the Aboriginal people to live in this rugged, harsh and beautiful country for at
least 60,000 years by taking care of the land. They are credited with having methods of
agriculture and land management far beyond what has been historically thought - refer 'Dark
Emu' written by Bruce Pascoe. There abundant examples of chemical and exploration
companies who engage in practices harmful to human and environmental health. If you
believe information by Origin and other companies who employ fracking methods, then show
your confidence in their rhetoric that 'no harm will be done', by living, with your family, on
land close to a fracking well.
Please be responsible, nurture our land for future generations, say no to short term profits
afforded by fracking in the NT, or anywhere else in Australia.
Postcode 6158

Helen Close
*************
WA 6872
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Clough, Simon – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 11:32:51
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Simon Clough
Sent 29/05/2019 11:32:51 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Simon Clough
Lismore Heights, New South Wales, 2480, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Simon Clough via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Simon provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Simon Clough at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Clough, Vicki – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 06:14:38
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Vicki Clough
Sent 30/05/2019 6:14:38 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS

Page 574 of 1136



This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Vicki Clough
Skennars Head, New South Wales, 2478, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Vicki Clough via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Vicki provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Vicki Clough at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Clouston, Jonathan – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 20:42:16
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Jonathan Clouston
Sent 23/05/2019 8:42:16 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Jonathan Clouston
North Lakes, Queensland, 4509, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Jonathan Clouston via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Jonathan provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Jonathan Clouston at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Clucas, Annabelle – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 14:54:51
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Annabelle Clucas
Sent 29/05/2019 2:54:51 PM

To whom this may apply...I most certainly DO object to this exploration going ahead
because...
If the estimate of large quantities of gas existing in the NT is, in fact correct, there will be a
lot of money to be made (for the companies) through extracting it. However, no sum of
money is worth the resultant degradation and poisoning (through the use of poisonous
chemicals used in the extraction process) of the fragile and pristine land and extinction of
wildlife! This has implications not just for Australia, but for the whole planet, which does not
need more of the same unthinking actions which Science has definitively declared have
already caused (and is continuing to cause) a huge unprecedented upsurge in atmospheric
warming with accompanying rising sea levels and ocean acidification, not to mention the
pollution of pristine country and water.
The original owners and caretakers of these lands are only too aware of this, and should be
listened to. Please do so and scrap the appalling plans for fracking their/our country!

Annabelle Clucas
*************
VIC 3132
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Clutterbuck, Charlotte – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 14:48:29
Subject Objection to toxic-waste poetential at Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Charlotte Clutterbuck
Sent 24/05/2019 2:48:29 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING IS AN UNNECESSARY AND DANGEROUS OPTION WHEN WE HAVE
ACCESS TO SO MUCH CLEAN RENEWABLE ENERGY.

ALTHOUGH THE MORRISON GOVERNMENT WAS RECENTLY REELECTED,
RESULTS SUCH AS RECENT BY-ELECTION IN WENTWORTH, AND THE LOSS OF
TONY ABBOT'S WARINGAH SEAT SHOW THAT THE ELECTORATE IS DEEPLY
CONCERNED ABOUT CLIMATE CHANGE.

FRACKING REPRESENTS A THREAT TO THE ENVIRONMENT AND THEREFORE
TO ECONOMIC AND AGRICULTURAL RESOURCES WHOSE VALUE IS
IRREPLACEABLE.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.
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TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS

This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Charlotte Clutterbuck
Bouddi, New South Wales, 2251, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Charlotte Clutterbuck via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Charlotte provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Charlotte Clutterbuck at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Clutterbuck, Harriet – Monday, 27 May 2019 – 12:53:33
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Harriet Clutterbuck
Sent 27/05/2019 12:53:33 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As an Australian I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin Energy’s plans
for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object to the approval
of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of extremely dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and
community health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really
concerning chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry
and wet seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the
high pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Harriet Clutterbuck

___________________________
This email was sent by Harriet Clutterbuck via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Harriet provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Harriet Clutterbuck at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Clymer, Shirley – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 13:59:15
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Shirley Clymer
Sent 29/05/2019 1:59:15 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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This is an issue that I feel very strongly about for several reasons - the environmental danger -
the total disregard for the wishes of the Aboriginal people, whose lifestyle would be
permanently impacted upon are the main ones.
Just one tiny slip & subterranean water supplies would be contaminated forever.
Perhaps only people who have actually lived in our dry "inland" are able to appreciate fully
this very real possibility..The subterranean water basin is the very life-line for inland towns &
landowners (& their animals).
Why should selfish greed be allowed to become a danger to so much of our Land, Australia.

Please suggest that Origin that their investment would be much appreciated in the many areas
available for renewable energy production - totally safe, cheaper to set up & run, as well as
supplying masses of job opportunities.

Yours sincerely,
Shirley Clymer

___________________________
This email was sent by Shirley Clymer via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Shirley provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Shirley Clymer at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Coates, Maike – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 12:12:58
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Maike Coates
Sent 29/05/2019 12:12:58 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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___________________________
This email was sent by Maike Coates via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Maike provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Maike Coates at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cobcroft, Simon – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 11:42:28
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Simon Cobcroft
Sent 29/05/2019 11:42:28 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Simon Cobcroft
West Hindmarsh, South Australia, 5007, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Simon Cobcroft via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Simon provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Simon Cobcroft at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Coburn, Milli – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 10:43:53
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Milli Coburn
Sent 24/05/2019 10:43:53 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Milli Coburn

___________________________
This email was sent by Milli Coburn via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Milli provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Milli Coburn at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cochrane, Jane – Sunday, 26 May 2019 – 10:16:01
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Jane Cochrane
Sent 26/05/2019 10:16:01 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Jane Cochrane
Sadliers Crossing, Queensland, 4305, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Jane Cochrane via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Jane provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Jane Cochrane at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cochrane, Jane – Sunday, 26 May 2019 – 10:35:39
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Jane Cochrane
Sent 26/05/2019 10:35:39 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Jane Cochrane
North Tivoli, Queensland, 4305, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Jane Cochrane via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Jane provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Jane Cochrane at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cochrane, Jodie – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 17:36:48
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Jodie Cochrane
Sent 29/05/2019 5:36:48 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Jodie Cochrane
Kingsley, Western Australia, 6026, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Jodie Cochrane via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Jodie provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Jodie Cochrane at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cockcroft, Mary-Elizabeth – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 –
23:15:36
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Mary-Elizabeth Cockcroft
Sent 29/05/2019 11:15:36 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
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Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.

4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml
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[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf

Yours sincerely,
mary-elizabeth Cockcroft
Cremorne Point, New South Wales, 2090, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by mary-elizabeth Cockcroft via Do Gooder, a website that allows people
to contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however mary-elizabeth provided an email address (*************) which
we included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to mary-elizabeth Cockcroft at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cocks, Genine – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 10:57:42
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Genine Cocks
Sent 29/05/2019 10:57:42 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Genine Cocks
Dalyston, Victoria, 3992, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Genine Cocks via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Genine provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Genine Cocks at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cocks, Michael – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 10:07:03
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Michael Cocks
Sent 25/05/2019 10:07:03 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Michael Cocks

___________________________
This email was sent by Michael Cocks via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Michael provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Michael Cocks at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cody, Kerry – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 18:38:24
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Kerry Cody
Sent 29/05/2019 6:38:24 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Kerry Cody

___________________________
This email was sent by Kerry Cody via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Kerry provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Kerry Cody at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Coe, Bud – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 21:01:19
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Bud Coe
Sent 28/05/2019 9:01:19 PM

I beseech you to not approve Origin's request to pursue fracking in the NT. To protect our
water and our environment, say no!

Bud Coe
*************
WA 6233
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Coey, Marjorie – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 11:30:41
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Marjorie Coey
Sent 24/05/2019 11:30:41 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Marjorie Coey
Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Marjorie Coey via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Marjorie provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Marjorie Coey at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Coghlan, Robyn – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 12:58:10
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Robyn Coghlan
Sent 30/05/2019 12:58:10 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I endorse this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the Australian community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated
with Origin Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I
strongly object to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I endorse this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf

Page 620 of 1136



Yours sincerely,
Robyn Coghlan

___________________________
This email was sent by Robyn Coghlan via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Robyn provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Robyn Coghlan at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cohen, Brooke – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 17:42:27
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Brooke Cohen
Sent 24/05/2019 5:42:27 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Brooke Cohen
Ultimo, New South Wales, 2007, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Brooke Cohen via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Brooke provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Brooke Cohen at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cohen, Carolyn – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 19:45:01
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Carolyn Cohen
Sent 29/05/2019 7:45:01 PM

I appealed to the Northern Territory government to strongly oppose Origins proposals to
commence fracking and extraction of gas in the Northern Territory I believe there are grave
dangers to our environment ;adding massive pollution to The air and landseverely damaging
cultural sensitivities and rights of indigenous people of the Northern Territory. There is
additional grave danger of polluting water. I speak on behalf of many people . Please listen to
our very great concerns, yourssincerely

Carolyn Cohen
*************
WA 6281
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Cohen, Elaine – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 06:19:47
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Elaine J Cohen
Sent 24/05/2019 6:19:47 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Elaine j Cohen

___________________________
This email was sent by Elaine j Cohen via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Elaine j provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Elaine j Cohen at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Col, Cat – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 19:21:35
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Cat Col
Sent 24/05/2019 7:21:35 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Cat Col

___________________________
This email was sent by Cat Col via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact you
regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we have
set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************, however
Cat provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Cat Col at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html

Page 629 of 1136



Colbert, Samantha – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 09:18:54
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Samantha Colbert
Sent 30/05/2019 9:18:54 AM

I object to governments and industry continually raping our lands. It is shortsighted and fails
to consider the long strategic game we must play. Take this opportunity to stand up and say
no, we are custodians of this beautiful lands for many generations to come it is our duty to
protect and nurture it.

Samantha Colbert
*************
NSW 2064
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Colcheedas, Paul – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 19:33:23
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Paul Colcheedas
Sent 23/05/2019 7:33:23 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Paul Colcheedas
Warburton, Victoria, 3799, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Paul Colcheedas via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Paul provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Paul Colcheedas at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cole, Ann – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 12:16:48
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Ann Cole
Sent 29/05/2019 12:16:48 PM

I object to this project and don't believe it should go ahead. The fracking processes uses
dangerous chemicals that represent a threat to human health, the natural environment and
water sources. The health and environmental risks of the dangerous chemicals used in the
fracking processes are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are serious
concerns as to whether Traditional Owners have been able to provide free, prior and informed
consent to the fracking process. We must change our priorities...this is a matter of life and
death...we are fast running out of time to 'mend our ways'!! Next time you see a young child
see if you can look fully into their face knowing what it is that you know to be their future...

Ann Cole
*************
TAS 7150
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Cole, Marcus – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 18:19:27
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Marcus Cole
Sent 23/05/2019 6:19:27 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

With so much at stake for the future of our country - precious water, ecosystems, agricultural
land and the traditional lands of indigenous people - the dangerous and polluting practices of
"fracking" must be halted. The science is unequivocal on this, yet still Origin and others
persist with their intention to ruin the land for future generations.

The only ones who benefit from this destruction of our natural and necessary resources are
corporations and their shareholders.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
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Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.

4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286
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[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf

Yours sincerely,
Marcus Cole

___________________________
This email was sent by Marcus Cole via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Marcus provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Marcus Cole at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cole, Matthew – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 06:10:55
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Matthew Cole
Sent 29/05/2019 6:10:55 AM

Write your submission here - use our talking points to the left to guide your submission.

matthew Cole
*************
QLD 4881
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Coleborn, Alexandra – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 08:09:23
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Alexandra Coleborn
Sent 30/05/2019 8:09:23 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Alexandra Coleborn
Paddington, Queensland, 4064, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Alexandra Coleborn via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Alexandra provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Alexandra Coleborn at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Coleing, Ti – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 19:17:10
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Ti Coleing
Sent 23/05/2019 7:17:10 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Ti Coleing
Bondi Beach, New South Wales, 2026, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Ti Coleing via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact you
regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we have
set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************, however
Ti provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Ti Coleing at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Colella, Shirley – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 13:42:41
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Shirley Colella
Sent 30/05/2019 1:42:41 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I'm shocked that this 'Plan' is even under consideration. We should be looking at reducing
carbon emissions not unnecessarily creating more. The lives of the people living in that area
will obviously be detrimentally effected.

Please listen to the majority of Australians who want this country to be an example to the rest
of the world because they know that renewable energy is the only option for our long term
future.

Yours sincerely,
Shirley Colella
Maianbar, New South Wales, 2230, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Shirley Colella via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Shirley provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Shirley Colella at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html

Page 645 of 1136



Coleman, Marilyn – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 12:01:13
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Marilyn Coleman
Sent 24/05/2019 12:01:13 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Marilyn Coleman
Coromandel Valley, South Australia, 5051, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Marilyn Coleman via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Marilyn provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Marilyn Coleman at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Coleman, Meddwyn – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 07:22:41
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Meddwyn Coleman
Sent 30/05/2019 7:22:41 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Meddwyn Coleman
Fosterville, Victoria, 3557, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Meddwyn Coleman via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Meddwyn provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Meddwyn Coleman at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Coleman, Peter – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 11:40:53
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Peter Coleman
Sent 29/05/2019 11:40:53 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Peter Coleman
Oak Flats, New South Wales, 2529, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Peter Coleman via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Peter provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Peter Coleman at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Coleman, Robyn – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 20:13:20
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Robyn Coleman
Sent 24/05/2019 8:13:20 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

___________________________
This email was sent by Robyn Coleman via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Robyn provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Robyn Coleman at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Coleman, Robyn – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 20:01:31
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Robyn Coleman
Sent 28/05/2019 8:01:31 PM

Write your submission here - use our talking points to the left to guide your submission.

Robyn Coleman
*************
SA 5092
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Coles, Nicola – Monday, 27 May 2019 – 14:57:24
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Nicola Coles
Sent 27/05/2019 2:57:24 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate threat to communities across the NT and across Australia,
extending to the whole planet - this is a planetary issue which does not recognise national
boundaries. We cannot afford to expose ourselves to the risks forecast by a ma
jority of reputable, independent scientists.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
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Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.

4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml
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[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf

Signed: Nicola Coles

Pauline Elizabeth Nicola Coles
63 Collins St
Thornbury VIC 3071

Yours sincerely,
Nicola Coles

___________________________
This email was sent by Nicola Coles via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Nicola provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Nicola Coles at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html

Page 660 of 1136



Colless, Julie – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 10:48:20
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Julie Colless
Sent 25/05/2019 10:48:20 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Julie Colless
Bunya Creek, Hervey Bay, Queensland, 4655, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Julie Colless via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Julie provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Julie Colless at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Colless, Susan – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 11:21:49
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Susan Colless
Sent 29/05/2019 11:21:49 AM

What Origin proposes is a horrific climate disaster and a serious threat to human health, the
natural environment and water sources. There should be no further explorations made without
further consultation.

Susan Colless
*************
NSW 2560

Page 663 of 1136



Collet, Leona – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 17:55:33
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Leona Collet
Sent 24/05/2019 5:55:33 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Leona Collet
West Bendigo, Victoria, 3550, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Leona Collet via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Leona provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Leona Collet at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Colley, Thomas – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 19:54:40
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Thomas Colley
Sent 28/05/2019 7:54:40 PM

I object to this development and to Origin's plans to scale up fracking in the Northern
Territory for a number of reasons. Firstly, the development is clearly inconsistent with
keeping global warming within 1.5 degrees Celsius and therefore represents climate
vandalism. Please refer to the IPCC's recent report clarifying the urgent need to reduce fossil
fuel development and consumption. The NT government cannot justify replication of past
mistakes in the light of current knowledge on climate change.
Secondly, the fracking process involves risky use of dangerous chemicals and Origin are
already showing a willingness to increase these risks by storing contaminated waters in open
ponds rather than closed tanks. This demonstrates a cavalier attitude to human and
environmental health. The NT's own fracking inquiry (The Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic
Fracturing in the Northern Territory) recommended the use of closed tanks.
Thirdly, even with the use of closed tanks, the lack of information on the health effects of
these chemicals renders their use in a fracking context foolhardy in the extreme.
Fourthly, the proposed development lacks the prior and informed consent from Traditional
Owners. The fracking report previously mentioned notes that Aboriginal communities show
deep concern about and opposition to fracking, including Aboriginal communities in the
Beetaloo basin. The report from the Junbunna Institute of UTS (Hydraulic Fracturing and
Free, Prior and Informed Consent in the NT) reveals that most (possibly all) exploration
permits for unconventional gas in the NT have proceeded without adequate consent from
Traditional Owners, so in this context, it is imperative that further consultation, including
adequate information about risks, be conducted before a development application is
considered.

Yours sincerely,

Thomas Colley
*************
NSW 2780
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Collings, Sue – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 19:22:35
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Sue Collings
Sent 25/05/2019 7:22:35 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Sue Collings
Coorparoo, Queensland, 4151, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Sue Collings via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Sue provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Sue Collings at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Collings, Sue – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 20:18:26
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Sue Collings
Sent 28/05/2019 8:18:26 PM

I absolutely object to fracking in the Northern Territory.
This project threatens our national and global futures.
There are unacceptable health and environmental risks.
The traditional owners want to protect their country and have not given their fully informed
consent.
Yours sincerely
Sue Collings

Sue Collings
*************
QLD 4151
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Collins, Adele – Sunday, 26 May 2019 – 20:27:35
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Adele Collins
Sent 26/05/2019 8:27:35 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Adele Collins
Bowral, New South Wales, 2576, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Adele Collins via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Adele provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Adele Collins at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Collins, David – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 07:56:15
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From David Collins
Sent 29/05/2019 7:56:15 AM

This project is a threat to our safe climate future.
Origin's exploration well has the potential to lead to hundreds of Origin's shale gas wells in
full production phase, and to the further development of Northern Territory's unconventional
gas industry, which NT government sources have said could mean over 6000 gas wells.1 The
gas industries' peak body, the Australian Petroleum Production and Exploration Association,
has said there are over 200 trillion cubic feet of gas in the Northern Territory, which is the
equivalent to 50 power stations operating for thirty years.2 We simply cannot afford such a
climate disaster.
The fracking processes uses dangerous chemicals that represent a threat to human health, the
natural environment and water sources.
Origin have provided a list of chemicals that will be stored and used on the site of their
exploration well Many of these chemicals do not have available health data.3 These chemicals
must be adequately health tested before being used in the fracking processes.
The health and environmental risks of the dangerous chemicals used in the fracking processes
are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks.
Origin is proposing using open tanks to store liquids that flow back after the fracking process,
which will be millions of litres. This is in spite of the fact that the Northern Territory fracking
inquiry recommended that all polluted water from the fracking process be stored in closed
tanks to minimise risks to human life and the natural environment.4
There are serious concerns as to whether Traditional Owners have been able to provide free,
prior and informed consent to the fracking process.
The Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory stated that,
'Aboriginal people from regional communities who made submissions to the Panel almost
universally expressed deep concern about, and strong opposition to, the development of any
onshore shale gas industry on their country.'4 This included communities in the Beetaloo
basin where this exploration well will be located. A report from the Jumbunna Institute at
UTS, 5 has questioned whether communities have been provided adequate information about
the fracking processes, leading to the conclusion that 'based on a review of publicly available
information, the report finds that most – if not all – exploration permits issued in the Northern
Territory for unconventional gas were issued in the absence of free, prior and informed
consent'. In this context it is not appropriate to proceed with the current exploration permit
without further consultation.
References:
[1] 'Onshore shale gas in Australia and the Northern Territory', The Scientific Inquiry into
Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory, March 2018.
[2] 'NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants', The Australia Institute.
[3] For more information on chemical information see 'Object to Origin's frack plans', Lock
the Gate.
[4] Recommendation 7.12, The Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern
Territory, March 2018.
[4] 'Aboriginal people and their culture', p 266, The Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic
Fracturing in the Northern Territory, March 2018.
[5] Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and Informed Consent in the NT, Jumbunna Institute
UTS.
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David Collins
*************
NSW 2113
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COLLINS, HELEN – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 13:30:28
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From HELEN COLLINS
Sent 29/05/2019 1:30:28 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
HELEN C
Warrawee, New South Wales, 2074, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by HELEN COLLINS via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however HELEN provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to HELEN COLLINS at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Collins, Janine – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 19:52:26
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Janine Collins
Sent 23/05/2019 7:52:26 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
janine collins
Violet Town, Victoria, 3669, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by janine collins via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however janine provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to janine collins at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Collins, John – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 22:23:47
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From John Collins
Sent 23/05/2019 10:23:47 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
John Collins
Giralang, Australian Capital Territory, 2617, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by John Collins via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however John provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to John Collins at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Collins, Karen – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 20:45:53
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Karen Collins
Sent 23/05/2019 8:45:53 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Karen Collins

___________________________
This email was sent by Karen Collins via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Karen provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Karen Collins at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Collins, Ken – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 09:28:35
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Ken Collins
Sent 24/05/2019 9:28:35 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Ken Collins

___________________________
This email was sent by Ken Collins via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Ken provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Ken Collins at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Collins, Paula – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 16:00:34
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Paula Collins
Sent 25/05/2019 4:00:34 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Paula Collins
South Boulder, Western Australia, 6432, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Paula Collins via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Paula provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Paula Collins at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Collins, Rowan – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 09:33:23
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Rowan Collins
Sent 30/05/2019 9:33:23 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Rowan Collins
Spence, Australian Capital Territory, 2615, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Rowan Collins via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Rowan provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Rowan Collins at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Collins, Shaun – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 19:00:11
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Shaun Collins
Sent 23/05/2019 7:00:11 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Shaun Collins
Andergrove, Queensland, 4740, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Shaun Collins via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Shaun provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Shaun Collins at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Collins, Yvonne – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 11:04:52
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Yvonne Collins
Sent 24/05/2019 11:04:52 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Yvonne Collins

___________________________
This email was sent by Yvonne Collins via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Yvonne provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Yvonne Collins at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Collis, Vince – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 16:19:57
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Vince Collis
Sent 24/05/2019 4:19:57 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Vince Collis
Pomona, Queensland, 4568, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Vince Collis via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Vince provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Vince Collis at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Collits, Wendy – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 10:05:53
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Wendy Collits
Sent 25/05/2019 10:05:53 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

___________________________
This email was sent by Wendy Collits via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Wendy provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Wendy Collits at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Colliver, Michael – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 11:15:45
Subject ATTENTION Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Michael Colliver
Sent 29/05/2019 11:15:45 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Michael Colliver
Revesby, New South Wales, 2212, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Michael Colliver via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Michael provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Michael Colliver at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Collyer, Julie – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 19:20:34
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Julie Collyer
Sent 29/05/2019 7:20:34 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Julie Collyer
Junortoun.
Victoria, 3551, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Julie Collyer via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Julie provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Julie Collyer at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Colston, Sarah – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 20:48:47
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Sarah Colston
Sent 29/05/2019 8:48:47 PM

No-one is taking environmental issues seriously, and that needs to change. Please reject this
exploration well. You have the power! if the Northern Territory's gas is drilled and burned,
the carbon emissions would equal fifty new coal fired power stations. It's a carbon bomb that
we simply can't afford.
Please listen to the Traditional Owners and Aboriginal communities who are standing up and
saying no to fracking. We cannot keep treating our land like this! There will be nothing left
for our future generations!

Sarah colston
*************
NSW 2299
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Coltman, Graeme – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 13:53:45
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Graeme Coltman
Sent 29/05/2019 1:53:45 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

___________________________
This email was sent by Graeme coltman via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Graeme provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Graeme coltman at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Comerford, Laurie – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 09:50:00
Subject Objection: Origin Energy’s short-cut and dangerous Environmental Management Plan

for the Kyalla Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Laurie Comerford
Sent 29/05/2019 9:50:00 AM

Driven by short term greed and total lack of concern for the future of the Northern Territory,
Origin believe they can deal with a bunch of hicks and get their own way by fracking any
where and every where regardless of the damage to the people, the land and the long term
future of the planet. Show them you care and that they are not able to infringe on society just
to satisfy their greed.

Laurie Comerford
*************
VIC 3196
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Cominos, Con – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 11:09:21
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Con Cominos
Sent 29/05/2019 11:09:21 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.

Page 714 of 1136



4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Con Cominos

___________________________
This email was sent by Con Cominos via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Con provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Con Cominos at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Compson-Harris, Zkye – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 17:58:11
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Zkye Compson-Harris
Sent 23/05/2019 5:58:11 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Zkye Compson-Harris

___________________________
This email was sent by Zkye Compson-Harris via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Zkye provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Zkye Compson-Harris at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Conabere, Annette – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 13:44:49
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Annette Conabere
Sent 24/05/2019 1:44:49 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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___________________________
This email was sent by Annette Conabere via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Annette provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Annette Conabere at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Conforti, Kathy – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 02:44:54
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Kathy Conforti
Sent 29/05/2019 2:44:54 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS

Page 723 of 1136



This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Kathy Conforti
Currumbin Valley, Queensland, 4223, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Kathy Conforti via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Kathy provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Kathy Conforti at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Congdon, Phillip – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 13:51:12
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Phillip Congdon
Sent 29/05/2019 1:51:12 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf

Page 726 of 1136



Yours sincerely,
Phillip Congdon
Macquarie Hills, New South Wales, 2285, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Phillip Congdon via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Phillip provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Phillip Congdon at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Conlan, Elizabeth – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 16:19:01
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Elizabeth Conlan
Sent 25/05/2019 4:19:01 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Elizabeth Conlan

___________________________
This email was sent by Elizabeth Conlan via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Elizabeth provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Elizabeth Conlan at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Conlan, Elizabeth – Monday, 27 May 2019 – 21:16:49
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Elizabeth Conlan
Sent 27/05/2019 9:16:49 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Elizabeth Conlan
Dolphin Heads, Queensland, 4740, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Elizabeth Conlan via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Elizabeth provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Elizabeth Conlan at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Conlon, Patricia – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 11:38:28
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Patricia Conlon
Sent 29/05/2019 11:38:28 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Patricia Conlon
Durack, Queensland, 4077, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Patricia Conlon via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Patricia provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Patricia Conlon at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Connell, Graham – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 14:21:30
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Graham Connell
Sent 29/05/2019 2:21:30 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Please the first consider should be the environment this includes and the people of the land
the animals and the potential damage to underwater. If you Carnt guarantee this don't do it the
track record of this type of enterprise isn't real good at all

what is money if you have foul water , a waste land full of contaminants and sick people have
a look at the oil sand extraction in Canada it absolutely horendace. If you carnt guarantee that
that wont happen as has happened all over the world DONT DO IT simple.

___________________________
This email was sent by Graham Connell via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Graham provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Graham Connell at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Connelly, Maryanne – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 16:41:25
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Maryanne Connelly
Sent 29/05/2019 4:41:25 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Maryanne Connelly

___________________________
This email was sent by Maryanne Connelly via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Maryanne provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Maryanne Connelly at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Connolly, Catherine – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 12:29:10
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Catherine Connolly
Sent 29/05/2019 12:29:10 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Catherine Connolly
Fitzroy North, Victoria, 3068, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Catherine Connolly via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Catherine provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Catherine Connolly at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Connolly, Julie – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 11:20:47
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Julie Connolly
Sent 29/05/2019 11:20:47 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf

Page 746 of 1136



Yours sincerely,
Julie Connolly
Oxley, Victoria, 3678, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Julie Connolly via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Julie provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Julie Connolly at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Connolly, Michael – Monday, 27 May 2019 – 09:21:23
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Michael Connolly
Sent 27/05/2019 9:21:23 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Michael Connolly
Bayswater North, Victoria, 3153, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Michael Connolly via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Michael provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Michael Connolly at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Connor, Jason – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 17:31:57
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Jason Connor
Sent 23/05/2019 5:31:57 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Jason Connor

___________________________
This email was sent by Jason Connor via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Jason provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Jason Connor at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html

Page 752 of 1136



Connor, Patrick – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 12:09:48
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Patrick O Connor
Sent 24/05/2019 12:09:48 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Patrick O Connor

___________________________
This email was sent by Patrick O Connor via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Patrick provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Patrick O Connor at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Connors, Christine – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 04:22:12
Subject Origin’s Kyalla frack site
From Christine Connors
Sent 29/05/2019 4:22:12 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING Chemicals toxicity

The list of substances Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review
of the substances shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage,
burns, and cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic and bird life with long lasting effects. Th
EMP showed that summer of proposed chemicals do not have identical support safe use

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS Are too risky for the NT

Storing the flowback fluid opening tanks is too dangerous.
This flowback and drilling fluid includes heavy metals, fracking chemicals and naturally
occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open tanks pose a risk to the threatened birdlife that visits the site,
including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife at any time.

Heavy rainfall and flooding could cause downstream pollution from open air tanks

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Christine Connors
Nakara, Northern Territory, 0810,

___________________________
This email was sent by Christine Connors via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Christine provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Christine Connors at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Conolly, Michelle – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 17:39:47
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Michelle Conolly
Sent 23/05/2019 5:39:47 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Regardless of what the media says, climate change is real and it's here. There isn't something
to "debate". Whether you know it now or know it later, it is here. Do the right thing.

Yours sincerely,
Michelle C

___________________________
This email was sent by Michelle Conolly via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Michelle provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Michelle Conolly at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Conroy, Bodil – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 07:52:33
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Bodil Conroy
Sent 24/05/2019 7:52:33 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Bodil Conroy
Gray, Northern Territory, 0830, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Bodil Conroy via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Bodil provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Bodil Conroy at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Conti, Stacey – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 13:08:26
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Stacey Conti
Sent 29/05/2019 1:08:26 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Stacey Conti
Hilton, Western Australia, 6163, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Stacey Conti via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Stacey provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Stacey Conti at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Conyers, Anna – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 17:48:15
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Anna Conyers
Sent 23/05/2019 5:48:15 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Anna Conyers
Mount Austin, New South Wales, 2650, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Anna Conyers via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Anna provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Anna Conyers at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Conyers, Anna – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 19:09:57
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Anna Conyers
Sent 28/05/2019 7:09:57 PM

Fracking for gas is hazardous and needs to be rejected by the NT Government.

This work would go against the wishes of traditional owners who care for the land.
It will poison water and this will poison the animals, plants and soil over the years.
And burning the gas produced will only lead to more Carbon emissions into our atmosphere
causing environmental disaster and huge loss of both human and other life.
That is three good reasons to reject this proposal by Origin.
The only reason to go ahead is for profits for the rich. It will not mean long term jobs -
especially not for local people.
Please reject all fracking now.

Anna Conyers
*************
NSW 2650
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Conyers, Margaret – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 18:17:20
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Margaret Conyers
Sent 24/05/2019 6:17:20 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.
America is suffering from a plethora of fracking - this is also a country with massive drought
problems. Fracking uses a lot of water but at the expense of safe drinkable water. There are
NO alternatives to life saving water.
FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
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Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS

This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
margaret conyers
Karingal, Victoria, 3199, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by margaret conyers via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however margaret provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to margaret conyers at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cook, Damien – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 11:40:12
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Damien Cook
Sent 29/05/2019 11:40:12 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP. I want you to help to protect the land, water, health and
wellbeing of impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted regions if emissions
are not rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and
worst: extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many
Aboriginal people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration
wells, would signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas
industry, potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions
[2]. This would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and
beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Damien Cook
Fryerstown, Victoria, 3451, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Damien Cook via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Damien provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Damien Cook at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cook, Gerald – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 06:48:40
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Gerald Giles Cook
Sent 24/05/2019 6:48:40 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Gerald cook
Jindabyne, New South Wales, 2627, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Gerald Giles cook via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Gerald provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Gerald Giles cook at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cook, Jessica – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 09:56:30
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Jessica Cook
Sent 30/05/2019 9:56:30 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Jessica Cook
Camp Hill, Queensland, 4152, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Jessica Cook via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Jessica provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Jessica Cook at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cook, Julie – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 12:59:59
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Julie Cook
Sent 29/05/2019 12:59:59 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Julie Cook
Stockton, New South Wales, 2295, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Julie Cook via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact you
regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we have
set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************, however
Julie provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Julie Cook at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cook, Kaye – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 19:02:34
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Kaye Cook
Sent 28/05/2019 7:02:34 PM

I object to this project for the following reason;
It could trigger the beginning of an industry that is damaging to the environment, would
exacerbate the world's pollution problem and destroy the country of the traditional Aboriginal
owners.

Kaye Cook
*************
WA 6148

Page 784 of 1136



Cook, Marian – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 16:10:27
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Marian Cook
Sent 25/05/2019 4:10:27 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

___________________________
This email was sent by Marian Cook via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Marian provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Marian Cook at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cook, Patricia – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 20:59:55
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Patricia Cook
Sent 23/05/2019 8:59:55 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Patricia Cook
Redfern, New South Wales, 2016, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Patricia Cook via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Patricia provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Patricia Cook at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html

Page 789 of 1136



Cooke, Adrian – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 13:06:59
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Adrian Cooke
Sent 24/05/2019 1:06:59 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Adrian Cooke
Charlton, Queensland, 4350, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Adrian Cooke via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Adrian provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Adrian Cooke at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cooke, Adrian – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 08:39:33
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Adrian Cooke
Sent 25/05/2019 8:39:33 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Adrian Cooke
Westbrook, Queensland, 4350, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Adrian Cooke via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Adrian provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Adrian Cooke at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cooke, David – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 10:12:45
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From David Cooke
Sent 30/05/2019 10:12:45 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.
I don't understand how we have not learned from other countries experience and all the
dangers this process cause the environment. We should be a smarter country. This is our
pristine land. Let's keep it that way.
As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
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Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.

4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml
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[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf

Yours sincerely,
David Cooke
Nambour, Queensland, 4560, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by David Cooke via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however David provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to David Cooke at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cooke, Rod – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 07:25:12
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Rod Cooke
Sent 29/05/2019 7:25:12 AM

In a world where the environment has become the main issue affecting the well being of
mankind and the ecosystem we live in it is unbelievable that Origin Energy would have the
gall to short cut the proper process of scrutiny . Tell them to take their integrity elsewhere.

Rod Cooke
*************
TAS 7325
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Coombe, David – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 18:49:44
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From David Coombe
Sent 28/05/2019 6:49:44 PM

Write your submission here - use our talking points to the left to guide your submission.

David Coombe
*************
SA 5089
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Cooper, Cate – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 08:51:46
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Cate Cooper
Sent 24/05/2019 8:51:46 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Cate Cooper
Penola, South Australia, 5277, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Cate Cooper via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Cate provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Cate Cooper at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cooper, Debra – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 14:19:16
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Debra Cooper
Sent 24/05/2019 2:19:16 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Debra Cooper

___________________________
This email was sent by Debra Cooper via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Debra provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Debra Cooper at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cooper, Derek – Sunday, 26 May 2019 – 08:06:40
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Derek Cooper
Sent 26/05/2019 8:06:40 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Derek Cooper
Howard Springs, Northern Territory, 0835, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Derek Cooper via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Derek provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Derek Cooper at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cooper, Derek – Sunday, 26 May 2019 – 08:07:53
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Derek Cooper
Sent 26/05/2019 8:07:53 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Derek Cooper
Howard Springs, Northern Territory, 0835, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Derek Cooper via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Derek provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Derek Cooper at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cooper, Gabrielle – Monday, 27 May 2019 – 11:15:31
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Gabrielle Cooper
Sent 27/05/2019 11:15:31 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Gabrielle Cooper
Drummoyne, New South Wales, 2047, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Gabrielle Cooper via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Gabrielle provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Gabrielle Cooper at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cooper, Greg – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 19:01:18
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Greg Cooper
Sent 28/05/2019 7:01:18 PM

Don't allow our precious water basins to become polluted and destroyed for future
generations... please

Greg Cooper
*************
VIC 3065
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Cooper, John – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 13:13:22
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From John Cooper
Sent 24/05/2019 1:13:22 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS

Page 815 of 1136



This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
John Cooper
Craigmore,South Australia, 5114, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by John Cooper via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however John provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to John Cooper at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cooper, Maureen – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 18:36:09
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Maureen Cooper
Sent 28/05/2019 6:36:09 PM

Please don't allow Csg fracking in the Northern Territory as this will increase climate change
and pollute the land. Our wildlife will be poisoned by the toxic settling ponds and our First
Peoples will have their lives and culture disadvantaged. America has poisoned huge areas of
land with Csg fracking so we should learn from their experience and protect our land and
aquifers for future generations.

Maureen Cooper
*************
VIC 3747

Page 817 of 1136



Cooper, Merry – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 20:34:25
Subject Stop the Fracking
From Merry Cooper
Sent 28/05/2019 8:34:25 PM

Fracking destroys the country and water, as well as being a climate disaster. The Aboriginal
communities in the NT are opposed to fracking on their land. Please don't allow Origin to go
ahead against their wishes - we have already done enough damage to our indigenous people's
lands.

merry Cooper
*************
WA 6003
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Cooper, Peter – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 18:10:20
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Peter Cooper
Sent 25/05/2019 6:10:20 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Peter Cooper
Warriwillah, New South Wales, 2429, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Peter Cooper via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Peter provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Peter Cooper at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cooper, Samantha – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 02:16:02
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Samantha Cooper
Sent 30/05/2019 2:16:02 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Samantha Cooper
Neutral Bay, New South Wales, 2089, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Samantha Cooper via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Samantha provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Samantha Cooper at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cooper, Sean – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 15:43:09
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Sean Cooper
Sent 29/05/2019 3:43:09 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Sean Cooper
Aitkenvale, Queensland, 4814, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Sean Cooper via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Sean provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Sean Cooper at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cooper, Suzie – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 11:01:33
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Suzie Cooper
Sent 29/05/2019 11:01:33 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Suzie Cooper

___________________________
This email was sent by Suzie Cooper via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Suzie provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Suzie Cooper at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cooper, Sylvia – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 15:28:41
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Sylvia Cooper
Sent 28/05/2019 3:28:41 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

___________________________
This email was sent by Sylvia Cooper via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Sylvia provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Sylvia Cooper at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cooper-Williams, Liz – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 10:56:17
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Liz Cooper-Williams
Sent 29/05/2019 10:56:17 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Liz Cooper-Williams
Kenmore, Queensland, 4069, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Liz Cooper-Williams via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Liz provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Liz Cooper-Williams at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Coorey, Catherine – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 21:05:22
Subject Origin Energy Kyalla Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing Program EP117 N2
From Catherine Coorey
Sent 28/05/2019 9:05:22 PM

I am totally horrified that any responsible business would be considering this insane project.
The gas industries' peak body, the Australian Petroleum Production and Exploration
Association, has said there are over 200 trillion cubic feet of gas in the Northern Territory,
which is the equivalent to 50 power stations operating for thirty years.
Additionally, in March 2018, the 'Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern
Territory' noted that 'Aboriginal people from regional communities who made submissions to
the Panel almost universally expressed deep concern about, and strong opposition to, the
development of any onshore shale gas industry on their country.' The University of
Technology's Jumbunna Institute also found that, 'based on a review of publicly available
information, the report finds that most – if not all – exploration permits issued in the Northern
Territory for unconventional gas were issued in the absence of free, prior and informed
consent'.
Fracking is a dirty industry. The chemicals that are planned to be used will enter waterways
and are a threat to human, animal and plant life. Additionally, we cannot possibly have an
impact on reducing runaway global warming with a project like this. DO NOT ignore
indigenous communities' wishes. DO NOT PROCEED with this dangerous and dirty project.

Catherine Coorey
*************
NSW 2481
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Cootes, Megan – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 19:46:31
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Megan Cootes
Sent 30/05/2019 7:46:31 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Megan Cootes
Coramba, New South Wales, 2450, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Megan Cootes via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Megan provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Megan Cootes at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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COPE, JULIE – Monday, 27 May 2019 – 11:11:53
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From JULIE COPE
Sent 27/05/2019 11:11:53 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

___________________________
This email was sent by JULIE COPE via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however JULIE provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to JULIE COPE at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Copeman, Gai – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 07:27:08
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Gai Copeman
Sent 30/05/2019 7:27:08 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I believe that sone energy companies are arrogant and short sighted when it comes to the short
and long term effect their processes have on people and the environment. From all I have read
and seen fracking is a disaster to both.

I agree with the submission below.

Gai Copeman

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
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Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.

4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286
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[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf

___________________________
This email was sent by Gai Copeman via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Gai provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Gai Copeman at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Copping, Vicki – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 09:30:22
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Vicki Copping
Sent 30/05/2019 9:30:22 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf

Page 845 of 1136



Yours sincerely,
Vicki Copping
Nelly Bay, Queensland, 4819, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Vicki Copping via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Vicki provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Vicki Copping at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Corbin, Cindy – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 17:30:49
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Cindy Corbin
Sent 23/05/2019 5:30:49 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Cindy Corbin
Goolwa, South Australia, 5214, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Cindy Corbin via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Cindy provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Cindy Corbin at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cordell, Marguerite – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 12:02:30
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Marguerite Cordell
Sent 24/05/2019 12:02:30 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Marguerite Cordell
Benloch, Victoria, 3435, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Marguerite Cordell via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Marguerite provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Marguerite Cordell at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cormick, Lyn – Sunday, 26 May 2019 – 07:25:21
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Lyn Mc Cormick
Sent 26/05/2019 7:25:21 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

I have lived in East Arnhem Land and worked as a teacher for close on a decade.

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental

Page 852 of 1136



Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.

4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml
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[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf

Yours sincerely,
Lyn Mc Cormick

___________________________
This email was sent by Lyn Mc Cormick via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Lyn provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Lyn Mc Cormick at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Corner, Judith – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 20:34:15
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Judith Corner
Sent 30/05/2019 8:34:15 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

I appreciate the opportunity to make a submission regarding this very important issue.

I am sending this submission to request that the Department of Environment and Natural
Resources reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities for the current inhabitants as well as future generations.

As an Australian, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin Energy’s
plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object to the
approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

We now know what happened in California particularly in regard to its water after fracking in
that US state and we have enough information to make sure that it does not happen in
Australia.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

Yours sincerely,
Judith Corner
Tamborine Mountain, Queensland, 4272, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Judith Corner via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Judith provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Judith Corner at *************.
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To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html

Page 857 of 1136



Corney, Helen – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 11:30:13
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Helen Corney
Sent 24/05/2019 11:30:13 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am a customer of Origin and am writing to express my objection to the Environmental
Management Plan submitted by Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern
Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.
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BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS

This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Helen Corney
Kew East, Victoria, 3102, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Helen Corney via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Helen provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Helen Corney at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html

Page 859 of 1136



Corney, Sue – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 17:32:44
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Sue Corney
Sent 23/05/2019 5:32:44 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf

Page 861 of 1136



Yours sincerely,
Sue Corney

___________________________
This email was sent by Sue Corney via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Sue provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Sue Corney at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Corrigan, Paul – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 00:02:33
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Paul Corrigan
Sent 24/05/2019 12:02:33 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Paul Corrigan
Warragul, Victoria, 3820, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Paul Corrigan via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Paul provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Paul Corrigan at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Corrigan, Sean – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 03:21:57
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Sean Corrigan
Sent 25/05/2019 3:21:57 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Sean Corrigan
Trinity Beach, Queensland, 4879, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Sean Corrigan via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Sean provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Sean Corrigan at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Corrigan, Sean – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 09:39:40
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Sean Corrigan
Sent 29/05/2019 9:39:40 AM

I object to this project and don't believe it should go ahead. Be sure to include your postcode.
This project is a threat to our safe climate future.
Origin's exploration well has the potential to lead to hundreds of Origin's shale gas wells in
full production phase, and to the further development of Northern Territory's unconventional
gas industry, which NT government sources have said could mean over 6000 gas wells.1 The
gas industries' peak body, the Australian Petroleum Production and Exploration Association,
has said there are over 200 trillion cubic feet of gas in the Northern Territory, which is the
equivalent to 50 power stations operating for thirty years.2 We simply cannot afford such a
climate disaster. The fracking processes uses dangerous chemicals that represent a threat to
human health, the natural environment and water sources.
Origin have provided a list of chemicals that will be stored and used on the site of their
exploration well. Many of these chemicals do not have available health data.3 These
chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in the fracking processes. The
health and environmental risks of the dangerous chemicals used in the fracking processes are
exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks.
Origin is proposing using open tanks to store liquids that flow back after the fracking process,
which will be millions of litres. This is in spite of the fact that the Northern Territory fracking
inquiry recommended that all polluted water from the fracking process be stored in closed
tanks to minimise risks to human life and the natural environment.4 There are serious
concerns as to whether Traditional Owners have been able to provide free, prior and informed
consent to the fracking process.
The Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory stated that,
'Aboriginal people from regional communities who made submissions to the Panel almost
universally expressed deep concern about, and strong opposition to, the development of any
onshore shale gas industry on their country.'4 This included communities in the Beetaloo
basin where this exploration well will be located. A report from the Jumbunna Institute at
UTS, 5 has questioned whether communities have been provided adequate information about
the fracking processes, leading to the conclusion that 'based on a review of publicly available
information, the report finds that most – if not all – exploration permits issued in the Northern
Territory for unconventional gas were issued in the absence of free, prior and informed
consent'. In this context it is not appropriate to proceed with the current exploration permit
without further consultation.

Sean Corrigan
*************
QLD 4879
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Corson, Suzanne – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 08:19:57
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Suzanne Corson
Sent 30/05/2019 8:19:57 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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___________________________
This email was sent by Suzanne Corson via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Suzanne provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Suzanne Corson at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Corston, Adrian – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 11:06:27
Subject Submission regarding Origin's fracking plans
From Adrian Corston
Sent 29/05/2019 11:06:27 AM

Hi there,

I am writing to make a submission objecting to Origin's plans to frank and drill in the NT.

I am particularly concerned that Origin will not act in a manner to properly protect land
resources and that they will ignore indigenous concerns. The significant dangers of fracking
are well documented and understood internationally and by Australian experts, and they are
not acceptable. Time and time again companies undertaking endeavours such as these have a
significant negative affect on native flora and fauna. Underground water sources are adversely
affected by fracking and similar mining operations. Sacred Aboriginal sites are destroyed.
Fracking results in damage to the earth's climate and exacerbates the climate emergency that
has been acknowledged as the single greatest threat to mankind by all levels of government
world-wide. This proposal is utterly unnecessary, since low impact "renewable" energy
sources are incredibly rapidly overtaking traditional sources. In only a few years from now the
approval of EMPs like this will be looked upon as foolish, short-si
ghted errors.

As a South Australian, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin’s plans
for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object to the approval
of this EMP for the reasons outlined above.

Yours sincerely,
Adrian Corston
Netherby, South Australia, 5062, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Adrian Corston via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Adrian provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Adrian Corston at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cosgrove, Katie – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 07:30:29
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Katie Cosgrove
Sent 29/05/2019 7:30:29 AM

Please for the love of all the children and future generations stop this project.
It is a threat to our safe climate future and the only planet we have. You can do better.

katie cosgrove
*************
QLD 4032
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Cosgrove, Marie – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 12:09:52
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Marie Cosgrove
Sent 29/05/2019 12:09:52 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Marie Cosgrove
????, ???????????, 2044, ???????

___________________________
This email was sent by Marie Cosgrove via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Marie provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Marie Cosgrove at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cosgrove, Therese – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 12:29:27
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Therese Cosgrove
Sent 24/05/2019 12:29:27 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Therese Cosgrove

___________________________
This email was sent by Therese Cosgrove via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Therese provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Therese Cosgrove at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cossey, Martin – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 12:43:02
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Martin Cossey
Sent 25/05/2019 12:43:02 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Martin Cossey
Secret Harbour, Western Australia, 6173, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Martin Cossey via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Martin provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Martin Cossey at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Costa, Hilary – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 03:50:47
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) and a plea for

an end to destructive fracking
From Hilary Da Costa
Sent 30/05/2019 3:50:47 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Hilary Da Costa
Woollahra, New South Wales, 2025, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Hilary Da Costa via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Hilary provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Hilary Da Costa at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Costigan, Jane – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 17:08:18
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Jane Costigan
Sent 29/05/2019 5:08:18 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Jane Costigan
Blacktown, New South Wales, 2148, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Jane Costigan via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Jane provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Jane Costigan at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cotgrove, Brian – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 11:35:01
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Brian Cotgrove
Sent 25/05/2019 11:35:01 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Brian Cotgrove
Birkdale, Queensland, 4159, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Brian Cotgrove via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Brian provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Brian Cotgrove at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cother, Eric – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 07:15:16
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Eric Cother
Sent 29/05/2019 7:15:16 AM

There is no sound scientific basis that allows for fracking when the biological implications are
considered. Climate change due to CO2 emissions is proven - fracking will only result in
more climate-changing gases. Even if approved, the storing of waste water in open dams is a
time bomb given the increasing incidence of severe storms; leakage and overflows are
inevitable.
Fracking should not be allowed.
Dr Eric Cother

eric cother
*************
NSW 2800
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Cotsakis, George – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 20:48:27
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From George Cotsakis
Sent 23/05/2019 8:48:27 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
george cotsakis

___________________________
This email was sent by george cotsakis via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however george provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to george cotsakis at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cotter, Mary – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 10:55:03
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Mary Cotter
Sent 29/05/2019 10:55:03 AM

I most strongly object to this project and firmly believe that it should not go ahead. In the
longer term, this project is a threat to our safe climate future, but on top of that, as you would
be well aware, the fracking processes uses dangerous chemicals that represent a threat to
human health, the natural environment and water sources.
The health and environmental risks of these dangerous chemicals are exacerbated by the use
of open storage tanks, where birds and water fowl would have free access to this toxic water.

Mary Cotter
*************
VIC 3241
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Cotter, Micheal – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 19:48:19
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Micheal Cotter
Sent 29/05/2019 7:48:19 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Micheal Cotter
Karabar, New South Wales, 2620, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Micheal Cotter via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Micheal provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Micheal Cotter at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cottier, Madison – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 07:53:38
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Madison Cottier
Sent 24/05/2019 7:53:38 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Madison Cottier
Coburg, Victoria, 3058, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Madison Cottier via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Madison provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Madison Cottier at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cottle, Linda – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 11:59:41
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Linda Cottle
Sent 24/05/2019 11:59:41 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

Australia, what are you thinking.... letting toxic chemicals pollute your water supplies.
Damaging the environment like this is just NOT sensible or ethical.....

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
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Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS

This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

___________________________
This email was sent by Linda Cottle via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Linda provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Linda Cottle at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cotton, Liz – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 22:11:33
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Liz Cotton
Sent 23/05/2019 10:11:33 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Liz Cotton

___________________________
This email was sent by Liz Cotton via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact you
regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we have
set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************, however
Liz provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Liz Cotton at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Couch, Tui – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 20:45:42
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environment Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling and

Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Tui Couch
Sent 28/05/2019 8:45:42 PM

This project is a threat to our safe climate future.
The fracking processes uses dangerous chemicals that represent a threat to human health, the
natural environment and water sources.
The health and environmental risks of the dangerous chemicals used in the fracking processes
are exacerbated by the use open storage tanks.
The traditional owners need to be consulted appropriately.

Tui Couch
*************
QLD 4073
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Couchman, Leigh – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 18:55:19
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Leigh Couchman
Sent 29/05/2019 6:55:19 PM

Hello,

Even though I reside in Tasmania (7304), I object to this project and don't believe it should go
ahead. This project is a threat to our safe climate future.

The fracking processes uses dangerous chemicals that represent a threat to human health, the
natural environment and water sources.

The health and environmental risks of the dangerous chemicals used in the fracking processes
are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks.

There are serious concerns as to whether Traditional Owners have been able to provide free,
prior and informed consent to the fracking process.

Leigh couchman
*************
NSW 2577
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Coulstock, Alistair – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 19:39:22
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Alistair Coulstock
Sent 29/05/2019 7:39:22 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Alistair Coulstock
Frenchs Forest, New South Wales, 2086, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Alistair Coulstock via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Alistair provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Alistair Coulstock at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Coulter, Daniel – Monday, 27 May 2019 – 20:46:08
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Daniel Coulter
Sent 27/05/2019 8:46:08 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Daniel Coulter
Preston, Victoria, 3072, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Daniel Coulter via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Daniel provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Daniel Coulter at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Coulthard, Adrian – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 19:42:44
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Adrian Coulthard
Sent 29/05/2019 7:42:44 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Adrian Coulthard
Christies Beach, South Australia, 5165, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Adrian Coulthard via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Adrian provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Adrian Coulthard at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cound, Emma – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 13:28:07
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Emma Cound
Sent 28/05/2019 1:28:07 PM

For attention of the Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to object to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by Origin Energy for
the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

We are we filling Australia, our waterways and our soils with poison. FRACKING
SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The list of substances Origin want to use have known health impacts, shown by an
independent review. These substances are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation,
tissue damage, burns, and cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.
Some of the chemical have NO health data available which is a grave cause for concern. We
did not know asbestos was fatal until it was too late. There is no excuse for lax health data
when the citizens and environment are forcibly affected.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid containing heavy metals, fracking chemicals and radioactive material.

Threatened birdlife visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and the tanks should not be
open and accessible to birdlife at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause huge downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have FAILED to talk to tourism
operators about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living
downstream from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS

This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Page 915 of 1136



Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Emma Cound
Bells Beach, Victoria, 3228, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Emma Cound via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Emma provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Emma Cound at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Counsel, Ava – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 20:08:44
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Ava Counsel
Sent 29/05/2019 8:08:44 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Ava Counsel
Kensington, Victoria, 3031, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Ava Counsel via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Ava provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Ava Counsel at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html

Page 919 of 1136



Courtney, Inge – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 07:31:03
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Inge Courtney
Sent 24/05/2019 7:31:03 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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___________________________
This email was sent by Inge Courtney via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Inge provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Inge Courtney at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Courtney-Prior, Kathryn – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 14:49:30
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Kathryn Courtney-Prior
Sent 24/05/2019 2:49:30 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
kathryn Courtney-Prior
Ashfield, New South Wales, 2131, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by kathryn Courtney-Prior via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however kathryn provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to kathryn Courtney-Prior at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Couteur, Caroline – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 16:13:20
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Caroline Le Couteur
Sent 30/05/2019 4:13:20 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

THis submission is to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
absolutely reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

More fossil fuels are incompatible with keeping global warming to 2 degrees or less. Don't do
it!
Plus its bad for the local environment and bad for the indigenous owners.

Yours sincerely,
Caroline le couteur
Phillip, Australian Capital Territory, 2606, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Caroline le couteur via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Caroline provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Caroline le couteur at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cowan, Sandi – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 22:16:34
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Sandi Cowan
Sent 23/05/2019 10:16:34 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Sandi Cowan
Vermont, Victoria, 3133, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Sandi Cowan via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Sandi provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Sandi Cowan at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cowden, Lucinda – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 12:05:47
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Lucinda Cowden
Sent 24/05/2019 12:05:47 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Lucinda Cowden
Safety Beach, Victoria, 3936, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Lucinda Cowden via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Lucinda provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Lucinda Cowden at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cowell, Charles – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 11:18:27
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Charles Cowell
Sent 29/05/2019 11:18:27 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the Australian community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated
with Origin Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I
strongly object to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Charles Cowell
Wangoom, Victoria, 3279, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Charles Cowell via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Charles provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Charles Cowell at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cowie, David – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 12:03:05
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From David Cowie
Sent 28/05/2019 12:03:05 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
David & Janette Cowie
Fairlight, New South Wales, 2094, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by David Cowie via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however David provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to David Cowie at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cowle, Nicci – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 17:50:22
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Nicci Cowle
Sent 23/05/2019 5:50:22 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Nicci Cowle

___________________________
This email was sent by Nicci Cowle via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Nicci provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Nicci Cowle at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cowley-Martin, Jessica – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 14:47:30
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Jessica Cowley-Martin
Sent 28/05/2019 2:47:30 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

As a customer of Origin energy and someone with a deep appreciation of nature and the crisis
we now face as we unrelentingly destroy the natural world ( our life support system on this
planet ! ) , I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan
submitted by Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.
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BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS

This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Jessica Cowley-Martin
Caparra, New South Wales, 2429, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Jessica Cowley-Martin via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Jessica provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Jessica Cowley-Martin at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cowling, Maggie – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 11:48:22
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Maggie Cowling
Sent 29/05/2019 11:48:22 AM

Given the predictions for global warming, it is patently obvious that the world cannot afford
to start new gas production. If Origin goes ahead with their exploration well, it could lead to
hundreds of wells going into production. We need negative net emissions, not increased
emissions. In addition to the emissions, the chemicals used in the process will endanger the
exquisite, precious environment of the Northern Territory and the land of the traditional
owners who have been strongly opposing gas exploration - and may not even have been fully
informed as to the risk implications of exploration, including the use of open storage tanks.
This is not the time to be approving such a plan - it is a time to be focussing on safe clean
energies and programs that enhance our future and provide jobs for all.

Maggie Cowling
*************
VIC 3058
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Cowling, Ray – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 20:48:10
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Ray Cowling
Sent 28/05/2019 8:48:10 PM

Write your submission here - use our talking points to the left to guide your submission.

Ray Cowling
*************
VIC 3003
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Cox, Andrew – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 21:01:31
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Andrew Cox
Sent 29/05/2019 9:01:31 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Andrew Cox
Hughesdale, Victoria, 3166, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Andrew Cox via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Andrew provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Andrew Cox at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cox, Merilyn – Monday, 27 May 2019 – 14:20:24
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Merilyn Cox
Sent 27/05/2019 2:20:24 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Merilyn Cox
Pomonal, Victoria, 3381, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Merilyn Cox via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Merilyn provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Merilyn Cox at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cox, Vicki – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 18:56:07
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Vicki Cox
Sent 28/05/2019 6:56:07 PM

I oppose fracking. The fracking processes uses dangerous chemicals that represent a threat to
human health, the natural environment and water sources.
Origin have provided a list of chemicals that will be stored and used on the site of their
exploration well. Many of these chemicals do not have available health data. These chemicals
must be adequately health tested before being used in the fracking processes.
The health and environmental risks of the dangerous chemicals used in the fracking processes
are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks.
Fracking is not a safe response to our growing energy needs. Regards, Vicki

Vicki Cox
*************
NSW 2093
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Crabb, Sweeney – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 15:15:33
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Sweeney Crabb
Sent 29/05/2019 3:15:33 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Sweeney Crabb
St Kilda, Victoria, 3182, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Sweeney Crabb via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Sweeney provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Sweeney Crabb at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Crafti, Timothy – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 15:27:52
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Timothy Crafti
Sent 30/05/2019 3:27:52 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Timothy Crafti
Carlton, Victoria, 3053, Australien

___________________________
This email was sent by Timothy Crafti via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Timothy provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Timothy Crafti at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Craig, Helena – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 10:24:51
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Helena Craig
Sent 30/05/2019 10:24:51 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf

Page 957 of 1136



Yours sincerely,
Helena Craig
Wellington Point, Queensland, 4160, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Helena Craig via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Helena provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Helena Craig at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html

Page 958 of 1136



Cramb, Margaret – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 18:41:57
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Margaret Cramb
Sent 28/05/2019 6:41:57 PM

I do not believe this project should proceed. The fracking processes uses dangerous chemicals
that represent a threat to human health, the natural environment and water sources. Many of
these chemicals do not have available health data, so their risk to health is unknown. The risk
is multiplied by use of open storage tanks for poluted water. I believe we have no right to put
the health of the local people in such danger. Thank you for considering your responsibility in
this.

Margaret Cramb
*************
QLD 4503
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Cramond, Mark – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 12:12:05
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Mark Cramond
Sent 29/05/2019 12:12:05 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Mark Cramond
Parkside, South Australia, 5063, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Mark Cramond via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Mark provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Mark Cramond at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cramond, Mark – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 12:13:40
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Mark Cramond
Sent 29/05/2019 12:13:40 PM

Write your submission here - use our talking points to guide your submission.

Mark Cramond
*************
SA 5063
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Crampton, Rick – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 12:23:12
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Rick Crampton
Sent 24/05/2019 12:23:12 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Rick Crampton
Thomastown, Victoria, 3074, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Rick Crampton via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Rick provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Rick Crampton at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cranley, Grace – Monday, 27 May 2019 – 10:16:59
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Grace Cranley
Sent 27/05/2019 10:16:59 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING aSUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Grace Cranley
Nightcliff, Northern Territory, 0810, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Grace Cranley via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Grace provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Grace Cranley at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Craw, Peter – Monday, 27 May 2019 – 09:59:58
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Peter Craw
Sent 27/05/2019 9:59:58 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Peter Craw
Douglas, Queensland, 4814, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Peter Craw via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact you
regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we have
set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************, however
Peter provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-TO
field.

Please reply to Peter Craw at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Crawford, Helen – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 11:45:38
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Helen Crawford
Sent 29/05/2019 11:45:38 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Helen Crawford
Yamanto, Queensland, 4305, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Helen Crawford via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Helen provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Helen Crawford at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Crawford-Condie, Kenneth – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 22:25:26
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Kenneth Crawford-Condie
Sent 28/05/2019 10:25:26 PM

Origin. Please DO NOT start fracking in the Northern Territory. This is an impending
dangerous exercise which must not go ahead. The dangerous chemicals used are a threat to
human health, water sources and the natural environment. As some of the proposed chemicals
do not have health data available, using open storage tanks for them exacerbates this risk.
Origin Energy is ignoring the deep concerns and opposition of the Traditional Owners of this
country to the fracking of gas. This must not go ahead.

Kenneth Crawford-Condie
*************
VIC 3004
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Crawley, Joan – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 15:02:38
Subject No to Origin’s Kyalla fracking in the NT
From Joan Crawley
Sent 24/05/2019 3:02:38 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I have seen what toxic destruction fracking does to the land in NSW and in Queensland it has
destroyed precious farmland and poisoned water.

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
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Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS

This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Joan Crawley
• Katoomba DC, New South Wales, 2780, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Joan Crawley via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Joan provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Joan Crawley at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Crebert, Ben – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 19:53:29
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Ben Crebert
Sent 23/05/2019 7:53:29 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Ben Crebert

___________________________
This email was sent by Ben Crebert via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Ben provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Ben Crebert at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Creevey, Harry – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 07:29:10
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Harry Creevey
Sent 29/05/2019 7:29:10 AM

An independent inquiry into fracking in the Northern Territory found Aboriginal communities
overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land, but Origin is pushing ahead with their dirty
fracking plans. I believe land rights should come before money

Harry Creevey
*************
QLD 4207
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Crellin, John – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 18:07:35
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From John Crellin
Sent 24/05/2019 6:07:35 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
John Crellin
White Gums, Northern Territory, 0870, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by John Crellin via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however John provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to John Crellin at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html

Page 982 of 1136



Crennan, Lee – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 20:23:57
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Lee Crennan
Sent 28/05/2019 8:23:57 PM

I am a fifth generation Australian of Irish descent. My family were one of the first white
settlers in remote areas of NSW Victoria and South Australia.
We survived and we fourished but we were responsible for ignorant farming practices that did
not suit this ancient land and we settled on country without permission of the indigenous
owners. Slowly we have learnt from our mistakes and all branches of the family are now keen
consevationists and respect the rights knowledge and needs of the first Australians.
Although you may not have the understanding that has come from my family’s experience, I
am asking you to listen to the people of NT who who do not want fracking on their land.
Origin Energy is out to make short term profit with very long term disastrous consequences. I
am sure you must be able to see this.
Please act responsibly and reject Origin’s application for an exploration well.
Australia is rich with energy alternatives that will provide long term economic and
environmental security. Energy companies will try for the fast easy option and if this
destructive path is blocked by intelligent government, they will invest in clean renewable
alternatives.
You have a mandate to protect our natural assets and ensure sustainable and socially
responsible development. Please act accordingly.

Lee Crennan
*************
NSW 2295
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Crick, Susie – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 07:46:30
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Susie Crick
Sent 24/05/2019 7:46:30 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Susie Crick
Coledale, New South Wales, 2515, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Susie Crick via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Susie provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Susie Crick at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Crick, Susie – Monday, 27 May 2019 – 06:29:25
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Susie Crick
Sent 27/05/2019 6:29:25 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Susie Crick
Clifton, New South Wales, 2515, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Susie Crick via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Susie provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Susie Crick at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cripps, Denise – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 11:56:53
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Denise Cripps
Sent 29/05/2019 11:56:53 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
************* Cripps
Tranmere, Tasmania, 7018, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Denise Cripps via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Denise provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Denise Cripps at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cripps, Jarrod – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 21:24:00
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Jarrod Cripps
Sent 28/05/2019 9:24:00 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Jarrod Cripps
Dunalley, Tasmania, 7177, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Jarrod Cripps via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Jarrod provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Jarrod Cripps at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Crisp, Robert – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 18:10:23
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Robert Crisp
Sent 23/05/2019 6:10:23 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Robert Crisp
Holt, Australian Capital Territory, 2615, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Robert Crisp via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Robert provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Robert Crisp at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Crocker, Michael – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 01:38:30
Subject Submission in opposition to Origin Energy’s (EMP)
From Michael Crocker
Sent 30/05/2019 1:38:30 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Dear Department of Environment and Natural Resources,

WHY I OPPOSE FRACKING

The problems:

-Aboriginal consent
-Fracking and the effects on the water table and the environment
-Fracking and human health
-Pipeline gas leakage safety and climate risks
-Origin's rejection of shareholder proposals for climate accountability and transparency in the
2019 AGM

Whilst gas is a useful tool in bridging the transition from coal to renewables, it must be
managed extremely carefully. The science and safety behind fracking is unclear in terms of
the chemicals used and the long term effect on the environment and human health. Fracking
has destroyed whole communities in Queensland, as seen in the film 'Frack Man', forcing
residents to relocate despite their properties losing significant market value, due to the
detrimental health effects of fracking. Toxic gas and/or chemicals leaked into the air and the
Condamine river, even causing sections to become flammable!

Even a tiny amount of unburned gas leaking, such as in the pipeline, may exceed any
emissions saved by using gas over coal or oil. Studies in the US show that as little as 1-4% of
estimated reserves leaking is the threshold for causing more greenhouse gas emissions than
are saved. This is because methane is a much more potent greenhouse gas than carbon
dioxide, and when methane reacts with water, it becomes even more potent again. Gas
recovery in the Northern Territory poses an unprecedented threat to the global climate, with
many estimates stating the relative emissions are five times more than the coal reserves
present in the proposed Adani Carmichael mine. Even if one fracking drilling procedure or
fracked gas well were to go wrong, it would cause irreversible damage to the local
environment.

Aboriginal consent and consultation is an ongoing process which must be treated with the
utmost care and respect. Even if consent is given, how Origin plans to rehabilitate fracking
sites and relevant contractual obligations and timeframes surrounding this remains unclear.

Additionally, having read Origin's shareholder report regarding the 2019 AGM, I am
disappointed at how the board has handled matters relating to Aboriginal consent, as well as
emissions targets and transparency highlighted by shareholder proposals. The Origin board of
directors must work with ALL shareholders and ALL relevant stakeholders, including the
Australian public, if Origin is to improve its reputation going forward.
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Our future relies on energy companies making the tough choices today to invest in the energy
industry of tomorrow.

Yours sincerely,

Michael Crocker (25 years)

Reply address:
*************

___________________________
This email was sent by Michael Crocker via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Michael provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Michael Crocker at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Crogan, Peta – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 23:57:16
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Peta Crogan
Sent 28/05/2019 11:57:16 PM

Dear Madam or Sir,
I wish to strongly object to ANY fracking or fracking exploration in the Northern Territory.
This land is home to the greatest number of our traditional elders living in community and
continuing traditional culture. With so many young Aborigine people struggling for
connection and belonging, maintaining culture among our first people is imperative. Further,
the traditional owners have not given permission for this activity to happen on their lands, so
any exploration is trespass.
It is also pristine country, filled with natural wonders such as Mataranka Springs and other
wonders. Of particular concern are the plans to 'explore' areas near Katherin and Mataranka
springs where water from deep Artesianal basins seep to the surface. ANY contamination of
this water will seep not only along these waterways, killing plants, fish and other native
animals, but it has the potential to flow back into the deep springs source, contaminating large
parts of Australia.
I believe ANY fracking or exploration of these delicate areas should be banned and again
wish to strongly oppose any fracking activities by Origin in the Northern Territory, or
anywhere in Australia. This practice is not safe and the short term gains will contribute to
devastating long-term damage to our atmosphere, natural resources, native animals, native
people and planet.

Peta Crogan
*************
WA 6160
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Crombach, Felicity – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 13:13:38
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Felicity Crombach
Sent 29/05/2019 1:13:38 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

Like many other Australians, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members especially children at risk,
including communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond. This includes having the facts presented to them in their
own languages.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Felicity Crombach
Newcomb, Victoria, 3219, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Felicity Crombach via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Felicity provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Felicity Crombach at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html

Page 1002 of 1136



Crombie, Diana – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 15:23:08
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Diana Crombie
Sent 29/05/2019 3:23:08 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Diana Crombie
Malvern, Victoria, 3144, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Diana Crombie via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Diana provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Diana Crombie at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cromie, Lynette – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 08:19:45
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Lynette Cromie
Sent 25/05/2019 8:19:45 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Lynette Cromie

___________________________
This email was sent by Lynette Cromie via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Lynette provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Lynette Cromie at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Crompton, Karen – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 11:31:59
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Karen Crompton
Sent 29/05/2019 11:31:59 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Karen Crompton

___________________________
This email was sent by Karen Crompton via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Karen provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Karen Crompton at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Crompton, Stephen – Monday, 27 May 2019 – 09:14:54
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Stephen Crompton
Sent 27/05/2019 9:14:54 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Stephen Crompton
New South Wales, 2357, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Stephen Crompton via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Stephen provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Stephen Crompton at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cropley, Jennifer – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 15:30:14
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Jennifer Cropley
Sent 28/05/2019 3:30:14 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Jennifer Cropley
Wistow, South Australia, 5251, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Jennifer Cropley via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Jennifer provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Jennifer Cropley at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Crossland, Bill – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 16:00:34
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Bill Crossland
Sent 29/05/2019 4:00:34 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Bill Crossland
Springwood, New South Wales, 2777, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Bill Crossland via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Bill provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Bill Crossland at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Crossland, Jacquie – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 07:22:11
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Jacquie Crossland
Sent 29/05/2019 7:22:11 AM

Please do not support fracking in the nt

jacquie Crossland
*************
SA 5031
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Crossland, Neil – Monday, 27 May 2019 – 14:06:30
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Neil Crossland
Sent 27/05/2019 2:06:30 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Neil Crossland
Winfield, Queensland, 4670, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Neil Crossland via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Neil provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Neil Crossland at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Crosweller, David – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 12:04:35
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From David Crosweller
Sent 24/05/2019 12:04:35 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns. David Crosweller

___________________________
This email was sent by David Crosweller via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however David provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to David Crosweller at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Crouch, Tiana – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 15:23:18
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Tiana Crouch
Sent 29/05/2019 3:23:18 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.

Page 1023 of 1136



4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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___________________________
This email was sent by Tiana Crouch via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Tiana provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Tiana Crouch at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Crowe, Carol – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 20:12:33
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Carol Crowe
Sent 28/05/2019 8:12:33 PM

I strongly object to Origin Energy’s Kyalla Drilling & Hydraulic Fracturing plans.
The chemicals used in fracking process are highly dangerous and would impact on the health
of our environment and the natural world.
It would be a disaster for a safe climate if this project goes ahead.
I am also concerned that the Traditional Owners were not appropriately consulted and
therefore have not given consent to this proposal.
Sincerely,
Carol Crowe

Carol Crowe
*************
VIC 3666
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Crowe, Heather – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 17:38:41
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Heather Crowe
Sent 25/05/2019 5:38:41 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS

Page 1027 of 1136



This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

___________________________
This email was sent by heather crowe via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however heather provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to heather crowe at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Crowley, Nick – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 14:55:36
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Nick Crowley
Sent 30/05/2019 2:55:36 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Nick Crowley

___________________________
This email was sent by Nick Crowley via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Nick provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Nick Crowley at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Croxford, Kimberley – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 14:55:35
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Kimberley Croxford
Sent 25/05/2019 2:55:35 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Kimberley Croxford
Preston, Victoria, 3072, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Kimberley Croxford via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Kimberley provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Kimberley Croxford at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Croxon, Pauline – Sunday, 26 May 2019 – 04:51:06
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Pauline Croxon
Sent 26/05/2019 4:51:06 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I agree with the Lock the Gate submission as follows and if Origin wants to have ANY
environmental credibility it will give up this plan!

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
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Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS

This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Pauline Croxon
Earlwood , New South Wales, 2206, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Pauline Croxon via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Pauline provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Pauline Croxon at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Croz, Michelle – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 16:22:12
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Michelle Croz
Sent 29/05/2019 4:22:12 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.

Page 1037 of 1136



4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Michelle Croz
Taylors Lakes, Victoria, 3038, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Michelle Croz via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Michelle provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Michelle Croz at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cruz, Carmen – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 13:42:00
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Carmen Cruz
Sent 24/05/2019 1:42:00 PM

Hello

I’m writing to say that I appear fracking. It had a lot of dangerous effects to the environment.
I want to have children and I want them to live in a clean planet.
We can’t continue like this because these resources are finite. The definition of finite is that it
has to stop at some point. So, should we stop once all is destroyed or should we stop before
that?
Personally I think before is he better option.
We need to invent an alternative anyway (since the resources are finite), so why me do that
sooner rather than later and still keep our pristine environment which has so many good
things about it, including but not limited to production the oxygen that we breathe, the water
that we drink and other things like tourism.
It’s just logical. I can’t really see the logic in destroying it all and then saying “oh what do we
do now, hmmm we’ll have to invent some other way to get energy”. That’s illogical, stupid
and unfair to the people who like the pristine environment.

I’m sure you have some smart people in your company who can think about a cleaner and
kinder way to produce energy. Anything is possible, don’t limit yourselves to the old ways
that are destroying life.

Thank you,
Carmen

___________________________
This email was sent by Carmen Cruz via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Carmen provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Carmen Cruz at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html

Page 1040 of 1136



Cruz, James – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 13:36:55
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From James Cruz
Sent 24/05/2019 1:36:55 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
James Cruz
Pagewood, New South Wales, 2035, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by James Cruz via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however James provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to James Cruz at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html

Page 1042 of 1136



Cruz, James – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 14:00:25
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From James Cruz
Sent 24/05/2019 2:00:25 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
James Cruz
Maroubra, New South Wales, 2035, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by James Cruz via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however James provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to James Cruz at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cruz, Marian – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 00:54:34
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Marian Cruz
Sent 25/05/2019 12:54:34 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Marian CRuz
Merced, California, 95348, United States

___________________________
This email was sent by Marian CRuz via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Marian provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Marian CRuz at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cryer, Brian – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 15:27:24
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Brian Cryer
Sent 24/05/2019 3:27:24 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Brian Cryer
Yerrinbool, New South Wales, 2575, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Brian Cryer via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Brian provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Brian Cryer at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cucinotta, Juanita – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 11:00:20
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Juanita Cucinotta
Sent 29/05/2019 11:00:20 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Juanita Cucinotta

___________________________
This email was sent by Juanita Cucinotta via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Juanita provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Juanita Cucinotta at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cuinn, Emilie-Oraylia – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 19:23:35
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Emilie-Oraylia Cuinn
Sent 30/05/2019 7:23:35 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Emilie-Oraylia Cuinn
Kensington, Victoria, 3031, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Emilie-Oraylia Cuinn via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Emilie-Oraylia provided an email address (*************) which
we included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Emilie-Oraylia Cuinn at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html

Page 1055 of 1136



Cullen, Joelle – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 14:21:11
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Joelle Cullen
Sent 24/05/2019 2:21:11 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Joelle Cullen
Castaways Beach, Queensland, 4567, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Joelle Cullen via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Joelle provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Joelle Cullen at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cullen, Sal – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 17:24:36
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Sal Cullen
Sent 30/05/2019 5:24:36 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Sal Cullen
Newtown, New South Wales, 2042, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Sal Cullen via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact you
regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we have
set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************, however
Sal provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Sal Cullen at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Culley, Alexandra – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 05:21:33
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Alexandra Culley
Sent 29/05/2019 5:21:33 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Alexandra Culley
Darwin DC, Northern Territory, 0820, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Alexandra Culley via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Alexandra provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Alexandra Culley at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cully, Moira – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 12:20:51
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Moira Cully
Sent 29/05/2019 12:20:51 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Moira Cully
Abbotsford, Victoria, 3067, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Moira Cully via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Moira provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Moira Cully at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cully, Violet – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 14:22:27
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Violet Cully
Sent 29/05/2019 2:22:27 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Violet Cully
Brunswick, Victoria, 3056, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Violet Cully via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Violet provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Violet Cully at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cumming, Bob – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 19:07:49
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Bob Cumming
Sent 28/05/2019 7:07:49 PM

I am concerned about Origin Energy's proposed fracking exploration.

1. Our water resource is precious and should be kept clean, clear and free of chemicals.

2. fracking processes uses dangerous chemicals, hazardous to the health of humans and other
animals. I understand that they propose to store millions of litres of water poisoned with
fracking chemicals in open ponds. This conflicts with recommendations of the NT inquiry
which recommended the use of closed tanks only.

3. This exploration is objected to by the traditional owners of these lands, custodians who
have maintained their land and water in a clean and pure manner for thousands of years.

4. Quite apart from the pollution and potential water pollution of the fracking process itself,
burning of 200 trillion cubic feet of gas (estimate of NT gas 'resource' by the Australian
Petroleum Production and Exploration Association), would be like 50 power stations
operating for thirty years. This is not compatible with the plans and goals of Australia and the
world in relation to preventing catastrophic global warming - keeping warming to not more
than 1.5 degrees. It is governments and not energy companies who pick up the tab for our
increasingly frequent extreme weather events!

5. Carbon sequestration is a costly challenge. Leaving shale oil in the ground is a safe method
of long term storage deep in the ground in a safe manner.

For these reasons, I urge you not to approve Origin's environmental management plan for
their proposed oil drilling.

Regards,

Bob Cumming
*************

Bob Cumming
*************
VIC 3058
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Cumming, Miriam – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 23:30:41
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Miriam Cumming
Sent 25/05/2019 11:30:41 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Miriam Cumming
Lilyfield, New South Wales, 2040, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Miriam Cumming via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Miriam provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Miriam Cumming at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cummings, Percy – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 12:44:35
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Percy Cummings
Sent 29/05/2019 12:44:35 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Percy Cummings
Narrandera, New South Wales, 2700, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Percy Cummings via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Percy provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Percy Cummings at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cummins, Haydee – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 15:18:37
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Haydee Cummins
Sent 29/05/2019 3:18:37 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Haydee Cummins
Graceville, Queensland, 4075, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Haydee Cummins via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Haydee provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Haydee Cummins at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cummins, Heather – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 21:55:09
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Heather Cummins
Sent 23/05/2019 9:55:09 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf

Page 1079 of 1136



Yours sincerely,
Heather Cummins

___________________________
This email was sent by Heather Cummins via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Heather provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Heather Cummins at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cummins, Heather – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 16:03:49
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Heather Cummins
Sent 29/05/2019 4:03:49 PM

I object strongly to Origin's plan to start fracking in the Northern Territory. It is beyond belief
that this proposal is even being considered with all of the information we have available to us
about an impending climate catastrophe should we not RADICALLY alter our course.

I understand that Origin's exploration well has the potential to lead to hundreds of Origin's
shale gas wells in full production phase, which could mean over 6000 gas wells. I also
understand there are over 200 trillion cubic feet of gas in the Northern Territory, which is the
equivalent to 50 power stations operating for thirty years. We simply cannot afford such a
climate disaster. The fracking processes uses dangerous chemicals that represent a threat to
human health, the natural environment and water sources.

I am concerned that many of the chemicals Origin plans to store and use on site do not have
available health data. These chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in
the fracking processes. The health and environmental risks of the dangerous chemicals used in
the fracking processes are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks.

I further understand that Origin is proposing using open tanks to store liquids that flow back
after the fracking process, which will be millions of litres. This is in spite of the fact that the
Northern Territory fracking inquiry recommended that all polluted water from the fracking
process be stored in closed tanks to minimise risks to human life and the natural environment.

Furthermore, has it been established that the Traditional Owners have been able to provide
free, prior and informed consent to the fracking process?
The Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory stated that,
'Aboriginal people from regional communities who made submissions to the Panel almost
universally expressed deep concern about, and strong opposition to, the development of any
onshore shale gas industry on their country.' This included communities in the Beetaloo basin
where this exploration well will be located. A report from the Jumbunna Institute at UTS, 5
has questioned whether communities have been provided adequate information about the
fracking processes, leading to the conclusion that 'based on a review of publicly available
information, the report finds that most – if not all – exploration permits issued in the Northern
Territory for unconventional gas were issued in the absence of free, prior and informed
consent'. In this context it is not appropriate to proceed with the current exploration permit
without further consultation.

The future of humanity and much of the living world is at stake and yet our governments have
the capacity to permit such projects?

Please change the course of history for the better with your decisions on this matter.

Yours sincerely, with hope,
Heather Cummins

Heather Cummins
*************
VIC 3450
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Cunning, C – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 10:19:11
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From C Cunning
Sent 30/05/2019 10:19:11 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Regarding: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the
Kyalla Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for considering a member of the public's opinion.

I am writing to voice my concerns and objections to the planned fracking for gases in the
Northern Territory.

I don't have to link articles explaining the ecological impacts this will have. It is your job to
know these things.

I am writing to attempt to connect with the small shred of compassion you may have left.

You know this will be devastating on so many levels. I can only assume you worked your
way into this department to make a difference for the better.
If you just happened to land here for the better pay package, may I suggest a new line of work
so someone who DOES care can do this work?

Please do right by the environment; submit the many objecting proposals and don't let them
be looked over.

___________________________
This email was sent by C Cunning via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact you
regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we have
set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************, however
C provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to C Cunning at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cunningham, Andrew – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 10:07:30
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Andrew Cunningham
Sent 29/05/2019 10:07:30 AM

I object to this project and demand it does not go ahead.

Andrew Cunningham
*************
NSW 2026
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Cunningham, Sue – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 16:01:46
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Sue Cunningham
Sent 28/05/2019 4:01:46 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin Energy’s plans for drilling and
hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object to the approval of this EMP
for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf

Page 1086 of 1136



Yours sincerely,
Sue Cunningham
Termeil, New South Wales, 2539, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Sue Cunningham via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Sue provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Sue Cunningham at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html

Page 1087 of 1136



Cunnington, Roger – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 12:32:00
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Roger Cunnington
Sent 24/05/2019 12:32:00 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Roger Cunnington
Albany, Western Australia, 6330, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Roger Cunnington via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Roger provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Roger Cunnington at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cunnington, Roger – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 13:32:10
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Roger Cunnington
Sent 29/05/2019 1:32:10 PM

Fracking in the NT should be allowed to go ahead. It is a threat to our safe climate future. The
fracking processes uses dangerous chemicals that represent a threat to human health, the
natural environment and water sources. The health and environmental risks of the dangerous
chemicals used in the fracking processes will be exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks.
There are serious concerns as to whether Traditional Owners have been able to provide free,
prior and informed consent to the fracking process. Allowing fracking will make a few people
benefit at the expence of the health and well being of all of us, in particular future generations
and endanger wild animal and plant life.
My postcode is 6330.

Roger Cunnington
*************
WA 6330
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Cunnnington, Marilyn – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 21:07:04
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Marilyn Cunnnington
Sent 23/05/2019 9:07:04 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.

Page 1091 of 1136



4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Marilyn cunnnington
Blairgowrie, Victoria, 3942, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Marilyn cunnnington via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Marilyn provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Marilyn cunnnington at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Curcio, Danielle – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 13:57:05
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Danielle Curcio
Sent 30/05/2019 1:57:05 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Danielle Curcio
Waramanga, Australian Capital Territory, 2611, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Danielle Curcio via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Danielle provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Danielle Curcio at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html

Page 1096 of 1136



Curi, Patrizia – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 12:02:03
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Patrizia Curi
Sent 28/05/2019 12:02:03 PM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

___________________________
This email was sent by Patrizia curi via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Patrizia provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Patrizia curi at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Currie, Alison – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 20:46:52
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Alison Currie
Sent 29/05/2019 8:46:52 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
alison currie
Devon Park, South Australia, 5008, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by alison currie via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however alison provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to alison currie at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Currie, Eve – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 18:42:17
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Eve Currie
Sent 29/05/2019 6:42:17 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

I sincerely hope you read and take action on the submissions you have received. The
communities impacted are not communities that you will live in and the impacts that you have
on these communities will not directly impact you. However what you are doing impacts
people, hundreds of fellow human being who will suffer because of your actions. Why should
any one humans live be valued more than another and why do you believe that you have the
right to inflict pain and suffering on other people. It’s not what this country is about. Please
listen to those impacted by your decision and I beg of you, chose to value humanity and our
environment. There’s little hope for the future of our country if you don’t.

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
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Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.

4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

Page 1103 of 1136



[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf

Yours sincerely,
Eve Currie
Eglinton, New South Wales, 2795, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Eve Currie via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact you
regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we have
set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************, however
Eve provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Eve Currie at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Curry, Ann – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 01:03:26
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Ann Curry
Sent 29/05/2019 1:03:26 AM

Ripping off the Aboriginals again!
Hands off ancestral land.
Hands off the environment.
Hands off Australia’s future

Ann Curry
*************
VIC 3094

Page 1105 of 1136



Curry, Graeme – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 14:30:22
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Graeme Curry
Sent 29/05/2019 2:30:22 PM

Do not frack in the Northern Territory.
It is destructive of our delicate environment and does not look to the future of our children
and grandchildren.

Graeme Curry
*************
NSW 2011
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Curry, Sally – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 10:54:12
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Sally Curry
Sent 29/05/2019 10:54:12 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin Energy’s plans for drilling and
hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object to the approval of this EMP
for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf

Page 1108 of 1136



Yours sincerely,
Sally Curry

___________________________
This email was sent by Sally Curry via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Sally provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Sally Curry at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cursaro, Wayne – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 00:41:51
Subject wandjcursaro@hotmail.com
From Wayne Cursaro
Sent 29/05/2019 12:41:51 AM

Everybody knows fracking is unsafe, polluting, land-destroying, water poisoning, and
destructive of the natural environment. You know this should never be approved. Represent
the interests of Australian people - not big corporations, - and get rid of this filth. Just google
"Fracking documentary" - (there are plenty) - and see what's involved, then do the right
thing.History and unborn generations will be your judge.

Wayne Cursaro
*************
SA 5162
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Curtis, Brendan – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 11:58:51
Subject Objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Brendan Curtis
Sent 24/05/2019 11:58:51 AM

Dear Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE POISON

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known health impacts. An independent review of the substances
shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage, burns, and
cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks, Origin are
planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only could this kill birds, but
extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This is unacceptable.

BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS
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This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. Origin must be made to stop all flaring
on total fire ban days.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Brendan Curtis

___________________________
This email was sent by Brendan Curtis via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Brendan provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Brendan Curtis at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Curtis, Dale – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 18:20:10
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Dale Curtis
Sent 23/05/2019 6:20:10 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Dale Curtis
Armidale, New South Wales, 2350, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Dale Curtis via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Dale provided an email address (*************) which we included in the REPLY-
TO field.

Please reply to Dale Curtis at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Curtis, Dale – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 20:42:12
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Dale Curtis
Sent 28/05/2019 8:42:12 PM

I object to the fracking project put forward by Origin Energy and don't believe it should go
ahead.
This project is a threat to our safe climate future.
Origin's exploration well has the potential to lead to hundreds of Origin's shale gas wells in
full production phase, and to the further development of Northern Territory's unconventional
gas industry, which NT government sources have said could mean over 6000 gas wells. The
gas industries' peak body, the Australian Petroleum Production and Exploration Association,
has said there are over 200 trillion cubic feet of gas in the Northern Territory, which is the
equivalent to 50 power stations operating for thirty years. We simply cannot afford such a
climate disaster.
The fracking processes uses dangerous chemicals that represent a threat to human health, the
natural environment and water sources.
Origin have provided a list of chemicals that will be stored and used on the site of their
exploration well. Many of these chemicals do not have available health data. These chemicals
must be adequately health tested before being used in the fracking processes.
The health and environmental risks of the dangerous chemicals used in the fracking processes
are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks.
Origin is proposing using open tanks to store liquids that flow back after the fracking process,
which will be millions of litres. This is in spite of the fact that the Northern Territory fracking
inquiry recommended that all polluted water from the fracking process be stored in closed
tanks to minimise risks to human life and the natural environment.
There are serious concerns as to whether Traditional Owners have been able to provide free,
prior and informed consent to the fracking process.
The Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory stated that,
'Aboriginal people from regional communities who made submissions to the Panel almost
universally expressed deep concern about, and strong opposition to, the development of any
onshore shale gas industry on their country.' This included communities in the Beetaloo basin
where this exploration well will be located. A report from the Jumbunna Institute at UTS, 5
has questioned whether communities have been provided adequate information about the
fracking processes, leading to the conclusion that 'based on a review of publicly available
information, the report finds that most – if not all – exploration permits issued in the Northern
Territory for unconventional gas were issued in the absence of free, prior and informed
consent'. In this context it is not appropriate to proceed with the current exploration permit
without further consultation.

Dale Curtis
*************
NSW 2350
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Curtis, Eloise – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 15:52:49
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Eloise Curtis
Sent 29/05/2019 3:52:49 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Eloise Curtis
Semaphore, South Australia, 5019, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Eloise Curtis via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Eloise provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Eloise Curtis at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Curtis, Jackie – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 21:59:02
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Jackie Curtis
Sent 29/05/2019 9:59:02 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Jackie Curtis

___________________________
This email was sent by Jackie Curtis via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Jackie provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Jackie Curtis at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Curtis, Jackie – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 09:50:23
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Jackie Curtis
Sent 30/05/2019 9:50:23 AM

I strongly object to this project and don't believe it should go ahead. This project is a threat to
our safe climate future.

The fracking processes uses dangerous chemicals that represent a threat to human health, the
natural environment and water sources.
The health and environmental risks of the dangerous chemicals used in the fracking processes
are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks.
There are serious concerns as to whether Traditional Owners have been able to provide free,
prior and informed consent to the fracking process. In this context it is not appropriate to
proceed with the current exploration permit without further consultation.

I live in WA [postcode 6157] and I strongly object to fracking in the NorthernTerritory, and
anywhere in Australia.

Jackie Curtis
*************
WA 6157
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Curtis, Kasadevi – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 06:24:50
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Kasadevi Curtis
Sent 30/05/2019 6:24:50 AM

i object to this project and don't think it should go ahead. It is a climate disaster and the
chemicals used are a threat to human health, the natural environment and water sources. This
risk is exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks despite recommendations that any
polluted waters should be stored in closed containers. The indigenous communities do not
want this to go ahead and neither does the rest of this country!!

Kasadevi Curtis
*************
NSW 2480
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Curtis-Flynn, Bev – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 08:36:24
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Bev Curtis-Flynn
Sent 25/05/2019 8:36:24 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Bev Curtis-Flynn
Bellbowrie, Queensland, 4070, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Bev Curtis-Flynn via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Bev provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Bev Curtis-Flynn at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Curtis-Flynn, Bev – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 05:57:23
Subject Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan for the Kyalla Drilling

and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2
From Bev Curtis-Flynn
Sent 29/05/2019 5:57:23 AM

Write your submission here - use our talking points to the left to guide your submission.

Bev Curtis-Flynn
*************
QLD 4070
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Curyer, Phoebe – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 12:14:59
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Phoebe Curyer
Sent 29/05/2019 12:14:59 PM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.
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4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml

[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf
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Yours sincerely,
Phoebe Curyer
Stirling, South Australia, 5152, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Phoebe Curyer via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Phoebe provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Phoebe Curyer at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cusack, Anna – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 14:29:24
Subject My objection to Origin’s Kyalla frack site in the NT
From Anna Cusack
Sent 28/05/2019 2:29:24 PM

ATT: Onshore Gas division,

I am writing to express my objection to the Environmental Management Plan submitted by
Origin Energy for the Kyalla frack site in the Northern Territory.

My key concerns with this plan are outlined below.

FRACKING SUBSTANCES ARE UNSAFE AND POISONOUS

The fracking chemicals Origin plans to use are harmful to health. The list of substances
Origin want to use have known negative health impacts. An independent review of the
substances shows they are linked to: acute toxicity, respiratory irritation, tissue damage,
burns, and cancer. Some are very toxic to aquatic life with long lasting effects.

Plus there are ‘trade name’ fracking chemicals that do not have any health data available.

OPEN AIR WASTEWATER TANKS POSE UNACCEPTABLE RISK TO THREATENED
WILDLIFE

It is unacceptable that Origin would use open air wastewater dams or ‘tanks’ to store the toxic
flowback fluid.

This flowback and drilling fluid is full of nasties including heavy metals, fracking chemicals
and naturally occurring radioactive materials.

Evaporation pits and open toxic tanks pose a risk to the incredible threatened birdlife that
visits the site, including the Gouldian Finch, and should not be open and accessible to birdlife
at any time.

WET SEASON RISKS WITH WASTE ON SITE

It is deeply concerning that instead of storing toxic wastewater in enclosed tanks as
recommended, Origin are planning open dams all through the wet and dry seasons. Not only
could this kill birds, but extreme weather events could cause downstream pollution impacts.

Origin’s site is upstream of Lake Woods, a place of international significance for biodiversity.
The catchment should be off limits to fracking.

TRANSPORT RISKS AND TOURISM IMPACTS

Origin says they care about cumulative impacts, but have failed to talk to tourism operators
about the risks of increased traffic on the Stuart Highway, or to people living downstream
from their fracking exploration activities.

Plus, Origin want to dump on Queensland and truck the toxic waste to an undetermined site.
Already Queensland has millions of tonnes of toxic salt waste that there is no permanent
disposal solution for. This additional load is unacceptable.
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BUSHFIRE RISKS AND TOTAL FIRE BAN DAYS

This area is sensitive to bushfires. Rural Fire Brigades have been calling for gas companies to
stop ignition sources and flaring on total fire ban days. If plans are to go ahead, Origin must
stop all flaring on total fire ban days for our regional safety.

Thank you for considering my concerns.

Yours sincerely,
Anna Cusack
Killingworth, New South Wales, 2278, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Anna Cusack via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to contact
you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC 3834 we
have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at *************,
however Anna provided an email address (*************) which we included in the
REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Anna Cusack at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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Cusbert, Cristine – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 11:20:25
Subject Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP)
From Cristine Cusbert
Sent 30/05/2019 11:20:25 AM

To whom it may concern at the Department of Environment and Natural Resources (DENR),

Re: Objection to Origin Energy’s Environmental Management Plan (EMP) for the Kyalla
Drilling and Hydraulic Fracturing 2019 Program EP117 N2

Thank you for the opportunity to make a submission regarding this issue.

I write this submission to ask the Department of Environment and Natural Resources to
outright reject Origin Energy’s EMP to protect the land, water, health and wellbeing of
impacted communities as well as our shared future from climate change.

I am particularly concerned about the dangers to water supply, community health and
exacerbation of climate change if fracking is continued.

As a member of the community, I am deeply concerned about the risks associated with Origin
Energy’s plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing in the Northern Territory. I strongly object
to the approval of this EMP for the following reasons:

1. Approval of this EMP will lead to irreversible climate change impacts for people of the
Northern Territory and beyond. The Northern Territory is already experiencing the impacts of
climate change, and is predicted to be one of the most severely impacted if emissions are not
rapidly reduced [1]. Remote Aboriginal communities across the NT feel this first and worst:
extreme heat waves, water shortages and more extreme flooding could force many Aboriginal
people to move off their country. Approving this EMP, one of nine exploration wells, would
signal the Beetaloo Basin as "open for business" to the expansion of the gas industry,
potentially leading to emissions 20 times Australia's total current annual emissions [2]. This
would pose a serious climate change threat to communities across the NT and beyond.

2. Storage of wastewater in open air tanks poses unacceptable risks and is incompatible with
the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory (Inquiry)
recommendation 7.12 that stated “enclosed tanks must be used to hold all wastewater.” [3]
Climate change means that seasons and weather patterns are changing, particularly across the
NT in relation to wet season (Oct 2018 to April 2019 was the driest wet season since 1992
and the hottest wet season on record) [4]. This means that there can be big storms out of
season, and having open tanks with fracking wastewater (at any time of the year) would put
drinking water, wildlife and health of community members and children at risk, including
communities up and downstream.

3. Origin Energy have failed to appropriately consult with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal
people and impacted communities. A report from the Jumbunna Institute for Indigenous
Education and Research (UTS) found that most, if not all, exploration permits issued in the
Northern Territory (including Origin Energy) for unconventional gas were issued in the
absence of Free, Prior and Informed Consent from Traditional Owners [5]. Furthermore, the
Inquiry found that Aboriginal communities overwhelmingly opposed fracking on their land.
The findings from the UTS report suggest reasons for concerns regarding all of Origin
Energy’s consultation practices, including consultation regarding this Environmental
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Management Plan with all Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate
cultural authorities for the areas impacted both directly and indirectly.

4. The use of dangerous chemicals poses huge risks to the environment, water and community
health and are exacerbated by the use of open storage tanks. There are some really concerning
chemicals that Origin Energy plans to use down well and store on-site over the dry and wet
seasons. This means that the chemicals will not only be used down the well in the high
pressure fracking process, but will also pose a risk at the surface when in open storage as
flowback fluid.

For these reasons, any plans for drilling and hydraulic fracturing, including exploration,
should not be allowed to go ahead under any circumstances.

Below are a list of my recommendations:

1. The DENR should take a precautionary approach to the cumulative climate impacts of this
exploration well - knowing the risk of the expansion of the gas industry in the Northern
Territory will have dangerous and irreversible impacts on our climate in a time when we need
to rapidly decarbonise the global economy and energy system.

2. All waste water should be held in enclosed tanks at all times.

3. We request that additional time, including a consultation period and process, is allowed for
Traditional Owners, Aboriginal communities and appropriate cultural authorities for the areas
directly and indirectly impacted by this EMP to consider this information and be given a fair
chance to ask questions and respond.

4. All chemicals must be adequately health tested before being used in any fracking processes.
They should also require companies to publicly disclose the identities and Chemical Abstracts
Service numbers of chemicals that are manufactured commercially, and identify oil and gas
wells in which the chemicals are used.

I write this submission in support of many Aboriginal communities across the Northern
Territory, primarily within the Beetaloo region, who are concerned about the potential
damages that fracking could cause to water, to country, to songlines as well as the long term
effects of climate change.

I wait with serious concern for your response to these matters.

[1] The Australia Institute ”Cooked with gas” 2018
http://www.tai.org.au/sites/default/files/P510%20Cooked%20with%20gas%20-
%20Darwin%20days%20over%2035C%20FINAL.pdf

[2] The Australia Institute ”NT gas compared to coal-fired power plants”
http://www.tai.org.au/content/nt-gas-compared-coal-fired-power-plants

[3] Final Report of the Scientific Inquiry into Hydraulic Fracturing in the Northern Territory
2018 https://frackinginquiry.nt.gov.au/inquiry-reports?a=494286

[4] Bureau of Meteorology “Seasonal Climate Summary for Northern Territory”
http://www.bom.gov.au/climate/current/season/nt/summary.shtml
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[5] Jumbunna Institute for Education and Research “Hydraulic Fracturing and Free, Prior and
Informed Consent in the Northern Territory: A Literature Review ”https://accr.org.au/wp-
content/uploads/Jumbunna-FPIC-review-final.pdf

Yours sincerely,
Cristine Cusbert
Annandale, New South Wales, 2038, Australia

___________________________
This email was sent by Cristine Cusbert via Do Gooder, a website that allows people to
contact you regarding issues they consider important. In accordance with web protocol FC
3834 we have set the FROM field of this email to our generic no-reply address at
*************, however Cristine provided an email address (*************) which we
included in the REPLY-TO field.

Please reply to Cristine Cusbert at *************.

To learn more about Do Gooder visit www.dogooder.co
To learn more about web protocol FC 3834 visit: www.rfc-base.org/rfc-3834.html
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	Crowley, Nick – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 14:55:36
	Croxford, Kimberley – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 14:55:35
	Croxon, Pauline – Sunday, 26 May 2019 – 04:51:06
	Croz, Michelle – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 16:22:12
	Cruz, Carmen – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 13:42:00
	Cruz, James – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 13:36:55
	Cruz, James – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 14:00:25
	Cruz, Marian – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 00:54:34
	Cryer, Brian – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 15:27:24
	Cucinotta, Juanita – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 11:00:20
	Cuinn, Emilie-Oraylia – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 19:23:35
	Cullen, Joelle – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 14:21:11
	Cullen, Sal – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 17:24:36
	Culley, Alexandra – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 05:21:33
	Cully, Moira – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 12:20:51
	Cully, Violet – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 14:22:27
	Cumming, Bob – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 19:07:49
	Cumming, Miriam – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 23:30:41
	Cummings, Percy – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 12:44:35
	Cummins, Haydee – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 15:18:37
	Cummins, Heather – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 21:55:09
	Cummins, Heather – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 16:03:49
	Cunning, C – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 10:19:11
	Cunningham, Andrew – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 10:07:30
	Cunningham, Sue – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 16:01:46
	Cunnington, Roger – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 12:32:00
	Cunnington, Roger – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 13:32:10
	Cunnnington, Marilyn – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 21:07:04
	Curcio, Danielle – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 13:57:05
	Curi, Patrizia – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 12:02:03
	Currie, Alison – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 20:46:52
	Currie, Eve – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 18:42:17
	Curry, Ann – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 01:03:26
	Curry, Graeme – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 14:30:22
	Curry, Sally – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 10:54:12
	Cursaro, Wayne – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 00:41:51
	Curtis, Brendan – Friday, 24 May 2019 – 11:58:51
	Curtis, Dale – Thursday, 23 May 2019 – 18:20:10
	Curtis, Dale – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 20:42:12
	Curtis, Eloise – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 15:52:49
	Curtis, Jackie – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 21:59:02
	Curtis, Jackie – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 09:50:23
	Curtis, Kasadevi – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 06:24:50
	Curtis-Flynn, Bev – Saturday, 25 May 2019 – 08:36:24
	Curtis-Flynn, Bev – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 05:57:23
	Curyer, Phoebe – Wednesday, 29 May 2019 – 12:14:59
	Cusack, Anna – Tuesday, 28 May 2019 – 14:29:24
	Cusbert, Cristine – Thursday, 30 May 2019 – 11:20:25

